
REPORT OF THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE 

ON 

THE KERALA STATE RICHT TO SERVICE BILL, 2012 

AND 

THE BILL AS REPORTED BY THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE 

. 

1048/2012. 



THE KERALA STATE RIGHT TO SERVICE BILL, 2012 

(Report of the Subject Committee) 

Subject Committee XIV—Home Affairs to which the Kerala State Right to 
Service Bill, 2012 was referred, considered the Bill clause by clause and now 
submits this report with the Bill as reported by the Committee annexed thereto. 

The Kerala State Right to Service Bill, 2012 was published as Gazette 
Extraordinary dated June 15, 2012. The Bill was introduced in the Assembly on 
July 23, 2012 and was referred to the Committee on the same day. 

The Committee considered the Bill clause by clause at its meeting held 
on July 23, 2012 and the Committee recommends to adopt the Bill without any 
modification. 

The Minutes of dissent is appended. 

OOMMEN CHANDY, 
Chairman, 

Sub/ect Committee XIV 

Ii 



MINUTES OF DISSENT 

We record the following minutes of dissent to the Kerala State Right to 
Service Bill, 2012: 

I. The failure on time bound delivery of basic needs of citizens like 
drinking water, food, accommodation, medical facilities, education, power, etc. 
tantamount to nulli& the programme/project. The benefit of Five Year Plan/ 
Annual Plan should not be failed to disseminate to the target group owing to 
failure either of the employees or of the Government. The Government should 
also ensure that only those programmes are launched for which provision is 
made in the budget and can be spent during the year. Hollow declarations 
should be avoided. The Government and the employees have complementary 
responsibility to implement the programmes/schemes and they should fulfill their 
responsibilities. There is no enabling provision in this Bill to ensure the said 
goal. 

This Bill is bestowing excessive powers to the executive for delegated 
legislation, rendering the Bill to the inoperative if the rule making process is 
delayed or omitted. That be so, time limits should have been prescribed for each 
item of such rule making. 

Many departments of the Government have already issued Citizen 
Charters prescribing time limits for the various services rendered by them. These 
Charters will be rendered ineffective if no protection clause is incorporated in 
this Bill. 

Long pendency of files before the Government Secretariat and various 

• other offices is a curse of our State. The best opportunity to address this 
problem is being left unavailed, by not incorporating adequate stipulations 
thereto in this Bill. 

KODIYERJ BALAKPJSIINAN, M.L.A. (Sd.) 

C. DIvAIC&iuN, M.L.A. 	(Sd.) 

MATHEW T. THos, M.L.A. 	(Sd.) 

K. SuREso KIJRUP, M.L.A. 	(Sd.) 



THE KERALA STATE RIGHT TO SERVICE BILL, 2012 

(As reported by the Subject Committee) 

A 

BILL 

to provide for the delivery of services to the general public within the 

stipulated time limit and for matters connected therewith and incidental 

thereto. 

Preamble.—WHEREA5, it is expedient to provide for the delivery of services 

49 	to the general public within the stipulated time limit 

BE it enacted in the Sixty-third Year of the Republic of India as follows 

I. Short title and commencement.—(l) This Act may be called the Kerala 
State Right to Service Act, 2012. 

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Government may, by 
notification in the Gazette, appoint. 

2. Definitions—In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires,- 

"designated officer" means an officer designated as such under 
section 3 for providing the services as per the provisions of this Act; 

"eligible person" means a person who is eligible for the services 
notified under section 3; 

"first appellate authority" means an officer notified as such under 
section 3 

"Government" means the Government of Kerala 

"prescribed" means prescribed by rules made under this Act; 

"right to service" means the right of an eligible person to obtain a 
service within the stipulated time limit 

"service" means any service to be provided under the provisions of, 
any law for the time being in force or as per Govemment orders issued from time 
to time, to the general public by or under any Department of the Government or 
by a Local Self Government Institution or by a State Public Sector Undertaking 
or by a Statutory Body, as may be notified under section 3; 



"second appellate authority" means an officer notified as such 
under section 3 

"stipulated time limit" means the maximum time limit notified 
under section 3 to provide the service by the designated officer or to dispose of an 
application for such service; 

3. Power to notij5' services, stipulated time limit, designated officer etc.-
Save as otherwise provided in any other law for the time being in force, every 
Department of the Government, every head of Department, every Local Self 
Government Institution and every statutory body shall within six months of the 
commencement of this Act, notif5' in the Gazette the services that will be rendered 
by each of them, the designated officers the first appellate authority and the 
second appellate authority and the stipulated time limit for the purposes of this 
Act. 

4. Right to obtain services—Every eligible person shall have the right to 
obtain the services notified under section 3 within the stipulated time limit. 

5. Duty of the designated offlcer.—(1) The designated officer shall on 
receipt of an application for service by an eligible person, without prejudice to the 
provisions of any law for the time being in force, provide the service or reject the 
application within the stipulated time limit. In case of rejection, he shall state the 
reasons for the same in writing and shall intimate it to the applicant forthwith. 

An application received under sub-section (1) shall be duly 
acknowledged by the designated officer or by the officer authorised by him to 
receive such application. 

The stipulated time limit shall start from the date on which the 
application is received. 

6. AppeaL —( 1) Any person, who does not receive the required service 
within the stipulated time or whose application is rejected under sub-section (1) of 
section 5, may file an appeal to the first appellate authority, within thirty days 
from the date of rejection of the application or on the expiry of the stipulated 
time limit, in such manner and on payment of such fee, as may be prescribed: 

Provided that the first appellate authority may admit the appeal after the 
expiry of the period of thirty days if the authority is satisfied that the appellant 
had sufficient cause for not filing the appeal in time. 

(2) The first appellate authority may direct the designated officer to 
provide the service within a specified period or may reject the appeal. 



An appeal under sub-section (1) shall be disposed of within a period 
equivalent to that of the stipulated time limit. 

Any person aggrieved by a decision of the first appellate authority 
may prefer an appeal to the second appellate authority within sixty days from 
the date of decision of the first appellate authority, in such manner and on 
payment of such fee, as may be prescribed 

Provided that the second appellate authority may admit the appeal after the 
expiry of the period of sixty days if that authority is satisfied that the appellant 
had sufficient cause for not filing the appeal in time. 

The second appellate authority may direct the designated officer 

49 	
to provide the service within a specified period or he may reject the appeal. 

Where the second appellate authority finds that there is no sufficient 
reason for not giving the service within the stipulated time limit he may, along 
with the direction to provide the service, impose penalty as provided in section 8. 

An appeal under sub-section (4) shall be disposed of within a period 
equivalent to that of the stipulated time limit. 

Where the designated officer does not comply with the direction 
given by the first appellate authority under sub-section (2) of this section, the 
person aggrieved by such non-compliance may file an application directly to the 
second appellate authority and such an application shall be disposed of in the same 
manner in which a second appeal is to be disposed of under this Act. 

Where the designated officer does not comply with the direction for 
providing the service under sub-section (5) of this section, then the person 
aggrieved by such non-compliance may file an application directly to the second 
appellate authority and such an application shall be disposed of in the same 
manner in which a second appeal is to be disposed of under this Act. 

7. Procedure to be followed in appeaL—The first appellate authority and 
the second appeLlate authority, while deciding an appeal under this Act, shall have 
the same powers as are vested in a civil court while trying a suit under the Code 
of Civil Procedure, 1908 (Central Act 5 of 1908) in respect of the following 
matters, namely 

requiring the production and inspection of documents 

issuing summons for hearing the designated officer and the 
appellant; and 

any other matter which may be prescribed. 

1048/2012. 



El 

8. Penalty.—(1) Where the second appellate authority finds that,- 

the designated officer has failed to provide the service without 
sufficient and reasonable cause, the second appellate authority may by an order in 
writing, stating the reasons, impose a fine on the designated officer which shall 
not be less than five hundred rupees and not more than five thousand rupees; 

the designated officer has caused delay in providing the service, the 
second appellate authority may, by an order in writing, stating the reasons, impose 
a fine on the designated officer, at the rate of two hundred and fifty rupees per 
day for each day's delay the sum of which shall not exceed five thousand rupees: 

Provided that the designated officer shall be given a reasonable opportunity 
of being heard before imposing such penalty. 

Where the second appellate authority finds that the first appellate 	0 
authority has failed to decide the appeal within the time limit specified in 
sub-section (3) of section 6 without sufficient and reasonable cause, he may by an 
order in writing, stating the reasons, impose a penalty on the first appellate 
authority which shall not be less than five hundred rupees and not more than five 
thousand rupees 

Provided that the first appellate authority shall be given a reasonable 
opportunity of being heard before imposing such penalty. 

The second appellate authority may, if he is satisfied that the 
designated officer or the first appellate authority has without sufficient cause, 
failed to discharge the duties assigned to him under this Act recommend 
disciplinary action against him under the service rules applicable to him. 

9. Protection of action taken in good faith—No suit, prosecution or other 
legal proceeding shall lie against any person or officer for anything which is in 
good faith done or intended to be done under this Act or any rule made 
thereunder. 

10. Bar of jurisdiction of Civil Courts—No civil court shall entertain any 
suit, application or other proceeding in respect of any order issued under this Act 
and no such order shall be called in question otherwise than by way of an appeal 
under this Act. 

11. Power to make rules—(l) The Government may, by notification in the 
Gazette, make rules to carry out the provisions of this Act. 

(2) Every rule made under this Act shall be laid, as soon as may be 
after it is made, before the Legislative Assembly while it is in session for a total 
period of fourteen days which may be comprised in one session or in two 
successive sessions, and if, before the expiry of the session in which it is so laid 



5 

or the session immediately following, the Legislative Assembly makes any 

modification in the rule or decides that the rule should not be made, the rule 
shall thereafter have effect only in such modified form or be of no effect, as the 
case may be; so however that any such modification or annulment shall be 
without prejudice to the validity of anything previously done under that rule. 

12. Power to remove d(fficulties.—(l) Where any difficulty arises giving 
effect to the provisions of this Act, the Government may, by order published in 
the Gazette, as occasion may require, do anything, which are considered necessary 
for them and not inconsistent with the provisions of this Act or the rules made 

thereunder, for the purpose of removing such difficulty: 

Provided that no such order shall be issued under this section after the expiry 
of two years from the date of commencement of this Act. 

(2) Every order issued under sub section (1) shall be laid before the 
Legislative Assembly as soon as may be after it is issued. 

Secretariat of the Kerala Legislature, 
Thiruvananthapuram, 	 P. K. MURALEEDIiARAN, 

23 July, 2012. 	 Secretary-in-charge. 

[1 



I 

4 

4- 

© 
Government of Kei-ala 

cnx8a@o3 
2013 

Regn. No. KERBIL/2012/45073 
dated 5-9-2012 with RNI 

Reg. No. w2l. mcn.uB 
KIJV(N)I634/201 2-14 

KERALA GAZETTE 
caøj thcrun6 

* 
7)  EXTRAORDINARY 

(m&r00w00,6mo 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 
u)1a,3c610,caor)1 LflJaU1W6JSTD)(maB 

25th November 2013 
Vol. II 	1 	THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 	2013 mniomiS 25 	No. 

o 2 	
MONDAY 	 3300 

4th Agrahayana 1935 	mcnn8 J oJoeJ  
0)1(02aimcImnJø0, asflaoZ 	1935 nm1wroomo 4 

GOVERNMENT OF KERALA 

Power (C) Department 

NOTIFICATION 

G. 0. (P) No. 48/2013/PD. 	 Dated, Thinivananthapurarn, 16th Noven,be, 2013. 

S. It 0. No. 922/2013.—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Kerala State 

Right to Service Act, 2012 (18 of 2012), the Government of Kerala have notified the services, 
' rendered to the public, stipulated time limit, designated officer, first appellate authority and second 

appellate authority in the Department of Electrical Inspectorate, Kerala State Electricity Board and 
the Energy Management Centre, vide notification issued under U 0. (P) No. 14/2013/PD, dated 

4th April, 2013 and published as S. R. 0. No. 281/2013 in the Kerala Gazette Extraordinary 
No. 990 dated 4th April, 2013. Now, the Government of Kerala hereby make the following 

• amendment to the said notification in respect of the details of the designated officers, 

first appellate authority and second appellate authority and documents to be attached with 
application in respect of the Department of Electrical Inspectorate, specified in the Schedule, namely:- 

AMENDMENT 

In the Schedule to the said notification for the heading "I DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRICAL 
INSPECTORATE" and the entries under it the following heading and entries shall be substituted, 

namely:- 

33/5441/201310TP. 

-I. 	 - 

/ 



-I 

SCHEDULE 

NAME OF DEPARTMENT DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRJCAL INSPECTORATE 

A : HEAD OFFICE OF DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRICAL INSPECTORATE 

No. Category of Services 

- 	 - 

Documents to be attached with application Working Designated First 
Appellate 

Second 
Appellate Days Officer 

Authority Authority 
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) 
1. Scrutiny, Approval and Inspection of 

Electrical Installations 

(i) Electrical Scheme Approval A covering letter. 

Authorisation 	Letter 	from 	the 	client 
authorising the 	Electrical contractor to carry 
out the work, 	giving brief particulars of the 
scheme. 

Electrical Schematic drawings. 
I-. 

2 
Copy of the Electrical Contractors Licence. 

V 
0. 

(i) a: 	Issue of Non conformity report Original chalan receipt for the remittance of 20 - 
' 

2 
U a o U the Scrutiny Fee remitted in a Government 

Treasury/Friends under the head of account : Q. 
0 - 

0043-00-102. - 

(1) 	Certificate of Soil Resistivity (Required for 
C.- 

0 

HT/EHT Installations). o 

(g) 	Fault Level Calculation (Required for HT/ 
0 

I 
EHT Installations) o  

(Ii) 	Earthing Calculation (Required for HT/EHT 
Installations). 

(i) b : Issue of Approval of Electrical (i) 	Bus Duct design (Required for Transformer 
Scheme if no non conformity and Generator of rating > .630 KVA). 

(J) 	A/C Calculation (Required only for Centralized 
AC Installations). 

(k) 	Pro forma and Checklist (available at 
Web site : www.ceikerala.gov.in ). 

- 	--- 	--- - 	----- --------- - -- 	- 	- 	 -. 

N) 



1. 

S 
	

. 

(i) 	c 	Issue of Approval of Electrical Compliance Report after rectifying defects. 	- 15 
Scheme in the case of (i) a, above 

(ii) Issue of Safety Certificate and 
Sanction for Energisation.  

(ii) a 	Issue of Non conformity report Completion report of work - 
after the inspection 

(ii) b 	Issue of Safety Certificate and Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the Initial 
Sanction for Energisation if no inspection Fee remitted in a Government Treasury/ 10 

non conformity. Friends under the head of account 	0043-00-102. 

(ii) c : Issue of Safety Certificate and Compliance Report after rectifying defects 
Sanction for Energisation in the £ 
case of (ii)a, 	above. .. 

2 

(iii) 	Inspection and issue of Valuation Request for Valuation 	. 
Certificate for Electrical Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the Initial 30 a 
installations, inspection Fee 	remitted in a Government Treasury/ 

Friends under the head of account 	0043-00-102 5 

o LU 
2. Cinema Operator 

- 

(i) 	Issue of Fresh Licence of Cinema Request Letter 
LU  

i 
Operator Original Hall Tickets of Cinema Operator Written 

Examination and Practical Examination 

- 	(c) 	True copy of certificate duly attested by a Gazetted - 
- Officer to prove Date of birth 

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the fee, 
250, remitted in a Government Treasury/Friends 

• under the head of account - "0043-00-800-98". 

Two passport size photographs attested by a 20 

Gazetted Officer 

(1) 	(on the back side, stating that 	this is the true 
photograph of ShriJSmt........................... 

- 	- (g) 	Two specimen signatures duly attested by a 
Gazetted Officer. 

Uj 



(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) 

(h) 	Self addressed and stamped envelope of size 
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth ! 32) 

(ii) 	Issue of licence in lieu of lapsed Duly filled Application form 	for Cinema 
Cinema Opt'rticr licence Operator Licence 

Original Lapsed Cinema Operator 	Licence 
Documents to be forwarded along with the 
application 
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of 
the fee**  Z 250 remitted in a Government Treasury 	

or in Friends under the head of 
account "0043-00-800-98". 20 
Two passport size photographs attested by 
a Gazetted Officer 

• 	
• (Q 	(on the back side, stating that this is the 

true photograph of Shri/Smt ............ ...)  
Two specimen signatures duly attested by 
a Gazetted Officer 

• Self addressed and stamped envelope of V 

size20cmx14crn(Stampsworth32).  
. (iii) Issue of duplicate Licence of Duly filled Application form for Duplicate 

Cinema Operator Cinema Operator Licence 
Original chalan receipt for the remittance 
of the fee** 	

! 100 for Licence or ! 100 
for certificate remitted in a Government 
Treasury or in Friends under the head of 
account "0043-00-800-99". 
Two passport size photographs attested by 
a Gazetted Officer 	• 20 
(on the back side, statihg that this is the 
true photograph of ShrilSmt.................. 
Two specimen signatures duly attested by 
a Gazetted Officer 

• 
(1) 	Self addressed and stamped envelope of 

size 20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth Z 32)  
.10  

VI 	 • 	 ,_.r-4z.,1 
k 



4. ' 	 qqw 
. 

ertification by the applicant of the loss 
or damage, mutilation or defacement of the 
original Licence attested by a Gazetted 
Officer. 
Copy of the prescribed notice 	published 
in the daily news paper approved by PRD. 
Certificate from the Electrical lnspector/ 
Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector, District 
office with details of renewal of permit 
and Permit Valid up to date 

3. Electrical Wireman 

(i) 	Issue of 	Electrical Wireman Duly filled Application form for Electrical 
Permit and Competency Wircman Pcrmit (Application form available 
Certificates under exempted at Website 	www.ceikerala.gov.in ) 
category True copy of certificates duly attested by 

a Gazetted Officer to prove Date of birth, 8 
Qualifications cc 

True copy of Trade Certificate should be . 
attested by a Gazetted Officer in the 
Department of Electrical lnspectorate - 
Original chalan receipt for the remittance 30 
of the fee, Z 1000 **, remitted in a . 	. 
Government Treasury/Friends under the 
head of account "0043-00-800-99". 
Two passport size photographs attested 
by a Gazetted Officer (on the back side, 6 
stating that this is the true photograph : 
of ShrilSmt ....................................... ) P 

(1) 	Two specimen signatures duly attested by 
a Gazetted Officer. 

(g) 	Self addressed and stamped envelope of 
size 20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth Z 32) 

(ii) 	Issue of Electrical Wireman Request letter 
pemiit and Competency Certificates Original Hall Tickets of Electrical 
for 	successful candidate in Wireman Written Examination 	and 
written and practical examination Practical Examination 

MA 



(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) 

True copy of certificate duly attested by a 
Gazetted Officer, to prove Date of birth 
Original chalan receipt for the remittance 
of the fee, 	500*1,  remitted in a 
Government Treasury/Friends under the head 
of account "0043-00-800-99" 
Two passport size photographs attested by a 40 
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating 
that this is the true photograph of 
Shri/Smt .............. ) 

(1) 	Two specimen signatures, duly attested by 
a Gazetted Officer. 

(g) 	Self addressed and stamped envelope of 
size 20 cmx 14cm(StampsworthRs. 32)  

(iii) 	Issue of Electrical Wireman Duly filled Application form for Electrical 
Permit in lieu of lapsed Permit Wireman Permit (Application form available $ . 

from Web site : ceikerala.gov.in  ) 
T 

Original Lapsed Electrical Wireman Permit 
Original chalan receipt for the remittance 
of the fee** 	Z 700 remitted in a o 
Government Treasury or in Friends under . U 

Zi 
- 

the head of account "0043-00-800-99". a 
-C 
U 

Two passport size photographs attested by a 15 
Gazetted Offlcer (on the back side, stating that 
this is the true photograph of Shri/Smt ....... ) 
Two specimen signatures duly attested by a 
Gazetted Officer. 

( 	Self addressed and stamped envelope of size 
20cmx 14cm(Stampsworth32)  

(iv) 	Issue of Duplicate Electrical Duly filled Application form for Duplicate 
Wireman Electrical Wireman permit 

Original chálan receipt for the remittance of 	, 

he fee**  7 300 remitted in a Government 
Treasury or in Friends under the head of 
account "0043-00-800--99". 	. 

40 

a. 

1-3 



r 

Two passport 	size photographs attested by 
- a Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating 

that 	this is 	the true 	photograph 	of 
ShrilSmt ........................ 

) 

Two specimen 	signatures 	duly attested 	by 
a Gazetted Officer 

Self addressed and stamped envelope of 
size 20 cm x 14 cm 

( 
Stamps worth ! 32) 15 

(0 	Certification by the applicant of the loss 
or damage, mutilation or defacement of the 
original 	permit attested by a Gazetted Officer. 
Copy of the 	prescribed notice published in 
the daily news paper approved by PRO 

Certificate from the Electrical Inspector/ cc 
Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector, District  
office with details of renewal of licence - 

4. 
°-- 

0 Electrical Supervisor— B Grade 
Issue 	of Electrical 	Supervisor— Request letter . . 

B Grade Permit and Competency The original chalan Receipt of remittance 
Certificates 	under 	exempted in a 	Govt. Treasury/Janasevanakendram for 
category Z 1000 (Head of Account 

, 

0043-00-800-99) 
Two Copies 	of Passport size 	Photograph. 20 U 

U 
- 

(Attested by a Gazetted Officer only on 	the 
backside of the photo) 

Two signatures of the applicant. (Attested by a 
Gazetted Officer) 

Self Addressed Stamped envelop for Z 32 
Envelope of size 20 cm x 14 cm 

(ii) 	Issue of Electrical 	Supervisor— (0 	Request letter 
B Grade permit and Competency Original Hall Tickets of Electrical Supervisor 
Certificates for successfUl candidate Written Examination and Practical Examination 
in written and practical examination Tme copy of certificate 	duly 	attested by a 

Gazetted Officer to prove Date of birth 
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of 
the fee, T 1000 	*, remitted in a Government 
Treasury/Friends under the head of account 

0043-00-800-99" 

-.4 



(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) 

0) 	Two passport size photographs attested by a 
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that 20 
this is the true photograph of Shri/Smt........... 

(k) 	Two specimen signatures duly attested by a 
Gazetted Officer 

(I) 	Self addressed and stamped envelolie of size 
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth Z 32) 
Original Electrical Wireman permit, Competency 
Certificate 
Original Electrical Contractor C Class Licence 

 
(iii) 	Renewal of Electrical Supervisor— Duly filled Application form for Renewal of 

B Grade Permit Electrical Supervisor . 

Original Electrical Supervisor Permit 
Documents to be forwarded along with the . 

application 	 - 

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 20 9 . S feets500+(Latefee:250)remittedina 
Goverhment Treasury or in Friends under the , 

head of account "0043-00-800-99". 
Self addressed and stamped envelope of size 
20cmx14cm(Stampsworth32) - 

t4 
o C) 

(iv) 	Issue of Electrical 	Supervisor— Duly filled Application form for Electrical 
B Grade Permit in lieu of lapsed Supervisor 
Permit. Original Lapsed Electrical Superisor Permit 

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 
fee t4 Z 1300 remitted in a Government 
Treasury or in Friends under the head of account 
"0043-00-800-99" 
Two passport size photographs attested by a 20 
Gazetted Officer(on the backside; 	stating that 
this is the true photograph of ShrilSmt........... 

• Two specimen signatures duly attested by a 
Gazetted Officer 
Self addressed and stamped envelope of size 

•20cmx14cm(Stampsworth32) .• • 

0 



(v) 	Issue of Duplicate Electrical Duly 	filled 	Application form 	for 	Duplicate 

Supervisor—B Grade Electrical Supervisor permit 
Original èhalan receipt for the remittance of the 
fee" 7 500 remitted in a Government Treasury 
or in Friends under the head of account 
"0043-00-800--99". 
Two passport size photographs attested by a 
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, 	stating that 
this is the true photograph of ShrilSmt............ 
Two 	specimen 	signatures 	duly 	attested 	by a 
Gazetted Officer. 
Self addressed 	and 	stamped 	envelope of size 20 

-t 
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth Z 32) 

(1) 	Certification by the applicant of the loss or damage, 
mutilation or defacement of the original permit 
attested by a Gazetted Officer. 3 

Copy of the prescribed notice 	published in the . 

daily news paper approved by PRD attested by a - 

Gazetted Officer. - 

Attested copy of Competency Certificate . 
t 

5 W W S Electrical Supervisor—A Grade 

Issue of Electrical Supervisor— Request letter .9 
0 

0 

A Grade permitand Competency The original Chalan Receipt 	of remittance in a 

Certificate under exempted categoq— Government Treasury/Janasevanakendram 	for 8 
after the approval of Kerala State ! 2000 	(Head of Account 	0043-00-800-99) 

Electricity Licensing Board Two 	Copies of 	Passport size 	Photograph. 

(Attested 	by a Gazetted 	Officer only on 	the 

backside of the photo) 
Two signatures of the applicant. (Attested by a 30 

Gazetted Officer) 
Self 	Addressed Stamped envelope for Z 32. 
Envelope of size 20 cm x 14 cm 

(ii) 	Renewal of Electrical Supervisor— Duly filled Application form for Renewal of Electrical 

A Grade Permit after renewal Supervisor 
Original Electrical Supervisor Permit 

- Documents 	to 	be 	forwirded 	along with 	the 
application 

331544112013/DTR 

'C 



(1) 
- 	 (2) (3) (4) (5). (6) (7) 

Original chalan receipt tor the remittance of the 20 
fe e** Rs.1,000 (Late fee 	500) 	remitted 
in a Govt Treasury or in Friends under the head 
of account" 0043-00--800-99". 
Self addressed and stamped envelope of size 
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth 7 32) 

(iii) 	Issue of Electrical Supervisor— Duly 	filled Application 	form 	for 	Electrical 
A Gtade Permit in lieu of lapsed Supervisor 
Permit Original Lapsed Electrical Supervisor Permit 

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 
fee** 

? 2,500 remitted in a Government Treasury 
or in Friends under the head of 	account 
"0043-00-800-99". 30 
Two 	passport size jhotographs attested by a 
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, staling that this 

 is the true photograph of Shri/Smt. ............... 
) 

- 

Two specimen signatuies duly attested by a Gazetted  .9 
Officet C- Ab 

(0 	Self addressed and stamped envelope of size ,.2 V .9 
o  

- 

20cmx14cm(Stampsworth732)  
do  (iv) 	Issue of Duplicate Electrical Duly 	filled Application form 	for 	Duplicate 

Supervisor—A Grade Permit. Electrical Supervisor permit - 

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 
• 	 . fee** Z 1,000 remitted fri a'Governrnent Treasury 

- 	 or in Friend sunder the head of account 
"0043-00-800-99". 
Two passport 	size photographs 	attested 	by, a 20 
Gaietted 	Officer (on the back side, stating that • . - 

this is the true photograph of Shri/Smt........... 
Two 	specimen signatures 	duly attested by a 
Gazetted Officer. 
Self addressed and stamped 	envelope of size 

' 
20cmx 14cm(Starnpsworth!32) 

. 

. 

0 

-p - 



(1) 	Certification 	by 	the applicant 	of the loss or 
damage, mutilation or defacement of the original 
permit attested by a Gazetted Officer. 

(g) 	Copy of the prescribed 	notice published in the 
daily news paper approved by PRD. 

6 Electrical Contractor—Class 'A' 

(i) 	Issue of Electrical Contractor— (a) 	Duly filled Application form for 	Electrical 
Class 'A' Fresh Licence after the Contractor Class A Licence 	(Application form 
approval of Kerala State Electricity available from Web site 	www.ceikerala.gov.in ) 

Licensing Board  
(b) 	Original 	chalan 	receipt for the remittance of 

the fee 	remitted 	in a Government Treasury 
or in Friends 	under 	the head of account 
"004-00-800-99". 0 0  

t 
V 
0. 

Original Test and 	Calibration 	Certificates 	of 
Instruments (validity does not exceed six months) . 

Verification Certificate of Tools (validity 	does . 	 . 

not exceed six months)  
Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor (attested by 30 
the officer from District Office of the Department o 
of Electhcal Inspectorate) j 

(1) 	Original Electrical 	WiremanlSupervisor permit . I 
(for the enrollment of Wireman/Supervisor) 

(g) 	Bank Guarantee for Z 10,000 	and t 25,000 
for HT and EHT installations respectively 
(for minimum period of 3 years) 

(h) 	Self addressed and staknped envelope of A4 size 
(Stamps worth T 80) 

(I) 	Two passport size 	photographs 	attested by a 
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that 
this is the true photograph of 	Shri/Smt......... 

(j) 	Two specimen signatures duly aueted by a 
Gazetted Officer. 



(1) (2) (3) j 	(4) (5) (6) (7) 

(k) 	Certificate of ownership/undertaking of workshop 
(fabricating unit)/Office 

(1) 	A List 	containing the data of the Electrical 
installation works undertakçn successfully and 
Hard Copies of the Letter of Approval of Electrical 
scheme 

(m) 	Approved drawings, Letter of 	Sanction for 
Energisation of installations 

(ii) Renewal—Electrical Contractor— Duly filled Application form for renewal of 
Class 'A' Licence Electrical Contractor Class A Licence 

Original 	Electrical 	Contractor Class A Licence 8 
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 
fee** Z 5,000 	remitted 	in 	a 	Government 
Treasury or in Friends under the head of account 
"0043-00---800---99" 

' C) 
0) 

Original Test/Calibration Certificates of Instruments 
- 

(validity does not exceed six months) • 
JG 

- 

Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does 
not exceed six months) 

(1) 	Declaration of WiremanlSupervisor (attested from 
District Officeof the Department of Electrical 20 
Inspectorate) 
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of z , 

the fee**  Z 200 remitted in a Government 
Treasury or in Friends under the head of account 
"0043-00-800-99" 	for the new enrollment of 
Wireman/Supervisor (**per  Wireman/Supervisor) 
Original Electrical Wireman/Supervisor permit 
(for the new enrollment of WiremanlSupervisor) 
Bank 	Guarantee 	for Z 10,000 and Z 25,000 
for HT and EHT installations respectively 

a) 	Self addressed and stamped envelope of A4 size 
(Stamps worth Z 80) 

(iii) 	Issue of licence in lieu of lapsed (a) 	Duly 	filled Application form 	for Electrical 
Electrical Contractor Class 'A' Contractor Class A Licence (Application form 
Licence available from Website 	www.ceikerala.gov.in ) 

t,) 

- 	 -- 



n 

(b) 	
Original 	Electrical 	Contractor Class 	A Licence 
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 
fee ** 

? 7,000 	remitted 	in 	a 	Government 
Treasury or in Friends under the head of account 
"0043-00-800-99". 
Original Test/Calibration Certificates of Instruments 
(validity does not exceed six months) 
Verification 	Certificate of Tools (validity does 20 
not exceed six months) 

(I) 	Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor (attested from 
District Office of 	the Department of Electrical 
Inspectorate) 
Bank Guarantee for ? 10,000 and ? 25,000 
for FIT and EHT installations respectively an 

Self addressed and 	stamped envelope of A4 size 00 

a 
(Stamps worth? 80) 

 
>, (iv) 	Issue of duplicate Electrical Duly 	filled 	Application form 	for the duplicate 

Contractor Class 'A' Licence Electrical Contractor Class A Licence ' 

Original 	chalan 	receipt 	for the remittance of 
the fee" ? 2,000 remitted in a Government  
Treasury or in Friends under the head of account 
"0043-00-800-99". 
Original Test and Calibration certificates of 
Instruments (validity does not exceed 6 months) . 

Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does 
not exceed six months) ct 
Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor (attested 	from 
District Office of the Department of 	Electrical 
Inspectorate) E2. 
Original chalan receipt 	for the remittance of the 
fee" ? 200 	remitted 	in a Government 
Treasury or in Friends under the head of account 
"0043-00-800---99" for 	the 	new enrollment 	of 
Wireman/Supervisor 
Original Electrical 	WiremanlSupervisor 	permit 30 
(for the new enrollment of Wireman/Supervisor) 

(h). 	Bank 	Guarantee for ? 10,000 and ! 25,000 
for HT and EHT installations respectively 

'S.) 



(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) 

(i) 	Self addressed and stamped envelope of size 
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth ! 62) 

0) 	Two 	passport 	size photographs attested by a 
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that 

• this is the true photograph of Shri/Smt........ 
(k) 	Two 	specimen 	signatures 	duly attested by a 

Gazetted Officer. 
(I) 	Certification 	by the 	applicant of the loss 	or 

damage, mutilation or defacement of the original 
permit attested by a Gazetted Officer. 

• (m) 	Copy of the prescribed notice published in the 
daily news paper approvedby PRD. - 

t 
7 Electrical Contractor—Class 'B' 

0 0 
a 

(i) 	Issue of Fresh Electrical Duly 	filled Application form, for 	Electrical I 79 
Contractor—Class 'B' Licence Contractor Class B LicencTe . a 

- Ongmal chalan receipt for the remittance of the  
fee** remitted in a Government Treasury or in 
Friends 	under 	the 	head 	of 	account 
"0043-00-800-99" .9 
Original Test 	and 	Calibration 	Certificates of • 

Ct) 

Instruments (validity does not exceed 6 months) - . 

Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does 
• 

• 	 not exceed six months) 	• 	 • 

Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor (attested by 
the officer 	from the Department of Electrical 
Inspectorate) 

• (0 	Original 	Electrical Wireman/Supervisor permit 20 
(for the enrollment of Wireman/Supervisor) 

' 	 Self addressed and stamped envelope of size 
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps iôrth! 62) 
Two passport size photographs 	attested by a 
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that 
this is the true photograph of ShrilSmt .......... ) 
Two specimen signatures duly attested by a 
Gazetted Officer 	 - 	 • • 

[1 

a 

-'V 



S 
r 
Li 

reports  
Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector regarding the 
facilities provided (for scope of all LV/MV 
installation up to 250 kW and generator up to 
250kVA in prescribed format is necessary.) 

H 

(ii) Renewal of Electrical Contractor— Duly filled Application 	form 	for 	renewal of 
Class 	B' Licence Electrical Contractor Class B Licence 

Original Electrical Contractor Class B Licence 

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 
fee 	! 2,000 (Late fee 	? 500) 	remitted 
in a Govt Treasury or in Friends under the head 
of account "0043-00-800-99". 

Original 	Test 	and 	Calibration 	certificates of 
Instruments (validity does 	not exceed 	6 months) 
Verification 	Certificate of Tools 	(validity does 
not exceed six months) 

(0 	Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor 	(attested by 25 
the officer from District Office of the Department $ 
of Electrical Inspectorate) 

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the U-)
Fi 

fee 	200 remitted in a Government 
Treasuiy or in Friends under the head of account 
"0043-00-800-99" for the new enrollment of -' 	 ' 
WiremanlSupervisor (per Wiremanlsupervisor) 

Original Electrical WiremanlSupervisor permit 
(for the new enrollment of WiremanlSupervisor) 

Self addressed and stamped envelope of A4 size 
(Stamps worth ! Sot) 

(iii) 	For the issue of I Electrical Duly 	filled Application 	form' for 	Electrical 
Contractor—Class 'B' Licence Contractor Class B 	Licence (Application form 
in lieu of lapsed Licence available from Website : ceikerala.gov.in) 

Original Electrical Contractor Class B Licence 

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 
fee** 7 3,500 	remitted 	in 	a 	Government 
TNathJIs under the head of account 



(3) (4) (5) (6) (7) 

Original Test and Calibration certificates of 
Instruments (validity does not exceed 6 months) 20 

Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does 
not exceed six months) 

(0 	Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor (attested by 
the officer from District Office of the Department 
of Electrical Inspectorate) 

(g) 	Self addressed and stamped envelope of A4 size 
(Stamps worth Z 80.)  

(iv) 	For the issue of duplicate Duly filled Application form for the duplicate 
Electrical Contractor Class 'B' Electrical Contractor Class B Licence 

a (Application form available from Website 
www.ceikerala.gov.in ) a 
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the I 
fee** Z 1,000 	remitted 	in 	a 	Government 
Treasury or in Friends uhder the head of account . 	 . tj 

0043-00-800-99". 
Original Test and Calibration certificates of 
Instruments (validity does not exceed six months) 
Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does 

U 

not exceed six months) 
Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor (attested from 20 : 

District Office of the Department of Electrical 
Inspectorate) 

(1) 	Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 
fee** Z 200 remitted in a Government Treasury 
or in Friends 	under the head 	of 	account 
"0043-00-800-99" for the new enrollment of 
Wireman/Supervisor 	41 

Original Electrical WiremanlSupervisor permit 
(for the new enrollment of Wireman/Supervisor) 
Bank 	Guarantee 	for Z 10,000 and Z 25,000 
for lIT and EHT instaqlations respectively 
Self addressed and stamped envelope of size 

...- 
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth t 62) 

-a 

- 



a 

- 

Two 	passport 	size photographs 	attested by a 

Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that 

this is the true photograph of Shri/Smt........... 

Two specimen signatures duly attested by a 

Gazetted Officer. 

(I) 	Certification 	by 	the 	applicant 	of the loss or 

damage, mutilation or defacement of the original 

permit attested by a Gazetted Officer. 

(m) 	Copy of the prescribed notice published in the 

daily news paper approved by PRD. 

t 

8 Electrical Contractor—Class 'C' 

(i) 	Issue of 	Fresh Electrical (Electrical ContractorClass C 	Licence issued on  

Contractor—Class 'C' licence the Report from Electrical Inspector/Deputy Chief a 
Electrical Inspector) 

v 0  
ft B 

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the  
, 

fee Z 800 	(fee for issue of Contractor Licence) : 

remitted in 	a Govt. Treasury or 	in 	Friends a 
C) - 

• (head of account "0043-00-800--99" W ' 

• Original 	Test:  certificates of Instruments ° 

Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does a 
not exceed six months) 20 . 
Self 	addressed and stamped envelope of size 

20cmx 14cm(Stampsworth762) 'C 
• 	 . Two passport size photographs attested by a 

Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that 

this is the true photograph of ShrilSmt........... 

Two specimen signatures 	duly 	attested by a 

Gazetted Officer 

(0 	Original Electrical Wireman Permit. 

(ii) 	Issue of Electrical Contractor Duly filled Application form for Electrical 

Class 'C' licence in lieu of Contractor Class C Licence (Application form' 

lapsed Licence available from Website 	ceikerala.gov.in) 

Original Electrical Contractor Class C Licence- 

3315441120130W. 

-.1 



(1) (2) (3). (4) (5) (6) (7) 

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 
feë** 	

! 700 remitted in a Government 15 
Treasury or in Friends under the head of account 

• "0043-00-800-99". 
Original 	Test 	and 	Calibration 	certificates 	of 

• 

- Instruments (validity does not exceed six months) 
Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does 
not exceed six months). 

(0 	Self addressed and stamped envelope of size 
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth Z 32) 

(g) 	Original Electrical Wirenian Permit. 

(iii) 	Issue of duplicate Electrical . (a) 	Duly 	filled Application form for the duplicate 
Contractor Class 'C' Licence Electrical Contractor Class C Licence 

Original .chalan receipt for the remittance of the . 

fee**! 809 remitted in a Government Treasury 
- . - or 	in 	Friends uxider the head of 	account 

"0043-00-800-99". a 
Original Test and Calibration certificates of E 
Instruments 	(validity does not exceed six months) , 

Verification 	Certificate of Tools 	(validity does 
not .exceed six months) c. 	o 

Self addressed 	and stamped envelope 	of size C) 

• 20cmx14cm(Stampsworth32)  
(0 	Certification 	by 	the 'applicant of the 	loss or 

damage, mutilation or defacement of the original ft 
permit attested by a Gazetted Officer. 
Copy of the prescribed notice published in the 15 
daily news paper approved by PRD attested by 
a Gazetted Officer. 	 . . 

Original 	Electrical . Wireman 	Permit 
Two 	passport size 	photographs 	attested 	by a 
Gazetted Officer 	(on the back side, stating that 
this is the true photograph of Shr /Smt................) 

) 	
Two 	specimen 	signatures 	duly 	attested by a 
Gazetted Oflicet 

• . 

(k) 	Certificate from the Electrical Inspector/Dy. Chief 
Electrical 	Jnspector, District 	office with details - - 

of renewal of licence 
w 

00 

C 



a 
9 Other services—Kerala State. 

Electricity Licensing Board 

(I) 	For the 	issue permit Request letter 

(under exempted category) after The original Chalan Receipt of remittance in a 

scope modification of 	Electrical Govt. TreasuryfJanasevanakendram for Z 500 
Supervisors Grade A and B for 	Electrical 	Supervisors Grade 	8, 	? 1,000 

for 	Electrical 	SupervisodGrade 8 	(Head of 
Account 	0043-00-800-99) 
Two Copies of Passport size Photograph. 30 
(Attested bya Gazetted Officer only on the 
backside of the photo) 
Two signatures of the ?.pplcant (Attested by a 
Gazetted Officer) 
Self Addressed Stamped envelop for Z 32 
Envelope of size 20cm x 14cm .  

(1) 	Original Permit and Competency Certificate. 

(ii) 	For Additional Staff enrolment 	. Request letter ' 

c 
under Electrical Contractor Declaration of WiremanlSupervisor (attested 	by . 

(Wireman/Supervisor) . the officer from District Office of the Department . .9 
of Eleetrical Inspectorate) 	 . 	 . 

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the Ct 

fee** Z 200 remitted in a Government Treasury 10 rn 0 

or 	in 	Friends under 	the 	head 	of 	account ' 
. 	 .2 

004-00400-99" for the new enrollment of . 	 .9 

Wireman/Supervisor (per Wireman/Supervisor) 
Orijinal Electrical WiremanlSupervisor 	permit 
(for the new enrollment of Wireman/Supervisor) . t 

Original Electrical COntrator Licence 
- 	 Cl) 

(iii) 	For the issue of recognitionl Duly tilled AppLication form for the recognition 
renewal of Institute for Electrical of 	Electrical 	Wireman/Electrical 	Supervisor 
Wireman and Electrical Supervisor conducting Institution 

Details of technical staff 
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 20 
fee" t 5,000 remitted in a 	Govt Treasury 	or 
in 	Friends 	under the head of account 

0043-00-800-99". 
Test certificates of instruments 

°Application Forms and Fee details are available in Department Website www.ceikerala.gty y.jn  

70 

'7 



NAME OF DEPARTMENT DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRICAL INSPECTORATE 

B. DISTRICT LEVEL OFFICES OF DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRIcAL INSPECTORATE 

Wo?*L??g Designated Fjirst Second 
No. Category of Services Documents to be attached with Application Days Officer Appellate Appellate 	I 

Authority Authority 

(1) (2) 	 .. (3) 	 . 	 -. (4) (5). 6) 

Scrutiny, Approval and Inspection of 
Electrical Installations 

(1) 	Electrical Scheme Approval (a 	. 	coering letter 
.€b 	Authe.ti.aation Letter from 	the client authorising 

the flectiical 	contractor to carry out the work, 
giving l,jief particulars of the scheme 
Electrical Schematic drawings 
Copy of the 	Electrical contractors 	Licence . 

Wa. Issue of Non conformity report Original chalan receipt fot the remittance of the 
Scrutiny Fee remitted in a Government Treasury! t 
Friends under the head of account 

 
"004300-102"  

- (0 	Certificate of Soil Resistivity (Required for HT/ 15 
EHT Installations) 	 . 

Fault Level Calculation (Required for HT/EHT  

Installations) 
 

00 0 

Earthing 	Calculation (Required for HT!EHT 
Installations) 	 . 

(i)b. Issue of Approval of Elctrical Bus Duct design (Required for Transformer and 
Scheme if no non conformity Generatorof rating > 630 kVA) 

A!C Calculation (Required only for Centralized 
AC Installations)  

• 	. (Ic) 	Pro forma and Checklist (available at Website 
www.ceikerala.gov.in ) 

(i)c. Issue of Approval of Electrical Compliance Report after rectifying defects, 10 
Scheme it, the case of (i) a, above  

U 	 40 

0 

4 



S 
2 (ii) 	Issue of Safety Certificate and 

Sanction for Energisation. 

(ii)a. 	Issue of Non conformity Report Completion report of work 
after the inspection Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 

Initial inspection Fee remitted in a Government 10 
(ii)b. 	Issue of Safety Certificate and Treasury/Friends under the head of account 

Sanction for Energisation if no "0043-00-102" 
non conformity 

(ii)c. 	Issue of Safety Certificate and Compliance Report after rectifying defects 
Sanction for Energisation in the 
case of (ii) a, 	above 

3 (iii) 	Inspection and issue of Valuation Request for Valuation 
Certificate for Electrical Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 30 
installations Initial inspection Fee remitted in a Government - 

Treasury/Friends under the head of account 
"0043-00-102" 1 

.s 
1 
S 4 Issue Certificate under Regulation 62 Request 	letter 

of CEA (MS&ES) Regulation 2010 Submission of Site plan 	of proposed 	building 
(with Plan and Elevation) Showing nearby Power 5 
lines and its clearance duly approved by the 
Supplier 15 

(c) 	Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the U g 
fee Z 1000 (Z 100 for SC/ST category or BPL) 0 
remitted in a Government Treasury or in Friends 
under the head of account 	"0043-00-102" 15 

5 Issue olSoil Resistivity Measurement Request letter for Soil resistivity measurement 
Certificate at the site of the proposed Electrical installation 

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 15 
fee Z 1000 remitted in a Governnent Treasury 
or in Friends under the head of account 
"0043-00-102" 

6 Issue of Safety Certificate for Request letter for Safety Certificate for Cable TV 
Cable TV Network Network 

Attested 	copy of Allocation 	order of 	electric 
poles for drawing Cable TV network from licensee 

t'-) 



(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) 

Map showing area of distribution of Cable TV 
and location of electric poles 15 
Attested 	copy 	of 	registration 	certificate 	for 
Department of post 

.(e) 	Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 
inspection 	fee (Z 5 per pole) 	remitted 	in 	a 
Government Treasury/Friends under the head of 
account: 	"0043-00-102" 

7 Inspection and issue of Valuation Request letter for Valuation 
Certificate for Electrical installations Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 

inspection fee remitted in a Government Treasury/ 30 
Friends under the head of account : JG "004300-102" - 

0 
8 *ElectrIcal  Wireman  a - 

Renewal of Electrical Wireman Permit Duly 	filled 	application 	form 	for renewal of 
Electrical Wireman Permit' - 

Original Electrical Wireman Permit C) 

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 7 
- fee 	300 	(5 	years) 	Z 500 	(10 .years)+ 

(Late fee : Z 200) 	remitted 	in 	a 	Government 
Treasury or in Friends under the head of account: U 
"0043-00-800-99" o 
Self addressed 	and 	stamped envelope of size 0 U 
20cm x 14cm_(Stamps_worth Z _32)  

9 Contractor—Class 'C' 

Renewal 	of Electrical Contractor— Duly 	filled 	application 	form 	for 	renewal of 
Class 'C' •  Licence Electrical Contractor Class C Licence 

Original Electrical Contractor Class C Licence 
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 

• fee** Z 500 	(Late fee : Z 200) 	remitted in 
a Government Treasury or in Friends under the 15 
headof account : "0043-00-800-99" 
Original Test 	and 	Calibration 	Certificates 	of 
Instruments (validity does not exceed 6 months) 
Verification Certificate of tools (validity does not 

• exceed six months) 

N) 
N) 



4 

C 

A 

(I) 	Self addressed and stamped envelope of size 
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth Z 32) 

(g) 	Attested Copy of Electrical Wireman Permit 

10 *Other  services—Kerala State - 

Electricity Licensing Board 

For Recommending the issue of Duly 	filled 	application 	form 	for 	Electrical 
C—Class Electrical Contractor after Contractor Class C Licence 
conducting interview 	to KSELB) Original chalan 	receipt for the remittance of the 

fee ! 400 remitted in a 	Government Treasury 
or in Friends (Head of account "0043-00-800-99") 
Copy of the Experience Certificate attested by a 7 

• Gazetted Officer 
Copy of Electrical Wireman Permit attested by a - 

• Gazetted Officer 2 
• Self addressed 	and stamped 	envelope of size 

10cmx24cm(Stampsworth!5) 
(Q 	Applicant is requested to appear an 	interview 

• P-C) 9 _________________ _____ 
II *cinema  Operator . 

Renewal—Cinema Operator Licence Duly filled 	applicatibri form 	for 	renewal 	of 
Cinema Operator Licence 
Original Cinema Operator 	Licence U 

- 

Documents 	to be forwarded 	along 	with the 8 
application  

• Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the C . 

fee 	!150 	+ 	(Late 	fee 	Z 50 	per 	month) 7 
remitted in a Government Treasury or in Friends 
under the head of account "0043-00-800-98". 
Self addressed and 	stamped envelope of size 
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth 7 32) - 

@—At District Office of the Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector, Ernakulam, Trivandrum, Kozhikode. 

—Application Forms and Fee details are available in Department Website www.ceikerala.gov.in  

NJ 
U) 



NAME OF DEPARTMENT : DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRICAl INSPECTORATE 

C. DISTRICT OFFICE OF DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRICAL INSPECTORATE, ERNAKULAM 

No. Category of Services Documents to be attached with application 
Working Designated First Second 

Days Officer Appellate Appellate 
Authority Authority 

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) 

Scrutiny, Approval and Inspection of 
Electrical Installations 

(i) 	Electrical Scheme Apprdval A covering letter 

Authorisation 	Letter 	from 	the 	client 
authorising the 	Electrical contractor to carry - 

out the work, 	giving brief particulars of the 
scheme 

Electrical Schematic drawings 

Copy of the Electrical Contractors Licence a a 
(i) a. Issue of Non conformity Report Original chalan receipt for the remittance of 2 

the Scrutiny Fee remitted in a Government Ce 
.2 

Treasury/Friends, under the 	head of account: . —. 
'V 

UU'JUUIUL 
nfl  
LU 

0 

.9 
• 

(0 	Certificate of Soil 	Resistivity (Required for, 
4- 

.. 
HT/EHT Intallations) U 

Fault Level 	Calculation (Required for 	HT/  
• EHT Installations) 

Earthing Calculation (Required for HT/EHT 
• Installations) 

b. Issue of Approval of Electrical (i) 	Bus Duct Design (Required forTransformer 
Scheme if no non conformity and Generator of rating > 630 kVA) 

U) 	A/C Calculation (Required only for Centralized - 

A/C Installations) 

(k) 	Pro forma 	and Checklist 	(available 	at 
Website : www.ceikerala.gov.in ) 

0 

a 



33/5441/20I3IDTF 	 - 

(i)c 	Issue of Approval of Electrical Compliance Report after rectifying defects 15 
Scheme in the case of (i ) a, above - 

2 (ii) Issue of Safety Certificate and 
Sanction for Energisation 

(ii)a 	Issue of Non conformity report Completion report of work 
after the inspection 

(ii)b 	Issue of Safety Certificate and Original chalan 	receipt for 	the 	remittance 
Sanction for Energisation if no of the 	Initial 	inspection fee 	remitted in a 10 
non conformity Govemment Treasury/Friends under the head 

of account 	"0043-00-102" 

(ii)c 	Issue of Safety Certificate and Compliance Report after rectifying defects 
Sanction for 	Energisation 	in the / 

case 	of (ii) a, 	above 

3 (iii) 	Inspection and issue of Valuation Request for Valuation 
Certificate for Electrical Original 	chalan 	receipt 	for 	the remittance ' 

installations of the Initial inspection 	Fee 	remitted in 	a 30 ' 

Government 	Treasury/Friends 	under 	the 
head of account 	"0043-00-102" 

o 4 Issue Certificate under regulation 62 
of CEA (MS&ES) Regulation, 2010 Request 	letter 

Submission of site plan of proposed building C) 

(with Plan 	and Elevation) Showing 	nearby ci 
Power lines and its clearance duly approved 15 
by the supplier 0 

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of 
- the fee t 1000 	(Z 100 for 	SC/ST category 

or BPL) remitted in a Government Treasury 
or 	in Friends under the head of account 
"0043-00-102" 

5 Issue of Soil Resistivity Measurement Request letter for Soil resistivity measurement 
Certificate at the site of the proposed Electrical installation 

Original 	chalan receipt for the remittance of 
the fee T 1000 	remitted in a Government 15 
Treasury 	or in Friends under 	the 	head 	of 
account 	"0043-00-102" 

Lu 



(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) 

6 Issue of Safety certificate for Request letter for 	Safety Certificate for 	Cable 
Cable TV Network TV Network 

Attested copy of Allocation 	order 	of electric 
poles for drawing Cable TV network from licensee 
Map showing area of distribution of Cable TV 
and location of electric poles 	 . 15 

Attested 	copy of registration 	certificate 	for 	- 

- Department of Post 
Original chalan 	receipt for 	the remittance of 
the inspection 	Fee (Z 5 per pole) remitted 	in 

• a Government Treasury/Friends under the head 
of account 	"0043-00-102" 

0 

7 Inspection and issue of Valuation Request letter for Valuation 
Certificate for Electrical installations Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 

inspection 	fee 	remitted in 	a 	Government 30 
Treasury/Friends under the head of account 
"0043-00-102"  

I- 
.2 8 *Electrlcal Wireman 

Renewal of Electrical Wirernan permit Duly filled application 	form for renewal of 
.2 C) 

- 

Electrical Wireman Permit U 

Original Electrical Wireman Permit 
Original 	chalan 	receipt for the remittance of 	

- 0 

the fee**  Z 300 (5 years) 	Z 500 (10 years) + 

(Late fee-: ! 200) remitted in 	a 	Government 7' 

Treasury 	or in 	Friends 	under the 	head 	of 
account "0043-00--800--99". 
Self addressed 	and stamped 	envelope of size 	- 

20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth 7 32) 

9 Contractor—Class 'C' 

Renewal 	of Electrical Contractor— (a) 	Duly filled application 	form 	for 	renewal of 
Class 'C' Licence Electrical Contractor Class C Licence 

. 

?s- 

N) 

-a 



331544112013/DTP. 	 a 

) 	
Original Electrical Contactor Class C Licence 

Original 	chalan receipt for the remittance of 

the fee** 	500 (Late fee : Z 200) remitted in 

a Government Treasury or in Friends under the - 

head of account: "0043-00--800--99" 

• Original Test 	and Calibration Certificates of 15 

Instruments (validity does not exceed 6 months) 

Verification Certificate of tools 	(validity does 

not exceed six months) 

(1) 	Self addressed and 	stamped envelope of size 

20 cmx 14 cm (Stamps worth t 32) 

(g) 	Attested Copy of Electrical Wireman Permit 

10 *Other services—Kerala State Electricity 
— a 

Licensing Board 

For Recommending the issue of Duly filled 	application 	form 	for 	Electrical 

'C-Class Electrical Contractor after Contractor Class C Licence - 

conducting interyiew (to KSEB) Original chalan 	receipt for the remittance of 
C) 

the 	fee T 400 	(Application 	Fee : 7 200 + 

Scrutiny 	fee : 	7 200) remitted 	in a 

Government Treasury or in Friends (Head of 

• account "0043-00-800-99"). 

Copy of the Experience Certificate attested by 7 

a Gazetted Officer 

Copy of Electrical Wiremarr Permit 	attested 

by aGazetted Officer 

Self addressed and stamped 	envelope of size 

10 cm x 24 cm (Stamps worth Z 5) 

Applicant is requested to appear an interview 

t-J 
—I 



(1) 
I 	 - 

(2) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) 

11 * Cinema Operator - 

Renewai—Cinema Operator Licence Duly filled Application form for Renewal of 

Cinema Operator Licence 	(Application form 
• available from Website 	ceikerala.gov.in) 

Original Cinema Operator Licence 

• Documents to beforwardecl along with the • •0 

application 7 JG 

Original chalan receipt for 	the remittance of 
the fee Z 150 + (Late fee 	Z 50 per month) 0 

' 
0.) 

remitted 	in 	a 	Government Treasury 	or in 
- Friends under the head of account 0 43 

"0043-00-800-98". 

• 	
- Self addressed and stamped envelope of size 

• 20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth Z 32) 

npplleauon tOrn)s and Fee details are available in Department Website www.ceikerala.gov.in  

By order of the Governor, 

DR. NIVEDITA P. HA, 

Additional Chief Secretary to Government. 

S 	 a 



:1 

29 

Explanatory Note 

(This does not form part of the notification, but is intended to indicate its general purport.) 

As per notificaiion issued under G. 0. (P) No. 14/2013/PD dated 4th.April, 2013 and 

published as S. R. 0. No. 281/2013 in the Kerala Gazette Extraordinary No. 990 dated 4th April, 

2013, the Government have notified the services rendered to the public and the daetails of the 

designated officers, stipulated time limit, first appellate authority and second áppIlate authority in 

respect of the Depa4ment of Electrical Inspectorate, Kerala State Electricity Board and the Energy 

It 

	

	

Management Centre, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Kdrala State Right to 

Service Act, 2012 (18 of 2012). 

a 	 In the said notification the designated officers, fi rst appellate authority and second appellate 

authority of the Department of Electrical Inspectorate differ from that of the notification issued by the 

Department of Electrical Inspectorate, as E2-18672/2011/CEI dated 31st January, 2013 in the Kerala 

Gzette No. 8 dated 19th February, 2013. An Additional column viz. 'documents to be attached with 

•  application' was also included in the notification issued by the Department of Electrical Inspectorate. 

Therefore the Government have decided to amend the said notification suitably, incorporating the 

changes and the additional column in the notification issued by the Department-of Electrical 

Inspectorate. 

The notification is intended to achieve the above object. 

41' 

El 

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE 5uPEmNTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES AT THE 
GOVERNMENT CENTRALPRESS, THIRIJVANANTLIAPURAM, 2013. 

4 



ej1 	2 

nJ(mlCfl)3o Ccth(b@ (fflu)tlI(fl)® 

(?Th6lJDo ffUThfflo 

05s 	&191 01a.jo& @ncm ioo@ 

2012-6)ej aam@ (fl)o(fl.fl3tfl acn)nJmooJaoub 

&tflm 	csaw©1 em01m3 

Ql&r&,o 

SM T. N. Prathapan 

 In 	 'STATE' .. 	ç the title, the word 	shall be deleted. 

Shri T. N. Prathapan 

 In the title after the word 'TO' the word 'PUBLIC' shall be 
inserted. 

SM E. P. Jayarajan 

 Title shall be recast as follows 

"THE ICERALA STATE PUBLIC SERVICE GUARANTEE 
BILL, 2012". 

Shri K. Suresh Kurup: 

 Title shall be recast as follows 

"THE KERALA STATE GUARANTEE OF SERVICE BILL, 
2012". 

n1c3ejou'h$rai&,o 

Shri C. P. Mohammed 

 In the long title for the words, "the delivery of" substitute the 
word 'guaranteeing". 

Shri K. Suresh Kurup 

 In the long title substitute the word "Guarantee" for the 
word "Delivery". 

KNPP. 1077/2012. 



2 

nJlcla 

Shri Palode Ravi 

In the preamble, for the words 'the delivery' substitute the 
word 'obtaining'. 

63flDOo OJ&,n 

Shri Palode Ravi 

In clause 1 (1), insert the word "guarantee" in between the 
words "service" and "Act". 

Shri T. N. Prathapan 

In clause 1 (1), for the words "Kerala State Right to Service 
Act, 2012" the words "Kerala Right to Public Service Act, 
2012" shall be substituted. 

Sit E. P. Jayarajan 

In clause 1 (1) for the words "Kerala State Right to Service 
Act' the words "Kerala State Public Service Guarantee Act" 
shall be substituted. 

Sit P. K. Basheer 

119, In clause 1 (2) after the words "into force" the words and 
figures "on the 1' of January 2013" shall be inserted. 

Shri M. P. Abdussamad Samadani 

In clause 1 (2) after the words "into force" the words "on 
the expiry of one hundred and eighty days of its passing" 
shall be added, 

Shri Therambil Ramakrishnan 

In clause 1 (2) insert the word "Government" between the 
words "The" and "Gazette". 

Shri K. Suresh Kurup 

Clause 1 (2) shall be recast as follows 

"(2) It shall come into force at once". 

Shri Dominic Presentation: 

Clause 1 (2) shall be recast as follows 

"(2) It shall come into force at once". 



3 

O6flOo MIN 

Shri Mathew 1. Thomas: 

124. In clause 2(a), the words "as such" shall be substituted by the 
words "by the Government". 

Shri K. N. A. Khader: 

125, In clause 2(b) for the words "is eligible for" the word 
"require" shall be substituted. 

SM Palode Ravi: 

Clause 2(b) shall be recast as follows: 
4 	 "applicant for service" means "a person who is an applicant 

for services notified under section 3." 

• 	Shri Benny Behanan: 

In clause 2(c) delete the word "first". 

Shri Benny Behanan: 

After clause 2(d), add the following: 

"(da) Notifications means a notification in the gazette". 

SM T. N. Prathapan: 

In clause 2(1) the words "of an eligible person" shall be 
deleted. 

Shri Palode Ravi 

In clause 2), for the words "eligible person" the words 
"applicant for service" shall be substituted. 

SM K. V. Abdul Khader 

In clause 2(g) for the words "any service to be provided" 
substitute the words "any service to be rendered". 

Smi. P. Aisha Potty 

In clause 2(g), for the words "any law for the time being in 
force" substitute the following, namely "any Act passed by the 
legislature and for any regulation, notification, order, scheme, 
rule or bye law issued thereafter". 



El 

Shri T. N. Prathapan 

133. In clause 2(g), after the words "Department of the 
Government", the words "including Government Secretariat" 
shall be inserted. 

Shri K. Raju: 

134. In clause 2(g). after the words "Public Sector Undertaking", 
insert the words "Quasi Government institution". 

Shri A. K. Balan: 

135. In clause 2(g) insert the following words between the 
words,"a Statutory Body" and "as may be" in the last line, 	4 
namely :- 

'any agencieslcontractors licenced/entrusted to deliver the 
services on behalf of the Government including institution 
registered under charitable societies Act." 

Shri Palode Ravi 

136. For clause 2(g) the following shall be substituted, namely 

"2(g) "service" means any service to be provided under the 
provisions of any law for the time being in force or as per 
Government Orders issued from time to time, to the general 
public by or under any Department of the Government 
including Secretariat service or by a Local Self Government 
Institution or Development authorities or Co-operative 
Institutions under the Co-operative Societies Act or by a 
Public Sector Undertaking or by a Statutory Body, as may be ( 
notified under section 3." 

Shri Mathew I Thomas: 

137. Clause 2(g) shall be recast as follows 

"2(g) "service" means any service as may be notified under 
section 3." 

SM Benny Behanan: 

138. Clause 2(h) shall be recast as follows 

"2(h) "state level Appellate Authority" means the authority 
notified as such under section 3A." 



5 

Shri P. Ubaidulla 

In clause 2(i) the words "or ninety days whichever is earlier" 
shall be added at the end. 

Shri K. Suresh Kurup 

After c'ause 2(i) add the following sub clause, namely:- 

"U) Local Self Government Institutions includes Grama 
Panchayath, Block Panchayath, District Panchayath, 
Municipality and Municipal Corporation." 

Shri K. Sivadasan Nair 
S 	 141. After clause 2(i),  add the following sub clause namely:- 

"(j) "Aggrieved person" means any person aggrieved by the 
order of the designated Officer or the first appellate 
authority." 

øffflOo nJalc 

Shri Palode Ravi 

142. In clause 3 for the words beginning with "save as" and 
ending with "statutory body" substitute the words "save as 
otherwise provided in any other law for the time being in 
force, every Department of the Government including 
Secretariat Service, every head of Department, every Local 
Self Government Institutions and every statutory body". 

Shri K. Dasan 

- 	 143. In clause 3 after the words "save as otherwise provided in 
any other law of the time being in force" the following words 
shall be inserted, namely "the Private Secretary of Ministers". 

Shri Mathew I. Thomas 

In clause 3 after the words "for the time being in force" the 
words "in respect of' and after the words " every statutory 
body" the words "the Government" shall be inserted. 

Shri V. S. Sunil Kumar 

In clause 3 after the words "every Department of the 
Government" the words "Secretariat" shall be inserted. 



Shri Babu M. Palissery 

 In clause 3, for the words 	'every Department of the 
Government" substitute the following words "the Chief 
Secretary and Principal Secretaries/Secretaries of the various 
Departments in the Government Secretariat." 

Shri T. N. Prathapan 

 In clause 3 after the words "every department of the 
Government" the word "Secretariat" shall be inserted. 

Shri M. Ummer: 

 In clause 3 delete the words "every Local Self Government 
Institution". 

Shri K. M. Shaji 

 In clause 3, after the words "Local Self Government 
Institution" the words " every State Public Undertaking" shall 
be inserted. 

Shri V S. Sunil Kumar: 

 In clause 3, after the words "every Local Self Government 
Institution" the words " every Public Sector Undertaking" 
shall be added. 

Shri K. Suresh Kurup: 

 In clause 3, substitute the words "Heads of the department of 

Local Self Government" for the words "Every Local Self 
Government Institution". 

Shri K. Sivadasan Nair: 

In clause 3, after the words "Local Self Government 
Institutions", the following words shall be inserted "Heads of 
Public Undertakings". 

Shri A. M. Ariff: 

In clause 3, for the words "every Local Self Goveriiment 

Institution" the following words shall be substituted, namely 
"Secretaries of every Local Self Government Institution". 



-a 

7 

Shri E. P. Jayarajan 

In clause 3, for the words "within six months of the 
commencement of this Act" the words "immediately after the 
notification of this Act in the Gazette" shall be substituted. 

Shri B. D. Devassy: 

In clause 3, after the words "within six months of the 
commencement of this Act" insert the following words, " or 
within six months after date of commencement of any law or 
Government order that may be made or issued hereafter 
casting an obligation on them to render any service". 

Shri M. Ummer: 

In clause 3, for the words "six months" substitute the words 
"Two Months". 

Shri Benny Behanan: 

In clause 3, for the words "six months" the words "two 
months" shall be substituted. 

Shri Palode Ravi: 

In clause 3, the words "six months" shall be substituted by 
the words "three months". 

Shri Joseph Vazhackan 

In clause 3, for the words "six months," substitute the words 
"three months". 

Shri E. K. Vijayan: 

In clause 3, for the words "six months" substitute the words 
"three months". 

Shri K. Suresh Kurup: 

In clause 3, substitute the words "Three months" for the 
words "Six Months". 

Shri K. Muhammadunni Haji: 

In clause 3, for the words "six months" the words "three 
months" shall be substituted. 



7 

Shri T. N. Prathapan 

In clause 3, for the words "six months" substitute the words 
"four months". 

SM V. D. Satheesan 

In clause 3, for the words "six months" substitute the words 
"five months". 

SM V. Chenthamarakshan: 

In clause 3, for the words "notify in the gazette the services", 
substitute the words "notify in the gazette the nature of 
services". 

SM Benny Behanan: 

In clause 3, the words "first" and "second appellant 
authority" shall be deleted. 

SM P. K. Gurudasan 

In clause 3, after the words "second appellate authority" insert 
the words "and every office shall be specify". 

Shri Palode Ravi 

In clause 3, insert the words "not below the rank of a 
Government Secretary" in between the words "Second 
appellate authority" and "and the stipulated time limit" 

Shri M. ilamsa 

In clause 3, add the following at the end: 
11 	 4 and the requisite documents/records/information to obtam the 
Service" 

SM A. K. Balan: 

Clause 3 may be recast as follows: 

"Power to notify services, stipulated time limit, designated 
officer etc. The state Government shall, by notification from 
time to time, notify the services that every department of the 
Government, including the Secretariat, Local Self Government 
Instituiion, State Public Sector units, every statutory body, 
agencies or contractors licensed on entrusted to deliver the 



we 

services on behalf of the Government or institutions 
registeredunder charitable Societies Act, that will be 
rendered byeach of them, the designated officers, the first 
appellateauthority and the second appellate authority and 
every officeshall notify the stipulated time limit for the purpose 
of this Act and specify the requisite documents /records/ 
informationto obtain the Service". 

Shri N. A. Nellikkunnu 

171. After 	Clause 	3, 	the 	following 	proviso 	shall 	be 
added, namely:- 

* 'Provided that in order to maintain uniformity, 	Local Self 
Government Institutions and State Public Undertakings shall 
Publish such notification only after obtaining consent of 
Government in Local Self Government Department and 
Bureau of Public Enterprises respectively." 

Shri M. Chandran 

172, In Clause 3 add the following proviso,"Provided that in the 
case of Local Self Government Institutions, the notifications to 
be 	published in the Gazette on their behalf shall, within three 
months from the date of 	commencement of this Act, be 
fonvarded in the draft form 	to the Director of Panchayats or 
the Director of Urban Affairs, as the case may be, and the 

• Director concerned shall, after 	fixing a uniform stipulated time 
limit in respect of the services of same nature or of same class 
or classes, publish 	the notification in the Gazette in a 
consolidated form or separately for each District, with in six 
months from the date of commencement of this Act." 

Shri Kodiyeri l3alakrishnan 

173. After clause 3 the following proviso shall be added 

"Provided 	that if any of the authorities bound to notify in the 
Gazette the services that will be rendered by them fail to do so 
within six months, the sen'ices being rendered by them as 
enumerated 	in the manuals, internal 	circulars brought out by 
them shall be the services deemed to be notified by them" 

1077/20 12. 



10 

Ski Elamaram Kareem 

The existing clause 3 shall be renumbered as 3 (1) and insert 
the following as 3 (2), "(2) Where any Department, institution, 
authority or body as specified in sub-section (1) fails to 
noti& the services, designated officer, appellate authorities and 
the stipulated time or to act as provided in the said sub-
section with out reasonable cause, the Secretary, Head of the 
Department or the Director concerned, who is responsible for 
their administration, shall personally be liable to pay such 
fine as may be prescribed, but not exceeding 500 rupees per 
each day in which such failure continues and such fine shall 
be imposed by the appointing authority of such officer and in 
the case of the State Public Sector Undertakings, the 
Managing Director or Chairman of such undertaking concerned 
shall be liable as above and such amount of fine as stated 
above shall be recovered by way of deduction from salary or 
in any other manner as may be prescribed: 

Provided that before imposing any fine under this sub-rule, 
the officer concerned shall be given an opportunit' of being 
heard.". 

al(moo W 	muaia 	nJ(U)lO1) °'°i 
Shri Mathew T. Thomas: 

Afler clause 3, the following clause shall be inserted: 

"3A (1) The Government may thereafter by notification from 
time to time notify the services to which this Act shall be 
extended to 4) 
(2) The Government may also by notification specify the 
designated officers, first appellate authority, second appellate 
authority and the stipulated time limit in respect of services so 
extended." 

Shri Benny Behanan 

After clause 3, a new clause shall be inserted as follows: 

"3A. Constitution of State Level Appellate Authority.-
Government may by notification constitute a State Level 
Appellate Authority within six months of the commencement of 
this Act to entertain the grievances of the appellants." 



moel3o njal 

Shri M. Ummer 

 In the marginal heading of clause 4. insert the words "within 
stipulated time limit" after the words "Right to obtain services". 

Shri E. P. Jayarajan: 

 In clause 4, for the words "Every eligible person" the words 
"Every citizen" shall be substituted. 

Shri Palode Ravi: 

179 In clause 4, for the words "eligible person" substitute the 
words "applicant for service". 

Shri M. V. Sreyams Kumar 

180 In clause 4. the words "specified for each service" shall be 
added at the end. 

Shri T. N. Prathapan: 

 After clause 4, the following proviso shall be added, namely:- 
"provided that eligible person shall submit true and correct 
information to obtain the services notified under Section 3". 

cnoeJoo 	 Jjmlw nb.jau8 

Shri Ramesh Chendithala: 

 After clause 4, add the following Clauses 4A and 413, 
namely;— "4A. 	A notice board/information hoarding in the 
prescribed 	format, depicting the services being provided by the 
institution/office and its accessing modalities, shall be 

-. displayed within the office premise so as to make the applicant 
be known about such services and also about the 	personnel 
whom they have to approach for accessing/availing 	such 
services 

4B. Government is empowered to make/put in place suitable 
institutional or structural arrangements or changes as may be 
deemed fit under this act including designation of nodal 
officers and formulation of procedural formalities to facilitate 
the access of qualitative and timely service". 



12 

(ThGTJOo 

Shri M. Ummer: 

In clause 5(1), after the words "The designated officer" the 
words "or a person subordinate to him authorised to receive the 
application" shall be inserted. 

Shri F. P. Jayarajan 

In clause 5(1), for the words "an eligible person", the words 
"a citizen" shall be substituted. 

Shri Palode Ravi : 

In clause 5(1), the words "eligible person" shall be substituted 
by the words "applicant for services", 

DR. K. T. Jaleel 

In clause 5(1), delete the words "or reject the application". 

Shri Roshy Augustine 

In clause 5 (l), after the words "intimate" the words "in the 
same day" shall be inserted. 

Shri K. Suresh Kurup 

In clause 5(1), insert the words "in person or by Registered 
post" in between the words "applicant" and "forthwith". 

Shri Roshy Augustine: 	
'I 

In clause 5(1), in between the words "applicant" and 
"forthwith", the words "in writing" shall be inserted. 

Shri Kodiyeri Balakrishnan 

In clause 5(1), for the last word "forthwith" substitute the 
words "within the stipulated time limit". 

Shri R. Rajesh 

Add the following at the end of clause 5(1) "along with the 
particulars of the appellate authority." 



13 

Shri Raniesh Chennithala 

192. In clause 5(1), after the last sentence, the following sentences 

may be added, "If any service has been denied/rejected by the 

officer, causes and reasons for such rejection/denial must be 

clearly stated and intimate to the applicarn. If it has found that 

the service has been rejected or denied without any substantial 

valid reason or justification fine may be imposed to the erring 

officer/officers in such a manner and way as may be prescribed 

under this ac". 

Shri M. Ummer: 

 In clause 5(2), the wdrds "in prescribed form" shall be inserted 

before the words "to receive such application". 

Shri V. S. Sunil Kumar 

 In clause 5(2), after the words "receive such application", the 

words "by issuing a receipt to that effect" 	shall be 	added. 

Shri Mathew T. Thomas 

 After clause 5(2) add the following sentence at the end: 

"Every designated officer shall maintain detailed records of 

applications for service, in a format as may be prescribed". 

Shri Ramesh Chennithala 

 Recast clause 5(2) as follows: 

"(2) An application received, including the on-line application, 

under sub-section (1) shall be duly acknowledged by the 

S. designated officer or by the officer authorised by him to 

receive such application." 

Shri James Mathew 

 After clause 5(1) add the following as clause 5(2) namely: 

"(2)- when the designated officer is absent on leave or 

otherwise, immediate junior shall be the designated officer for 

the purpose of this Act" and renumber the remaining 

sub-clauses. 

Shri M. A. Vaheed 

 In clause 5(3). for the word "start" substitute the word 

"begin". 



14 

Shri Mathew T. Thomas: 

In sub-clause (3) of the clause 5, after the words "start from" 
the words "the next working day of' shall be inserted. 

Shri C. Krishnan: 

In clause 5(3), after the word "received" add the words "either 
in person or through on-line". 

DR. T. M. Thomas Isaac 

After the existing clause 5(2) add the following as clause 5(3) 
namely :—"(3) the departments and officers covered by 
e-governance a port let may be provided for submitting on-line 
application for the service. The designated officer shall on the 
same day assign an identification number fore achapplication to 
track the file and shall provide the service as stipulated in sub 
clause (1) above" and renumber the remaining sub clauses. 

Shri Kodiyeri Balakrishnan 

After clause 5(3), the following sub clause shall be inserted, 
namely: "(4) the designated authority shall keep a register 
regarding compliance of the directions issued by the respective 
first appellate authority and second appellate authority" 

Shri Kodiyeri Balakrishnan 

After clause 5(3) the following sub clause shall be inserted 
namely:— "(4) Every eligible person having applied for any 
service shall be provided an application number by the 
designated officer and shall be entitled to obtain and monitor Mi 
status of his application on line or in person in accordance with 
such procedure as may be prescribed. The Public Authority 
shall maintain status of all applications for service online and 
in a register and shall be duly bound to update the status of 
the same as per the procedure as prescribed by rules in 
this regard." 

Shri K. K. Jayachandran 

Add the following clause after clause 5(3), namely:-

"5(4) every office shall evolve an on-line file tracking system." 



Is 

Shri K. Suresh Kurup 

205. After clause 5 (3) add the following sub-clauses namely:- 

"(4) Every Applicant shalt be entitled to obtain and monitor 
status of the application on line in accordance with such 
procedure as may be prescribed. 

(5) Every public Authority or Local Authority as the case may 
be shall maintain the status of all applications related to 
services on line and shall be duly bound to update the status 
of the applications". 

14 	 (nThWiJOo 	% Cn2a 2jai 	nJCU$lW OJSn 

SM Palode Ravi 

206. After clause 5, a new clause shall be inserted, namely:-

"5A. Monitorin2 the status of the aDolication 

Every applicant for service having applied for any citizen 
related services shall be provided an application number by the 
concerned Public Authority, or Local Authority, as the case may 
be and shalt be entitled to obtain and monitor status of his 
application online in accordance with such procedure as may 
be prescribed. 

Every Public Authority or Local Authority, as the case may 
be, shall maintain status of all applications governing citizen 
related services on line and shall be duly bound to update the 

S 

	

	 status of the same as per the procedure as prescribed by rules 

in this regard." 

miOOo OJap.J 

Shri. Benny Behanan 

207. In clause 6 for the words, "first appellate authority" the words 
"appellate authority" may be substituted wherever occur. 

Shri. Benny Behanan 

208. In clause 6 for the words, "second appellate authority" the 
words "state level appellate authority" shall be substituted 
wherever occurs. 



16 

Slid. Mathew T. Thomas 

• 209. In clause 6 (1), the words, "required service" shall be 
substituted by the words "service aliplied for". 

Shri. Saju Paul 

In clause 6(1) delete the words "and on payment of such fee". 

Slid. E. P. Jayarajan: 

In clause 6(1) the words "and on payment of such fee" 
shall 	be deleted. 

Shri. K. Sivadasan Nair: 

In clause 6(1) the words "and on payment of such fee" 
shall be deleted. 

Shri. K. Sivadasan Nair: 

In the proviso to clause 6(1) for the words "after the 
expiry of the period of thirty days" substitute the words 
"forthwith". 

Shri. Roshy Augustine: 

In 	the proviso to 	clause 6(1) for the words "thirty 
days" substitute the words "fifteen days". 

Shri. Mathew T. Thomas 

In sub-clause (2) of clause 6, the word "may" after the 	4 
words, "appellate authority" shall be substituted by the words 
"shall either" and the word "may" after the word "or" shall be 
deleted. 

Shri. P. C. Vishnunadh: 

In clause 6 (2), for the words "provide" substitute the word, 
"render". 

Shri. Koliakode N. Krishnan Nair; 

In clause 6 (2), for the words, "within a specified period" 
• 	substitute the word, "forthwith". 



17 

Shri M. Ummer: 

 In clause 6 (2), for the words "a specified period" the words, 
Thirty days" shall be substituted. 

Prof. C. Raveendranath 

 In clause 6 (2) add the words "and shall intimate the appellant 
the reasons for rejection of appeal", at the end. 

Shri K. Kunhiraman (Trikkaripur): 

220 In clause 6 (2) add the words "and shall intimate the same in 
writing to the eligible person" at the end. 

Shri C. Moyinkutty: 

221. In clause 6 (3) after the word "limit" the words "or one 
month, whichever is earlier" shall be added at the end. 

Shri K. Sivadasan Nair 

 In clause 6 (3) after the words "time limit" the words "after 
giving an opportunity to the desigiiated officer under Section 3 
to file his explanation whatsoever for denying the service if 
any" shall be added at the end. 

Shri P. B. Abdul Razak 

 In clause 6 (4) for the word "aggrieved" the words "not 
satisfied" shall be substituted. 

Shri T. N. Prathapan: 

 In clause 6 (4) for the word "sixty" the words "forty five 
shall be substituted, 

Shri K. Sivadasan Nair: 

 In clause 6 (4) for the words "sixty days" the words "thirty 
days" shall be substiwted. 

Shri K. Kunhammed Master: 

 In clause 6 (4) delete the words "and on payment of such fee". 

Shri E. P. Jayarajan 

 In clause 6(4), the words "and on payment of such fee" shall 
be deleted. 

1077/2012. 



In 
Shri Sunny Joseph 

In the proviso to clause 6(4), for the word "that" substitute the 
word "the'. 

SIt P. C. Vishnunadh 

In clause 6(5), delete the word "he may". 

SIt Mathew T. Thomas: 

In sub clause (5) of clause 6, the word "may" after the words 
"second appellate authority" may be substituted by the words 
"shall either" and the words "he may" shall be deleted. 

Shri M. IJmmer: 

In clause 6(5) for the words "a specified period" substitute the 
words "fifteen days". 

Prof. C. Raveendranath 

In clause 6 (5) add the following at the end namely: "under 
intimation to the appellant of the reasons for rejection of the 
appeal." 

Shri Kodiyeri Balakrishnan 

In clause 6(5) add the following at the end namely: "under 
intimation to the eligible person". 

Shri E. P. Jayarajan 

After clause 6(5) the following proviso shall be added namely: 4 
"Provided that before rejecting the appeal, an opportunity of 
hearing to the aggrieved person shall be granted by the second 
appellate authority", 

Shri Abdurahjman Randathani : 

In clause 6 (7) after the word, "limit" the words "or one - 
month whichever is earlier" shall be added at the end. 

Shri P. C. Vishnunadh: 

In sub-clause (8) of clause 6, after the words "such non-
compliance may" the words, "within such period or may be 
prescribed" shall be inserted. 



19 

Shri K. Sivadasan Nair: 

In clause 6 (8), for the words,second appellate authority and 
such applications shall be disposed of in the same manner in 
which a second appeal is to be disposed of under this Act", 
substitute the words. "first appellate authority and such an 
application shall be disposed of for complying the earlier order 
and proceed in to the penal provision and disciplinary action". 

Shri K. Radhakrishnan: 

In clause 6 (8), for the words "such an application shall be 
disposed of in the same manner in which a second appeal is to 
be disposed of under this Act", substitute the words, "the 
second appellate authority shall direct the designated officer to 
provide the service forthwith and shall impose penalty as 
provided in section 8". 

Shri Mathew 1. Thomas 

 In sub clause (9) of clause 6, after the words "such non- 
compliance may", the words "within such period as may be 
prescribed" shall be inserted. 

Shri G. Sudhakaran 

 In clause 6 (9) for the words, "such an application shall be 
disposed of in the same manner in which a second appeal is to 
be disposed of under this Act." substitute the words, "direct the 
designated ofFicer to provide the service forthwith and 	also 
impose penalty on the designated officer as provided in 
section 8". 

Shri C. Mammutty: 

 In clause 6 (9), after the word "Act" the words "and impose 
second penalty equal to that of first penalty" shall be added at 
the end. 

Shri K. Kunhiraman (Uduma): 

 In clause 7 (b), delete the words, "and two appellant," 



NO 

Shri E. P. Jayarajan: 

After clause 7 of the following clause shall be added namely:-
7A Service Guarantee:- Every Head of Department shall have 
the responsibility to assure the time bound delivery of citizen 

related Service as defined in this Act" 

Shri K. Suresh Kurup: 

After clause 7 add the following elause as clause 7 A 

"7A. Constitution of the Commission:— The Government shall 
constitute a commission to be called The Kerala State 
Guarantee of Services Commission constituting of a Chief 
Commissioner and two other Commissioners and their 
appointment shall be made by the Government in consultation 
with the leader of opposition. The Commission shall supervise 
all the matters related to the 
services to be provided." 

Shri O)Jumen Chandy: 

,4 *Jn sub-clause (2) of clause 8 for the word 
- 	"fSalLhs 

Shri K. Suresh Kurup: 

In clause 8 (1) (a) the words "failed to Provide" shall be 
substituted by the words "not provided" 

Shi-i K. Sivadasan Nair: 
	 4) 

In clause 8 (1) (a) for the words "the second appellate 
authority" substitute the words "first appellant authority". 

Shri Benny Behanan: 

In clause 8, for the words "second appellate authority" 
wherever it occures, the words "state level appellate authority 
right" shall be substituted. 

Shri Benny Behanan: 

In clause 8, for the words "first appellate authority" the words 
"appellate authority" shall be substituted wherever it occures. 



I 	21 

Smt. K. K. Lathika: 

250, In clause 8 (I) (a) substitute the word "shall" for the word 
'may". 

ShriE. P. Jayarajan: 

In clause 8 (I) (a) for the words "impose a fine on the 
designated officer which shall not be less than five hundred 
rupees and not more than five thousand rupees," the words 
"shall recommend disciplinary action against him under the 
service rules applicable to him" shall be substituted. 

ShriT. N. Prathapan: 

In clause 8 (1) (a) for the words "five hundred," the words 
"one thousand" shall be substituted. 

Shri Roshy Augustine: 

In clause 8 (1) (a) for the words "five hundred rupees" 
substitute the words "thousand rupees". 

Shri V. S. Sunil Kurnar: 

In clause 8 (I) (a) for the words "five hundred rupees" and 
"five thousand rupees", the words "one thousand rupees" and 
"twenty five thousand rupees" shall be substituted respectively. 

Shri Mathew 11 Thomas 

In clause 8(1 )(a) for the words, "five hundred rupees and not 
more than five thousand rupees" substitute the words, "five 

s 	thousand rupees and not more than ten thousand rupees;". 

Shri K. Sivadasan Nair 

In clause 8(l)(b) for the words, "second appellate authority", 
substitute the words, "first appellate authority". 

Shri Ti N. Prathapan,: 

In clause 8(l)(b) for the words. "two hundred and fifty" the 
words "one hundred" shall be substituted. 

Shri R. Selvaraj 

In clause 8(I)(b) for the words "two hundred and fifty rupees", 
substitute the words "two hundred and seventy five rupees". 



22 

Shri Hibi Eden 

In clause 8(l)(b) for the words "two hundred and fifty rupees", 
substitute the words "two hundred and eighty five rupees". 

Shri Varkala Kahar 

In clause 8(l)(b) for the words "two hundred and fifty rupees", 
substitute the words "three hundred rupees". 

SM P. C. Vishnunadh 

In clause 8(1)(b) for the words "two hundred and fifty rupees", 
substitute the words "four hundred rupees". 

Shri A. P. Abdullakutty: 

In clause 8(1)(b), for the words "two hundred and fifty 
rupees" substitute the words "five hundred rupees". 

Shri Thomas Unniyadan: 

In clause 8(1)(b), for the words "two hundred and fifty" 
substitute the words "five hundred rupees". 

Ski M. P. Vincent: 

In clause 8(l)(b), for the words "two hundred and fifty rupees" 
substitute the words "six hundred rupees". 

Shri V. S. Sunil Kumar: 

In clause 8(1)(b), for the words "two hundred and fifty rupees", 	4 
the words "One thousand, two hundred and fifty" shall be 
substituted. 

Ski Purushan Kadalundi: 

In clause 8(1)(b), delete the words "the sum of which shall not 
exceed five thousand rupees". 

Ski V. S. Sunil Kumar: 

In clause 8(1)(b), for the words "five thousand rupees" the 
words "twenty five thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 



23 

Shri A. Pradeepkumar: 

268. In clause 8(l)(b), add the following words at the end: 

"the amount so collected shall be awarded to the appellant as 
compensation". 

Shri V. S. Swill Kumar 

269. After clause 8(I)(b), add the following, namely:- 

"(c) 	Appeals are to be disposed of within a period of 60 days 
by the appellate authority". 

Shri V. P. Sajeendran 

270. In clause 8(2), for the word "clause", substitute the word 
"ground". 

Shri P. A. Madhavan 

271. In clause 8(2), for the words "five hundred rupees" substitute 
the words "six hundred rupees". 

Shri K. Achuthan 

272. In clause 8(2), for the words "five hundred rupees" substitute 
the words " six hundred and fifty rupees". 

Shri Ludy Luiz 

273. In clause 8(2), for the words "five hundred rupees" substitute 
the words "seven hundred rupees". 

Shri A. T. George 

274. In clause 8(2), for the words "five hundred rupees" 	substitute 
the words " eight hundred rupees". 

Shri Roshy Augustine 

275. In 	clause 8(2), for the words "five hundred rupees" substitute 
the words "thousand rupees": 

Shri V. S. Sunil Kumar: 

L 	
276. In clause 8 (2), for the words "five hundred" the words, "one 

thousand" shall be substituted. 



24 

Shri T. N. Prathapan 

In clause 8 (2), for the words "five hundred" the words, "one 
thousand" shall be substituted. 

Shri Anwar Sadath: 

In clause 8 (2), for the words "five hundred rupees" substitute 
the words, "one thousand rupees". 

Shri V. T. Balram: 

In clause 8 (2), for the words "five hundred" substitute the 
words, "one thousand one hundred rupees". 

Sit Shafi Parambil: 4 
I 

In clause 8 (2), for the words "five hundred rupees" substitute 
the words, "one thousand and two hundred rupees". 

Sit P. T. A. Rahim: 

In clause 8 (2), for the words "five hundred rupees and not 
more than five thousand" substitute the words, "five thousand 
rupees and not more than ten thousand". 

Sit Thomas Unniyadan: 

In clause 8 (2), for the words "five thousand rupees" substitute 
the words, "ten thousand rupees". 

Sit V. S. Sunil Kumar 

In clause 8(2), for the words "five thousand" the words "twenty 
five thousand" shall be substituted. 

Sit T. N. Prathapan 

The proviso to clause 8(2) shall be deleted. 

Sit Kodiyeri Balakrishnan 

After clause 8(2) add the following sub-clause and renumber. 
accordingly 

"(3) The penalty imposed would be recoverable from the 
salary of the designated officer or the first appellate authority 
as the case may be". I 

I 



25 

Shri M. Ummer: 

In clause 8(3), the words "and in case of a habitual and 
willful defaulter" shall be inserted between the words "under 
this Act" and "recommend disciplinary action". 

Shri Benny Behanan 

In clause 8(3) insert the words "including for making relevant 
entries in the Service Book of erring officials" between the 
words discliplinary action" and "against him". 

Shri T. A. Ahammed Kabeer 

4 	288. After clause 8(3) the following sub-section shall be added, 
namely :- 

"(4) In the circumstances of these penalties imposed on a 
designated officer or first appeal authority, an adverse entry 
shall be made in the respective service record". 

Shri Ramesh Chennithala 

After clause 8, add the following clause, namely:-

SA. Compensation for right holders: 

"If any damage or loss has been sustained to the livelihood 
perspectives of the right holder/applicant subsequent to the 
denial/rejection of service with out any substantial valid 
reasons, the loss/damages caused to him thereby on account of 
such denial/rejection of service, the applicant may be paid such 
compensation or relief as may deem fit." 

Shri Palode Ravi 

After clause 8 the following clause shall be added, namely:- 

"8A. Payment of compensatory cost to the applicant for 
Service 

An applicant for service having applied such services shall be 
entitled to seek conipensatory cost in accordance with the 
provisions of this Act and rules made thereunder, in case of 
delay or default in the delivery of such services beyond the 
stipulated time". 

107 7/20 12. 



26 

SM E. P. Jayarajan: 

After clause 8 the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

"8A. Payment of compensatory cost to the citizen: 

Citizen having applied for such services shall be entitled to 
seek compensation in accordance with the provisions of this 
Act and rules made there under, in case of delay or default in 
the delivery of such services beyond the stipulated:time". 

SM M. Ummer: 

After clause 8, the following clause shall be inserted, namely:— 	.4 
"8A. The provision of this Act shall be deemed to the part of 
service conditions of the designated officer including such 
officer of all Public Authorities". 

Shri M. Ummer 

After clause 8, the following clause shall be inserted, namely:- 

"8 A Right of appeal by the Public Servant—Any Public 
Servant aggrieved by the order passed by the Second appellate 
authority in accordance with section 8 of the Act shall be 
entitled to file an appeal to the Head of Department/ 
a commission constituted under this Act, against such order 
with in a period not exceeding thirty days of the receipt of the 
impugned order. The order of the Head of Department! 
Commission shall be final and binding". 4) 

Shri M. Ummer: 

After clause 8, the following clause shall be inserted namely:- 

"8A. Constitution of the Commission.— For the purpose of this 
Act, the Government shall constitute a commission to be 
called the Kerala Right to Service Commission: 

Provided that till such time the commission is not constituted 
by the State Government, it may, by notification, nominate an 
officer of the State Government not below the rank of a 
Secretary to Government, to perform the functions and exercise 
the powers of the commission under this Act". 



27 

Shri T. N. Prathapan: 

295. After Clause 8, add the following clause and renumber 
accordingly: 

"9. Application for revision—Any officer affected by an orde 
of the second appellate authority in respect of imposing penalty 
application to the officer, nominated by the State Government 
within a period of 30 days from the date of order". 

Shri Mathew T. Thomas: 

296. After clause 8, the following clause shall be added and 
renumber accordingly 

"SA. Revision Authority: 

(I) The Government shall notify an officer not below the rank 
of a Secretary to Government, as the revision authority to 
consider the revision petitions filed against the order of the 
second appellate authority. 

(2) Any Person aggrie*d by any order of the Second appellate 
authority may made an order to the revision authority with a 
period of six months from the date of such order, which shall 
be disposed of in the manner as may be prescribed: 

Provided that the revision authority may entertain the 
application after the expiry of the period mentioned here 
above, if satisfied that the applicant had sufficient cause for 
not filing the petition in time. 

Gifl8nJCmOo cuanj 

Shri K. Muraleedharan 

297 In clause 9, for the words "which is in good for the done", 
substitute the words "done in good faith". 

Shri T. N. Prathapan 

298. After clause 9, add the following clause and renumber 
accordingly: 

"10. Display of Services.— The Services and the stipulated 
time limit shall be displayed in every department concerned for 
information of the public". 



28 

Shri N. Samsudheen 

After clause 9 add the following clause and renumber 
accordingly: 

"10. Evaluation of performance using advanced technology:-
Performance of designated officers and appellate authorities 
shall be evaluated with the help of advanced technology and 
best performers in each District of, the State shall be awarded 
in the manner prescribed". 

Shri Kodiyeri Balakrishnan 

After clause 9, the following clause shall be added and the 
remaining clauses shall be renumbered:- 

"10. Kerala Right to Service Commission :- 

(1) The Government shall, by notification in the Gazette, 
constitute a body to be known as the Kerala Right to Service 
Commission to have a general superintendence over the 
compliance of the directions of the second appellate authority 

(2) The Kerala Right to Service Commission Shall consist of- 

A Chief Service Commissioner 

two Service Commissioners 

(3) The Chief Service Commissioner shall be a Retired Judge 
of the High Court. 

(4) The Chief Service Commissioner and the Service 
Commissioners shall be appointed by the Government after the 
consultation with Leader of Opposition in the Legislative 
Assembly. 

(5) The Commission shall receive appeal from any person over 
the non-compliance of the direction of the second appellate 
authority issued under sub section (9) of section 6. 

(6) On receipt of such appeal under sub section (5), the 
commission after requiring the production of documents from 
the designated authority and inspecting these documents shall 
dispose of the appeal and directions issued to the designated 
authority accordingly. 



29 

(7) The Commission shall have the same powers as are vested 
in Civil Court in respect of enforcing the directions issued 
while disposing of the appeals". 

Shri A. K. Balan 

301. After clause 9 add the following clause namely: 

"9A. Constitution of The Kerala Right to Service 

Commission,- 

(I) The Government shall constitute a commission known as 
The Kerala Right to Service Commission and shall, by 

4 notification in the official Gazette, appoint a person of 
eminence in public life with wide knowledge and experience in 
administration and governance or social service as 
Commissioner. He shall be appointed in constitution with the 
Leader of the Opposition and the tenure of his office shall be 
three years. 

(2) It shall be the duty of the Commission to ensure proper 
implementation of this Act and to make suggestions to the 
Government for ensuring better delivery of services. For this 
purpose the Commission may 

entertain and dispose of application from eligible persons 
rejected by the Second Appellate Authority and shall have 
power to impose penalty on the Designated Officer, First 

• Appellate Authority and Second Appellate Authority, if 
found any dereliction on their part; 

recommend changes in procedures for delivery of services 
which will make the delivery more transparent and easier; 
and 

(e) issue general instnictions, not inconsistent with the provision 
of this Act for the guidance of designated officers,first 
appellate authorities and the second appellate authorities. 

(3) The Commission shall, while inquiring into any matter 
under this section, have the same powers as are vested in a 
Civil Court while trying a suit under the Code of Civil 
Procedure, 3908, in respect of the following matters, viz:- 



30 

summoning and enforcing the attendance of persons, 
compelling them to give oral or written evidence on oath 
and producing documents or things; 

requiring the discovery and inspection of documents; 

receiving evidence on affidavits; 

requisitioning any public records or copies thereof from any 
couit or office; 

issuing summons for examination of witnesses or 

documents; and 

any other matter which may be prescribed. 

(4) The Commission may frame its regulations for the conduct 
of its business and any such matter, as the Commission may 
deem fit." 

i(b15)Oo OJdNC 

Shri K. Raju: 

In clause 10 after the word "Court" the words "below High 
Court" shall be inserted. 

Smt. E. S. Bijimol: 

Clause 10 shall be recast as follows "l0, All District Courts 
shall have the Power to entertain any suit, application on other 
proceeding in respect of any orders issued under this Act, and 
Provision for appeal against the order of Civil Court to High 
Court or Supreme Court shall be under this Act." 

nJ(5)6)CflO(fl)Oo QicO) 

Shri V. M. Ummer Master: 

In clause 11(1) after the word "Gazette" the following words 
shall be inserted: "with in six months from the date of its 
passing" 



31 

nJ1flU)6rrOO OJaç 

Shri S. Rajendran: 

305. Delete the proviso to clause 12 (1) 

Qatv m1©amo 6xTt1.The5o1, 	 nil. 6k0. Q1(01w(DU8, 
caicbomcImnJ$o, 
2012 üe@w 24. 

4 

.1 



nJ(aflm)Do affico@ nlcn@ 

mflc8mcmc8 113 

2012-6ei ca,(ao a ocn)iJocn cm)cumowaacm aulo3 

p 

b 

742/2012. 



nJ(Th1O1)Oo C&(0 	JOtt 

6nflm mcni8 113 

2012—glel Céth(b CrooCmrDcn c 	DOSO,XI) Gnulc?JS 

mluaIhm 	ø1w1ae18 nJoom6rmu5e65 atajam3u3 

LnJC3Offlo 	cmcm1mo (Th(0)230)1 	Dj5(0)o (W(D)1U 

(uTmath1ou)1aom &0ø6UT3U&6)o6OJ6fll 

flJ\flJCfD 	crrnuflcnS 
• 	• 	 • 	• 	63ø 

GUMS 

njo1a,.—m1&ifl< 	 o1w11S 	omca€ ontni awir3(th 

1J°°° Qaj(TThö)1U) nJSOJOThD 	JCflX& ulamoo 

CI5)0S o1j61ae16x (OnJ(5miZl(fl0o U cO 	(Oth1a38 ()0OWnj)o Ln14O0ø0 

I. 	eoapo La0oornJo.( i) 	(TJcSØ1U) 2012-90 aOØ @ (P)offUAJOfl) 

cJ(nJOJ(T)0fl1â0CTh 	 nyfl5 anJ( .nJ0)0o. 

(2) 	.:W(TD eflmonj(noon1, (P)&O6)0( o1uiflaecm c)1oth1 p)ØS 

	

flJ(b(Tflø)06Tfl. 	 • 

2. 	jcnna8.— 	cmØ1* crumdeo 	nflwvuThuS 

nJôo, 

(ng) "ni1wm 	nowmna3" 4yTfl0(d LDT m4910eJ OJIOJMlnaU3  

mrn6m3v3 lnJnomo G)aJ( 	1)CU)1CO01fl 3-00 0Jcthcd [nJaO(Do fflYb6W36)fl) 

eco Cr30W(nDO8 4m0&afl; 

i) 	 (m,a3" n4)tTh0t8 300 OJGJ LnJa,Oøo nejxjtho 

63arGflflJO)6U0CJ&OQ 	nfl 	9O GJUÔ 1flñ0&ClDd; 

/ 	(r) "ethoc mj18 mawlaocffl" n4)Ut0tZ 3-00 Jn 1nJ000 (6m3a)cn 

OflC1D)0nMflo 6)aJ()G)çJ eco 	GflJ,0(OThJJ08 n)CTflflQatrT) 

((i1) "nXSaQOCB" n4iflO(D • oam@ flX8000(8 nPfl0(TT) 

() "ml 	iflcaøej" gmoøZ 	'n 	 n1wlc8 6moa& 

aJ6m0(08 th 	flQ6)J(th n 	fl0CTD 

(4ni5) "arunjnDoojaoubo" fl)momS m1uTho cu 	aJclwla)1s1( 

 63(DOUBaOM (DlbtliAOQbo n 	(Z(Th000 (Th 

742/2012. 



2 

(wi) "GCfl)OJ(fla" nym0c8 (U)COTD)o .nJo6nJeJscmm1eflcb10e(m n4)6)aDaleJ20 
m1cwxoTo)16)ej 

 

(mscvmm,%u3 LnJ0ø0Z0, (ITh(D)(05 Thzo ttc&e@o3 n.iosnIlocn, 

QwnonJa,cr8 Lruaomao rQ@Mftlep roBeoc8 nJ&ajG mmmfln3slplcejo 

an@çaico ocm1eo c3ubauJ)oGø€n, crunonjcncnio umea1c8 Bel cnocnxoonD 

6nJoa3)aaeuejo moonJmco e(b 1ow1o1m m1aono 

6)nJ30m6r3u3a65 [nJ(30(no 6)nJat6mø)0cfl), 3-Ga majlo8s1w1ø8 duleQmonjn)o 

6)aJc)6)jSGQJ(TD, n43GXm8,leJo C(fl)QJCflo n)CM(8MOJ0&,Th 

	

(n) "mEnoo mj1S (lITbWlth,001" n)(m0ø8 3 -30 ni& 	cnJa000 cØTh6M6)n 
nhleEImonJmo 	JQ26)qq§ 63Mg QG f3jOU)MMaa n)Cm n3&,(m 

(ong)) "mivaThm ntain1olw1" 114ano8 m1wDm @a%3WMM03 antnicno 

LnJ(30(T)o Thcmiamo (Ib6,1(8 (GTb(Um)mo cm m)lm 6W (VIbt2nJcOW 

flo&ecmcu)1wno 3-00  oij1Ja0to ohlermojcno 6JQj r.i0200Jw1 

fltø)nJth1w1 41O3Cm. 

amommmua, cnlwiflcu) cTtnjo1ffll, (flit)&U) gaf3pmmmaa Ø(D)QJ0QJ 

nfl€ymonjmo EThJcCTD(Th1 Cfl 	t'mbu)laG(Do.—( i) D)øno 1J061J2(OIt91QJ1 

06)083;12Jo cn103)øcu0108 MRInDWOMIM8 nJnJcruo omj 00J6,n0w16,a,, LDrD 

cjlGi Uii000so oø3 mo onum$lcne,o, 63000 (Th(600(3 (uce,çjo, 630000 

ni€ej aaiwonflo, 633000 MG(JUMMOOMM (TUC3nJ(flflJo, eocoo m1oow1rao1an 

0)QJo, (Th0J 632o0cma 	fl(fl0D) BcTt(IJm6m3&3, 	ta Qansowmnc8, 

acmoo am1w (fflbwla,001, c,Gmoo bj8 mmuilaomi, a)iq*iThm mainjt1w1 ngymlQJ, 

'n cmlci wlnjob63n08&Q3)i wcr09106 nil€rmo0mo smicmmom. 

etojm6l3cj8 2J@ Qfl1)O)1Cfl 	m'DoJ&,oubo.— 3-00 flJtOaj tJ'30o 

oj1€imonJmo QaJ@s cn)oJcn6unv3 cn1viThm 	o1ufiae1cuB 	o&crncuicñ 

6)DG0 (UThfl(5XP) 	ICl8&6)o (I3Thoj ceocjbo  Q6ocx3fl0Qcmcmo6th. 	 S 
5, 01a© 	nowtrjec nJocmeJ.—(i) uin(u©2 	e01c8 m1mo 

630Oniai9 QJl3t8, O)1D&(U) aS3wntnc1, flu5rualcwo 

LnJ0fteJfl1J@ n436)G&eJo l)0(UmflQQJ 00 0a&&06 @o(I)o 0JO3(rflflWo, 

GUJ a(mOJCOo LnJGD(flo 6)nJ cO,QW)D MOgE1153 n1cmJlc 	 1w12%8 
(1t1 GIThn.Jo&J m1G01i1DE)&,0 6J 	)3611. flit thl0Qfl1) ntoWdt8, cmbarnno 

aMO)IO)gP-@ Do6rn6m3c5 emcw QJoofl nflo 	rtmo and sa&mani, <vmcnja, 

Qm 

(1)-00 	 uLnJcth0o0 QJ1 	6Ub (ThQnJcOa1 (fl1Q)S() 000W 

mxooto cn'o6)çpi(3 mmmuloo (mbanse.B ouflat1eeoo a1mcno azmu$laotsspt 

0(30wCfl)Ccno ULDOORCUI 6)aq6nca)0975. 

mczrLiaad ei1. cflaifl omt8 (nluml(m monjm1w1 ctol&e 

ammo€yt. 



3 

6. 	1mt—(i) n1uThm roi©uo1w1ao1o8 	niuo amnjno 

SQ300iOm0 	 5700 	a1xi (1)-00 	J&n Lnic&0(00 OThanJcOñl 

cnl0cn)l&6)6)ja0)o cma' n436)0000Cf8&G)o 63(fl)Oo 	aw1a,no1 	mJoa, 

omcuaw m1ocr01 flxafl 	 m1u31flo Thr,j&wl manintocnloj m2 qJ& 
m1nIo8, ml 	esooi'm mnt,rn©o o1ofl00, nminnø 

n1D1Cfl esao'ho 63MI (mb%J108 (fl&tB6)0QJ(1D0)D6fl: 

nymo* 	tmm1cn1o8 mn1o8 ne08 @ oornu$1th omj1thS 

flJ0B106 ø0i)0 aom asmo51tcm@ojm5 61tThoo (lT0njlGi3 cmu)1a,Dm1a amlotDs 

,

stho)oQ6ma1o8 p nmw1a,om1&€, JD nlnicruo mnn1(o)1moDn1oJo 

(mbç4jla3S flDJ1&áOOJqflm)DGfli. 

(2) @anoo mj1co8 mmwl&,o&ced n1a<m 	nowmnano an 

n1uilim a3pjnJ1cn1cuS antnjmo m(dalmo(d nTha@co1aec©o  cS6)çjal8 

0m009 m1ocm1aoemo 6)on1nThmD6fl5. 

(a) (1)-on 	 mj1w3 m1oii1ca, nuow 

nJ01U)1&6 	J0) 630 8O2J©QflO108 o1c8njoaao6mooen5. 

aanoo mij1o6 mtwlao o1w@s m10 00 m utflo8 cnia so 

c46XU)O0OU806)0, 63(tDo OTh1OZ SThW1&3(0106)S (fl thocO(UTt)16i o)1m(M1 00)0 

monJo (31CMffUMMlMjMlM8 a1aesonjm, 	nay8 o10)1J1eo 

nr361mQ 	nfll(fl3 6is&@lo 0611300 	mtwla,00l ocnjos>a, 	omn110 

flennJcrna)o6th: 	 - 

n)m)DCa8, 	um1rn1oZ mo1o8 nnco8 	ooioanith mr108 

nion1&3 ocofloQ 	 osmoc m1o8 aRWIaOM166 cmow 

jsoens,1( 0tj (?3Ibthc8,001&6 (1JTbOnJ0 (310J(TUo 	n)3(n1(m1muk.oJo 

mjlt8 mJ1a01aQ3OJCrnmoaT6 

ocnoo maj1o8 anbwlaoolth m16am 	npwaunamb so 

mlwiflo aoe 	 antnjno mcø8aojon cn1&arob1&eaawo 	e1o8 

moa&oc mnjlc8 ni1ot1Gaocwo Q0flJflt0)36th. 

cn1uvmflc ntonjo1w1e1co8 antoJcno 

o©13 	o06mth16çTT 06n3oo m1th8 mwlaool socrgom&,006)sm,108, 

(31?ji ccronJmo eJ€pZD&QDQ8 	GTh1(tflO1U)06)SO0 8-00 

njnjatmn 	Jcd1(m1010Q(ThLnJa0O0 otlaai J0W)VD0Jflt0)006115. 

(4)-Do 	 LnJdbO(DMaM 60 CO1O8 oflc#viJW, Ththnjm10a 

eJsajoQ eo &o 	nJ1ns1o8 ayloaangimothL 

o 	1en (2)-oo QnJn&aj tnJcth000 63(11)00 

mw1a3o1 a)ca8am) aTh&c@ôbo m1sm QccsDu1n1n1n  cgomcmo1aeommjoaio, 

(3<ø1t)0o 0n 	&eooi&ooaflit8 CTtaSOS mo&o3 om400 mj1oS mw1aoo1 



ocn& eo 0ThCnJ&)d nfl)0 OnJ001(fl)(U)10 (Th0'r5)0o 630 flThQnJ&&J 	t 
LnJcODOo 6301  OGmDo (mcflcuS 	oaencm cømac> o1oi1c8 

(g) 	 $ct (5)-Do QnJ0Jcthn LnJa000 Ctlt10)o 

ml(80obo ni1cwa<m QUBJOUMUMS omcnlm 1&oocutu,njaaio, mmmno mnlcn)(a1a6)ocu)1 
01&6)SJ1OS 	sa 	mo8a6 06fl0o ibfiu 	w1a0?i1&4 emafl eo 
nflcU08 6ThJ)0flJ1(TT)0)o Th36)0 	630 (TbCnJ&M LDIJ (3c0 	LnJ&000 6301 
OGIBDo oimjlc08 S 00€9@6m1cn, noo o1ofloS 

7. mjieiicu3 o 6aeoo&n msnJ1taaio— Mn  aneç Lnia000 630 
mj1J1m 0)1000m@zs63ocniouZ 63ffn00 1bJ1(U (?D3tJ)ithDOlcOG)lo 06TT0o 

(m3W10(016)10 (0)06)9 nJO(fl)Cfl) &00163136)@ (Tto6flJ(1W1, 1908-6)OJ (minfloS msusl 

oi1ocnJofl1( (1908-60 5-00 C&,.Cfl cmco) LnJ00o eo flJ0Jo000o flflaJOO6fl) 
6)Ja(nJ3U 6301 Cn)1OJ1OS aosofl)1o$ C,l&,1jo)oQ) LO(b 	((TbGO) 
umw1oona3 6roo5101aØnom, 	oath- 

(nw) in- oam6onuZ n 0000(M(0)1(n10 fl 	owlao1nmuflcn10 (Th)0JO?ç\ 

(mu) mmnj1co8 OJOBICSOUgo th1oa© @cnowcmaccno oonx0)1th 
YOq6fl&fl 	J&€xo 

(cml) 	 &06)çjS00J(m c96)m)al010 &006T30 

8. ool.— (1) (0Gmoo cgrb1o3 wnwl&oth1, 

(nm) rnlo&<m onowcrunci8, 	$lotoo 	ml 	uow S0(Mn)106)(v) 
•acmnJcno mo8amoflo8 nflj 0u090mlmofl 	Qm'mml)o(uz, omoo 
(m3Wla30la4 	32J2i 	S(Og Q(5ITh0)J1QJ1, S0061fl61fl3&3 Olin oleaom, 

mlma<m onowmnm000a (ilflGTUOnjc(0fl(03 &,0)0(0Th(0)o (Th(0fl0o O1nJ0114 4 ,Qfl)30Q) 	llw a0c0)0)J1crflO)Q6fl5. 

(Gnu) mlm paopomlonB cJtn)numo 	03ae1cyn(m108 &3030)02)Oto 

mlo,ocnfl ariml3cu8, OGmOo &0cjl08 (9ThW16001€06 Q00I 

6301 	01IOJP1, ao(DGM6ML(a QJ1OJO1 6)&)oGnL ml©am 	oumtmtjoo5 
0)000to OJOWS1m, 630000 an10 6301 010m0I0)105 (ll3C(3nJ(th OlnJD 
mlooelcoS (m3(m1ec (m,6)a, (me 'ofloo onJfl8 a,ao3(mom) Sol J9 
sl0nfl)0)06ry: 

n)cn)o0, (OmCmmOo 6301 U01aJ 	10 	1 (01010)1 CD1(0)a(m QW3100MICM 
ocn1ouom1o% nJ000J0fl 6301 (ObflJ(flJbo (0(OStha6flmDGfl5. 

(2) omloucmo W1,aMlffoOGMO t 	aoo6mo1ç36xm 6-00 

(3)-no t1c4kn& nJns,mmloltoe1nt nlu3ilkm a 0coinJolwla1glmZ mj1aloZ 
CU 10103(0 s1)1crn(mlo8 emoo mj19 mbwla,00l ni1hj nu(Dl0)10)cn5 omn3oo 

cm10 (obwla)oml a6)6nmmCuewo, m nnoimla5, 0063i301 0S 



KI 
pcaTo)ooJnJw1, a3t6m633u3 	 61CM00 mçjlo mw1o&ac 

mb6Stim onIcDSlai8 a,Otimwo mb'3flflOo ø2nflfl8 ad ocarthmtho© Sm1 ablcew 

aJ()3flTfl(D)OGfl) 	 - 

,4)(mn(S, 	Tb(ø)øO a .mg (Th1I8&1 	 Tfl(m1Cflfl)J 63(T000 

(mbuulaoo1e6% 	omo% rannJoo 6301 mmoJcn)oo  I  cnco80a6n9(0o6n%. 

(3) MIOJaKM LDWSOMMMUMO, ecmoo m7103 cumwlaDobcn)o ocui)a 

aoosmailçoa LD IJ misç inia000 cmaqrxnmfla5 na,osoIm 	cøejce,u. 

£QJnDl&Q1CtThTh1ø8 flJ1ai 	T)1(ffOfl (bGmoo mno8 cmw1ao($1a6 a6nJo(a) 

c nQSl08, nou3eocx1eo, (mct)OU&O6) 6flJOW&,03) 	 61T3& LnJ&,300 

camswe msfljsla6 ozJnJo(8ub eJooJ1cmc?no6n5. 

Q(WMoflLMJDMXMMI(l~8 4spo) nsns1auLa6 (fl)oO&M6fl)O.— 'D 

10a1Ao8 96MMMMA59@2  436)M&IPJjo aJo LnJa30CQD QCOTD)23. nJlobJocnxmmlcoS 

eihco 'kSIQJO?TZ aq(m1iQ(mo 	n 0)SlQJlo  &O0o Cfl)o6flJflW1 

n6th010 @05JOUMIDGM nQjth<D)1PJO ana(flO 4C5ltO'Dfl Q)o6x6o; CMj0k0OMGW 

GthJO32na1cEflO azmeej18 	cn1aunsnJs1aco m11o86)CJ• 

ntl(AuS caosofla6)s gsmw1ao&Lei nflQjca— 	m34ç LnJaOco 

O6)jS1CtflaJ n36)D)a1QJlo pmmmcJ cfl)oGflJCflDlaJ nj6)0)1eJo fliOJ100(o3, 

6nieWC1)O 091  msn410o'o 006)mom mlnThuS aaOSM1010 cti&cnmnxü16)0)esl 

&eonZ ios1ejocmnnmoanOMOMMIMIM  OO6)M)O (0g QZMCDQJ10, 'n miaç 

cniaooas1 mj1o3 nSl çjo@o aanno oaJcgnJoa nos1 dauImaom5 . 

11J6m3u8 26moa00cn1 	cgmwlaOcbo.—(1) mth&eo01n5, ucn4 

M6raOnJCfloOJ4l, 	D T,a16YeJ nJrucru1Daa3 msj1eJoao Do)1mo$1 1,jaT3cs8t 

$6mooQonJlcm(mom. 

(2) LDIJ mc 	nja000 So&qcm nxtoco1 2JanJlo, rmwcito&e1© 

U)1O)OtnBo, aP1n1xThan1wo, (n1at@ ntanzm leJ3cEJltlaolccmocJ8, n 

cnJ36)a eo cruancncmm1oao curboçJaW 	son (D6TT99 ntarn6m31a 

njmo0j1cm ut.& ,j<,1m019 rinnowacavu& 	aomo, mmnjaboo iS 

n$05 ntoammmi1coZ 	elcrnlanlo cm, (nnammaQo 	osrniont (PaeQfll@ 

(DCO c0nJffuocn1ao1(Tncn1cna1cm, (fl13flCfl)@ &.Jffcmpm a (CT)1(8 n436)(m&QJ10 

tlnJC€Go oJ0jMM1,%QOO o06)çpl(u8 C9, 	oanc1QçJm5 m1o1øocn1e1aao, 

ffflnJôto, (lj iim1th (tTmcfllCT)lCOtn%1o, Th(Th( 	(tOoW(U)lanJOE)EJ, mLrdaO0o 

0csn63js1vflY cblnJC&5i108 °L° 	 1tt8 

cSOGñThOO1 ln106fl 	 erncm1oa1(m1; n4)fl1)101fltOQJ0,' 

nLd1 	A 	1J10 m2dn6Js1ivaeJ3 ooaàaejo, im, nJ5(jtjaoOo 	CT)I 

QD)0)1 	nO(58,1eJ10 TUoWM)I GY 	(fl)3W)cD)&6 SoWo nJ000Th ctflw(r108 

ciflt1cQ6mmo6rt. 



12. 	61i13(Ja (fllcOQo 	cmalqg@ mowieomo.—(i) 

OJQJThD&U8 cn5çj3aøm)co)1co 46)OTh&eJo Q6)flJn1ai6313U3 Q&no&crnnJaaio, 

CTU&000ttfln5, mtmqhu nJnt1coscayou) 	 jpjo, cuymoo 

mlaeo 6aJ((m(Ø)1n5, m flU QIZICth ()6qT3Ua6 C(O(fl)CThm)o, LyD m&91cno 

1nM1&1c896MOM152M Jg63u3a6cx fiflon 	 ym eoOn1o, 
(TU(13(8@o 	 øsOCUfl1)U)O6fl5: 

ng)cmo* On cm!.aq16i LnJ000® (z)10u)1 m1mma e6m 	wmm1mcubwo 
(BD 	Q)OQø)3ø QcOT)(OflJo LDT flJt8j1flO1W1C8 	osSLeenjoaS 

nJoss_)e6d. 

(2) (1)-oo 	 pJ&OøoaJflQnjSflhiJ 6OCOO (ö1ThøflJo, Th3(m . 

aiflco)maojwo mlwagn)s a3cnJooa, nc€aesmcmocn5. 

aomng ailniwmo 

	

ø3mi1flflcmuw)1@c (Tho(njcUI)la,ojo 	o 	 oowGxvm) ffocruo1cb 

n3mxncom1cñ n\xth@oGn)o (gib amoaflJaa11cmQom5. nj690mcim10 aicn LnJWOQ) 

neJsa6at3oGn5 	mø1oc cncoocmo 	or1cu1mnjo QMMMO mcgaejo. 

JrflflØ3 am)oJmnoanoaeo cmn1e16njcru)o as(thca8 	e%Jsctm2ancaflcn? 
cnaø)lejsm1(noanJ6n1 øCfl)3o aao 	O6YT) &Ø1nL8ftbGrfl 

UOThQ0S mauoocncn)1ci$ MMAMao m&xm Q&(O@ at&&eo8, nJ'DOQOJ&,OOb 
ian1e mspcs 	 asoem socmm18 cnmoocm Qoomu 

flcu)1mcoJerg1 2005-00 CIJ1QJØOQJ&,00b (UIcO, (2005-6)0 22-0o Q&,fl3 

c cvm)1eJo S. 

njvtm000s 	sc4c9 nejnjnnjo 	 nhcu)njocw nJølnt)D(b 
cmm105 ninjcnxo 	cm©1mo m1uJ1, 	 wla1as8 .omnu&o4 
aatnlmo 	 nx&aooth 1cunaeoeo anoxö cfl nimpum oøuna8 4 QWQOfl1th@3Qflt(U)1(PoaflJErS1, (fl)d&G)O(8 n16)c cn1oa1a nj&njo,s 

3WØO$1, 	3UVlm6013u3,06 (lt(8c8006 1njma@0&o mmnJw6)s SiMM0@0S2W  

Baeo asmauBC8@10 cicnJflocoeo m1ønjorie,q3a0 

ntiwcnfl SaM6MC@09 wuImøo njocts1 nJofl nflwm1cu8, eo cn)oflflwomo 
mm njwl 	oa@cur&onJ] w mimløS, sø m1aaio Q6T1OthQ OJOC) ))m o all aJ; 
cthS36R),)Jø3fl)1 	 T 	ob6aT36)o O)1 	On 

nmnb,cn 	8,01 	mnixo as owas3J000&enmm1mo e(D a)10 

0J0003 aa) 	(TO(8&Q3& inl€tb36ioeth. 

m18i1Ms m1aQmUa0o6no Oj'1 samm (It 1na1&6)QcO&3,9Ocffi1 
1&ogaua, nJøa1om 	n1oqoS, aorain8 ao&nnsuB, monwun pi  

zøsm cmda5lndlaOqg.%U3, ni1sau80 as 	&e2Ja G)QflJflScth1 

	

OJO@c& a3meainB, njot3aajoc3 	 laaenS açjo8, sxmowlcu8 
enjmkaascmojo8 oajo8 	s6mllanj anioeJ2 	nnJ3acn)nim6m3aa, m18&s 



7 

(fl1(Ufl)1fl8&W1mS r1J1QmonJcno QSJI (Ymur Q 0,~q ; 0J(0gMZ) ; M005 (TD(8.D6)06 

61003 ccltnMnoio mm8a2mvfl6 oo mi01w1m1Qii51 

ammocn5. Qce0cncr106 (mboJO20s ac8cuw)nJs ntJ8 nJoQJ1oQfl1)dB1ejo dflCT5)3nJ(D0 

(flOTD)tOo GC11JQXT%130 OYDMOO)SIM OVOWOOilmao mmco,1ejo 

(mbnJd AWWSd,9Q3n3 snjowmiMoé,ommoth: 	 e1ei1 

mb&eflmo ffl rn €aflm8 ojojntin 	 0cmgnmau8o5 amiicno 

anSej a3V)3QXTto 	0U0W100(fl)(Ufl(fl CI&iInS uASO Cfl1&236ff)o 	sBQSCfl). 

,

4. a sjo€ruro eJacul3o8 aioaoJçmw)ln Qau1o 0)D6Tfl 

'n•cnJ1m8. 

wmà0m6w3aa0006no 

	

D mfl(u& m10 o&eaQDo t 	acuim1m8 eaomnJo1d6w0 e.i013m3 

(n)oCTUOO(T) 	floxn1w1$1m8 m1cmo ww (mool mmu,la aJeInIo €noanThmçj. 

12oswm) m'kinThSaQoGmowlaoOo (TUo6flJthD1 

(W$63ç LD()1 	QJ0(TT) cm1acm1, wcroq nfleaaorLjmo cwcl, mlo!uoJ1 

aopioa8 (n)(8&eoe16)m Bowja0oBMSj0Ma MOQ8 6nflçJl6)eJ 1-Do oim5nno 2-00 2nJ 

QJ6ItD0 	06aoob1ceean. 

n4)JD Tut8thQD3 cmag jemujo, 0Jc6nj amwoaftump 	Ub(ThJWo 

S
0mm) mno 	ut)16)clxo m1oDwlnt1m mlao 	10cncWo, 

a%&um1aei&Q0fl$1, miirucS 0n080a61"M;m acn)nJm6acf8, o1am ansowcthtcQo&. 

63Cm00 m410$ nmwlaDml, 06moo (m%flm8 cmtwla,nal, mb!ulm 	nJm1(5) c4)(TdlflJ 

dfisQmDnicno 03JCTT)(m1O5 cQnw1a30ejscDTa)cm(th1o5 ErthçJlG)el 3-Do cuGm(wo 

eaos)i paguold)eIang . 

ecmoo imj1m8 mw1aooi 	s onnJoea mb1mS nJD0)08 0aJUJ<TT) 

(ml(nlm 01()1 	 ecrnm)1cnom% w mlmam nCl(fl) 	 6)Cfl)tD)1Cflo 

m)(8€00301$(fl ffitWlaDO 	S0TU)QJDO8 6nflQ4leeJ 6-Go 6u!6n5flJ.)o (0-Do 	JQJ6TTSCW0 

@az6rg paqudlae ~"2 . 

mmoo vnqjlm8 	1aocthes 0n&.JDSa, mrjo8 nnxu8 6)nJt(fl) 

uia)s (bl(m1 nflaootmi1mo ©1mø nCl(n flaooto1no 

atx&aeom1xn mw1aoo6)s ini3ci cnilçjleei 6-Do QJEfl(Wo (4)-00 niGUGTdOJ.)o 

'>°'°'. ga rpolao2cmI. 



Eli 

igoe-,ej nt1ni18 osnjsl m1oaoto ol cg'i&a (19os-eJ 5-30 aa,cn 

&11ct n$ mw1a&u8a 0t10i1S caoscu1flcZ 	lnaom 

mmw1&oø6m3c4 n4)flt) CnJOE)QJ fl&nO1&Qflj3C6 dM01cCT1) 091&0cD6m3u8 ni8%oe 

CM(MI(6 cn)ct&G)o&em 	 cflj16)ej 7-00 6)J6n5wo (c)l) 

OJ6lJ6115aDO aom 	quo1oom. 

LDj mqd9qI6)PA nsnnaa8  ms 	oac)cm(ti1cnocnfl inu8 f26MO 

mflni at8&ooø1xn cmw13mes rG)nJoc mflç1eo 11-00 QJ6T1%CU)o 6)&36fl 

ci&ç1@ej niscixninou8  nsjleo&qcrrxu$kuS 	1&eio 

fl3&,aflnJo mS mlaøo 6)inm10 miuoai njo s2nfleenmm1a5 

cn)c&000(olem gmw1aomes(rnJocl6 6I1Aç6)eJ 12-00 &stho s)a,osS au 	crn - 

8 n01 	a0(0S6336) (fl)o6flJ0Wt0C6Tfl3 Jg6MW QGTB3&6)3CJCTD6 

cmbeçJa1c8 QfleEr)DaJ0D6!3C3 QøT)O0Jt6Q3 nJO 	SflJ1&QDflJOThd5 (bQ1 (flSnJl 

Laa6n3o6 Oo60D1q1Jo olDWDoEYflazD SOGTIThJOcIW m 

OJDo 	 2301(fl)2, aJ56T3(J, cm301 	O&6)11(nccThnaJoJo, 	OnJa& 

CD1CIt9CW6)S crua aur,3w(ndoQ afiawcnjojzom5. 

1il Qa3S(D) cnloflflThSnoemDwla,30o 63(DI otowooem 

QaQioZ n106r1 

4 


