REPORT OF THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE
ON
THE KERALA STATE RIGHT TO SERVICE BILL, 2012
AND
THE BILL AS REPORTED BY THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE

s

1048/2012.



THE KERALA STATE RIGHT TO SERVICE BILL, 2012

(Report of the Subject Committee)

Subject Committee XIV—Home Affairs to which the Kerala State Right to
Service Bill, 2012 was referred, considered the Bilt clausc by clause and now
submits this report with the Bill as reported by the Committee annexed thereto.

2. The Kerala State Right to Service Bill, 2012 was published as Gazette
Exiraordinary dated June 15, 2012, The Bill was introduced in the Assembly on
July 23, 2012 and was referred to the Committee on the same day.

3. The Committee considered the Bill clause by clause at its meeting held
on July 23, 2012 and the Committee recommends to adopt the Bill without any
modification.

4, The Minutes of dissent is appended.

OOMMEN CHANDY,
Chairman,
Subject Commitiee XIV.



MINUTES OF DISSENT

We record the following minutes of dissent to the Kerala State Right to
Service Bill, 2012:

1. The failure on time bound delivery of basic needs of citizens like
drinking water, food, accommodation, medical facilitics, education, power, etc.
tantamount to nullify the programme/project. The benefit of Five Year Plan/
Annual Plan should not be failed to disseminate to the target group owing to
failure either of the employees or of the Government. The Government shoutd
also ensure that only those programmes are launched for which provision is
made in the budget and can be spent during the year. Hollow declarations
should be avoided. The Government and the employees have complementary
responsibility to implement the programmes/schemes and they should fulfil] their
responsibilities. There is no enabling provision in this Bill to ensure the said
goal.

2. This Bill is bestowing excessive powers to the executive for dclegated
legislation, rendering the Bill to the inoperative if the rule making process is
delayed or omitted. That be so, time limits should have been prescribed for each
item of such rule making.

3. Many departments of the Government have already issued Citizen
Charters prescribing time limits for the various services rendered by them. These
Charters will be rendered ineffective if no protection clausc is incorporated in
this Bill.

4. Long pendency of files before the Government Secretaniat and various
other offices is a curse of our State. The best opportunity to address this
problem is being left unavailed, by not incorporating adequate stipulations
thereto in this Bill.

Kobprverl BaLakrisunan, M.LLA. (8d)
C. DivakaraN, M.L.A. (Sd.)
MaTHEW T. Tuomas, M. L.A. (8d.)
K. Suresn Kurup, M.L.A. (8d.)



THE KERALA STATE RIGHT TO SERVICE BILL, 2012
(As reported by the Subject Commitiee)
A
BILL

to provide for the delivery of services to the general public within the
stipulated time limit and for matters connected therewith and incidental
thereto.

Preamble.—WHEREAs, it is expedient to provide for the delivery of services
to the general public within the stipulated time limit ;

BE it enacted in the Sixty-third Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Kerata
State Right to Service Act, 2012,

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Government may, by
notification in the Gazette, appoint.

2. Definitions.—In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires,—

(a) “designated officer” means an officer designated as such under
section 3 for providing the services as per the provisions of this Act;

(b) “eligible person” means a person who is eligible for the services
notified under section 3;

(c) “first appellate authority” means an officer notified as such under
section 3 ;

(d) “Government” means the Government of Kerala ;
(e) “prescribed” means prescribed by rules made under this Act ;

(f) “night to service” means the right of an eligible person to obtain a
service within the stipulated time limit ;

(g) “service” means any service to be provided under the provisions of.
any law for the time being in force or as per Government orders issued from time
to time, to the general public by or under any Department of the Government or
by a Local Self Government Institution or by a State Public Sector Undertakmg
or by a Statutory Body, as may be notified under section 3;



2

(h) “second appellate authority” means an officer notified as such
under section 3 ; ‘

(i) “stipulated time limit” means the maximum time limit notified
under section 3 to provide the service by the designated officer or to dispose of an
application for such service;

3. Power to notify services, stipulated time limit, designated officer etc—
Save as otherwise provided in any other law for the time being in force, every
Department of the Government, every head of Department, every Local Self
Government Institution and every statutory body shall within six months of the
commencement of this Act, notify in the Gazette the services that will be rendered
by each of them, the designated officers the first appellate authority and the
second appellate authority and the stipulated time limit for the purposes of this
Act.

4. Right to obtain services—Every eligible person shall have the right to.. -

obtain the services notified under section 3 within the stipulated time limit.

5. Duty of the designated officer—(1) The designated officer shall on
receipt of an application for service by an eligible person, without prejudice to the
provisions of any law for the time being in force, provide the service or reject the
application within the stipulated time limit. In case of rejection, he shall state the
reasons for the same in writing and shall intimate it to the applicant forthwith.

(2) An application received under sub-section (1) shall be duly
acknowledged by the designated officer or by the officer authorised by him to
receive such application.

(3) The stipulated time limit shall start from the date on which the
application is received.

6. Appeal—{l) Any person, who does not receive the required service
within the stipulated time or whose application is rejected under sub-section (1) of
section 5, may file an appeal to the first appellate authority, within thirty days
from the date of rejection of the application or on the expiry of the stipulated
time limit, in such manner and on payment of such fee, as may be prescribed:

Provided that the first appellate authority may admit the appeal afier the
expiry of the period of thirty days if the authority is satisfied that the appellant
had sufficient cause for not filing the appeal in time.

(2) The first appellate authority may direct the designated officer to
provide the service within a specified period or may reject the appeal.

T



3

(3) An appeal under sub-section (1) shall be disposed of within a period
equivalent to that of the stipulated time limit.

(4) Any person aggrieved by a decision of the first appellate authority
may prefer an appeal to the second appellate authority within sixty days from
the date of decision of the first appcllate authority, in such manner and on
payment of such fee, as may be prescribed :

Provided that the second appellate authority may admit the appcal after the
expiry of the period of sixty days if that authority is satisfied that the appellant
had sufficient cause for not filing the appeal in time.

(5) The sccond appellate authority may direct the designated officer
to provide the service within a specified period or he may reject the appeal.

(6) Where the second appellate authority finds that there is no sufficient
reason for not giving the service within the stipulated time limit he may, along
with the direction to provide the service, impose penalty as provided in section 8.

(7) An appeal under sub-section (4) shall be disposed of within a period
equivalent to that of the stipulated time limit.

(8) Where the designated officer does not comply with the direction
given by the first appellate authority under sub-section (2) of this section. the
person aggrieved by such non-compliance may file an application directly to the
second appellate authority and such an application shall be disposed of in the same -
manner tn which a second appeal is 1o be disposed of under this Act.

(%) Where the designated officer does not comply with the direction for
providing the service under sub-section (5) of this section, then the person
aggrieved by such non-compliance may file an application directly to the second
appellate authority and such an application shall be disposcd of in the same
manner in which a second appeal is to be disposed of under this Act.

7. Procedure to be followed in appeal—The first appellate authority and
the second appellate authority, while deciding an appeal under this Act, shall have
the same powers as are vested in a civil court while trying a suit under the Code
of Civil Procedure, 1908 (Central Act 5 of 1908) in respect of the following
matters, namely :—

(a) requiring the production and inspection of documents :

(b) issuing summons for hearing the designated officer and the
appellant; and

(c) any other matter which may be prescribed.

1048/2012.



4

8. Penalty—(1) Where the second appellate authority finds that,—

(a) - the designated officer has failed to provide the service without
sufficient and reasonable cause, the second appellate authority may by an order in
writing, stating the reasons, impose a fine on the designated officer which shall
not be less than five hundred rupees and not more than five thousand rupees ;

(b} the designated officer has caused delay in providing the service, the
second appellate authority may, by an order in writing, stating the reasons, impose
a fine on the designated officer, at the rate of two hundred and fifty rupees per
day for each day’s delay the sum of which shall not exceed five thousand rupees :

Provided that the designated officer shall be given a reasonable opportunity
of being heard before imposing such penalty.

{2) Where the second appellate anthority finds that the first appellate
authority has failed to decide the appeal within the time limit specified in
sub-section (3) of section 6 without sufficient and reasonable cause, he may by an
order in writing, stating the reasons, impose a penalty on the first appellate
authority which shall not be less than five hundred rupees and not more than five
thousand rupees :

Provided that the first appellate authority shall be given a reasonable
opportunity of being heard before imposing such penalty.

(3) The second appellate authority may, if he is satisfied that the
designated officer or the first appellate authority has without sufficient cause,
failed to discharge the duties assigned to him under this Act recommend
disciplinary action against him under the service rules applicable to him.

9. Protection of action taken in good faith—No suit, prosecution or other
legal proceeding shall lie against any person or officer for anything which is in
good faith done or intended to be done under this Act or any rule made
thereunder.

10, Bar of jurisdiction of Civil Courts—No civil court shall entertain any
suit, application or other proceeding in respect of any order issued under this Act
and no such order shall be called in question otherwise than by way of an appeal
under this Act. -

11, Power to make rules.—(1) The Government may, by notification in the
Gazette, make rules to carry out the provisions of this Act.

{2) Every rule made under this Act shall be laid, as scon as may be
after it is made, before the Legislative Assembly while it is in session for a total
period of fourteen days which may be comprised in one session or in two
successive sessions, and if, before the expiry of the session in which it is so laid



5

or the session immediately following, the Legislative Assembly makes any
maodification in the rule or decides that the rule should not be made, the rule
shall thereafter have effect only in such modified form or be of no effect, as the
case may be; so however that any such modification or annulment shall be
without prejudice to the validity of anything previously done under that rule.

12.  Power to remove difficulties—(1) Where any difficulty arises giving
effect to the provisions of this Act, the Government may, by order published in
the Gazette, as occasion may require, do anything, which are considered necessary
for them and not inconsistent with the provisions of this Act or the rules made
thereunder, for the purpose of removing such difficulty:

Provided that no such order shall be issued under this section after the expiry
of two years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order issued under sub section (1) shall be laid before the
Legislative Assembly as soon as may be after it is issued.

Secretariat of the Kerala Legislature,
Thiruvananthapuram, P. K. MURALEEDHARAN,
23" July, 2012 Secretary-in-charge.



N .

Regn. No. KERBIL/2012/45073

© .
dated 5-9-2012 with RNI

Government of Kerala
CHhos TUOHHOD
2013

Reg. No. ol maud
KL/TV{N)Y634/2012-14

KERALA GAZETTE
| CHOS NDAVOS
? . EXTRAORDINARY
¥ @RAVOWOIDEMO

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

@R WIBHIB1HDIW (Il |SITINIAN D)

25th November 2013

T HIRUVANANTHAPURAM,
Vol. 11 " MONDAY. ‘ 2013 mouosrud 25 No. 3300
aioelye 2 : 4th Agrahayapa 1935 maud

TOJUMMDMal@o, ©HEnud 1935 arinansme 4

GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
C - Power (C) Debartment
) NOTIFICATION

G 0. (P) No. 48/2013/PD. Dated, Thinwvananthapuram, 16th November, 2013.

S. R. O. No. 922/2013.—In exercise of the powers oonferned by section 3 of the Kerala State
Right to Service Act, 2012 (18 of 2012), the Government of Kerala have notified the services,
rendered to the public, stipulated time limit, designated officer, first appellate authority and second
appellate authority in the Department of Electrical Inspectorate, Kerala State Electricity Board and
the Energy Management Centre, vide notification issued under G O. (P) No. 14/2013/PD, dated
4th April, 2013 and published as S. R. O. No. 281/2013 in the Kerala Gazette Extraordinary
No. 990 dated 4th April, 2013. Now, the Government of Kerala hereby make the following
amendment to the said notification in respect of the details of the designated officers,
first appellate authority and second appellate authority and documents to be attached with
application in respect of the Department of Electrical Inspectorate, specified in the Schedule, namely:—

AMENDMENT

In the Schédule to the said notification for the heading “I DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRICAL
INSPECTORATE” and the entries under it the following heading and entries shall be substituted,
namely:—

33/5441/2013/DTP.

L ™ A L e Ty 1" S




A, _——

—— .

—
i

SCHEDULE

NAME OF DEPARTMENT : DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRICAL INSPECTORATE

A : HEAD OFFICE OF DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRICAL INSPECTORATE

’ L First Second
' Worki D ted
No. Category of Services Documents to be attached with application ornE eenate Appellate | Appellate
: Days Officer . .
_ . Authority | Authority
(1) @) | (3) @ (s) (6) (7
1. Scrutiny, Approval and Inspection of
Electrical Installations
(1) Electrical Scheme Approval " (a) A covering letter.
(b) Authorisation Letter from the client
- authorising the Electrical contractor to carry
out the work, giving brief particulars of the
scheme,
[
{c)  Electrical Schematic drawings. %
. 4
(d} Copy of the Electrical Contractors Licence. @ 8
(1) a: Issue of Non conformity report ()  Original chalan receipt for the remittance of 20 =] :;; é
’ s the Scrutiny Fee remitted in 2 Government i é’ -
Treasury/Friends under the head of account : @2 5 =
. 0043-00-102, , = e §
o =
() Certificate of Soil Resistivity (Required for § é’ 2
HT/EHT Instaliations). 2 Q E
. ey — ©
(g) Fault Level Calculation (Required for HT/ = g =
. EHT Installations) ‘ = C
=)
(h)  Earthing Calculation (Required for HT/EHT Z
i Installations). )
(i) b : Tssue of Approval of Electrical (i) " Bus Duct design (Required for Transformer
Scheme if no non conformity and Generator of rating > .630 KVA). . '
(3}  A/C Calculation (Required only for Centralized
AC Insta]lgti_ons).
’ (k) * Pro forma and Checklist (available at *
Web site : www.ceikerala.gov.in).




-~ LN — ¥
L
(i) c : Issue of Approval of Electrical C ) .
’ ompliance Report after rectift defects. 15
Scheme in the case of (i) a, above P port 2 g
(ii) Issue of Safety Certificate and
Sanction for Energisation.
(ii) a : Issue of Non conformity report (a) Completion report of work
after the inspection ‘
(ii) b : Issue of Safety Certificate and (b) Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the Initial
Sanction for Energisation if no inspection Fee remitted in a Government Treasury/ 10
non conformity. Friends under the head of account : 0043-00-102.
(ii) ¢ : Issue of Safety Certificate and Compliance Report after rectifying defects 3
Sanction for Energisation in the S
case of (ii)a, above. _, 2
2 g
(iii) Inspection and issue of Valuation (a) Request for Valuation 8 .; &a
B . [ N 17
Certificate for Electrical (b) Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the Initial 30 a. g =
instaliations. inspection Fee remitted in a Government Treasury/ 5 2 K
Friends under the head of account : 0043-00-102 b ﬁ ‘B
[+]
5 2 R
Cinema Operator 9 5 t
1 St
(i) : Issue of Fresh Licence of Cinema (a) Request Letter “ 'é 62
Operator (b) Original Hall Tickets of Cinema Operator Written E
. . . . » by
Examination and Practical Examination <
(c) True copy of certificate duly attested by a Gazetted -
Officer to prove Date of birth
(d) Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the fee,
T 250, remitted in a Government Treasury/Friends -
under the head of account ' “0043-00-800-98",
(¢) Two passport size photographs attested by 2 20
Gazetted Officer
() (on the back side, stating that this is the truc
photograph of Shri/Smt..............oooiien )
(g) Two specimen signatures duly attested by a

Gazetted Officer.




) @ ) @) ) © |
(h) Self addressed and stamped envelope of size '
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth ¥ 32)
(ii) Issue of licence in liev of lapsed (a) Duly filled Application form for Cinema
Cinema Operator licence Operator Licence :
(b) Original Lapsed Cinema Operator Licence
() Documents to be forwarded along with the
application
(d) Original chalan receipt for the remittance of
the fee** ¥ 250 remitted in a Government
Treasury or in Friends under the head of
account “0043-00-800-98”. 20 =
(e) Two passport size photographs attested by fé‘
a Gazetted Officer Z2 5
(f)  (on the back side, stating that this is the 8 = D
. 0 LG £
: true photograph of Shri/Smt...............) g = =
. . ' a Q -
(g) Two specimen signatures duly attested by = i G
a Gazetted Officer E E g
o L
(h) Self addressed and stamped envelope of 8- = g
size 20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth T 32). -E” ,L_.:’ e
2
(iii) Issue of duplicate Licence of (a}) Duly filled Application form for Duplicate .5 5
Cinema Operator ~Cinema Operator Licence . 'g
’ (b) Original chalan receipt for the remittance <
of the fee** T 100 for Licence or T 100
for certificate remitted in a Government
Treasury or in Friends under the head of .
account *0043-00-800-99”,
(¢} Two passport size photographs attested by
a Gazetted Officer ' 20
€
(d) (on the back side, stating that this is the
true photograph of Shri/Smt.................. )
(e) Two specimen signatures duly attesied by
a Gazetted Officer ' 7
" () Self addressed and stamped envelope of

size 20 cm x 14 ¢m (Stamps worth T 32)

- .




-

(2)

(h)
()

Certification by the applicant of the loss
or damage, mutilation or defacement of the
original Licence attested by a Gazetted
Officer.

Copy of the prescribed notice published

in the daily news paper approved by PRD.

Certificate from the Electrical Inspector/
Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector, District
office with details of renewal of permit
and Permit Valid up to date

Electrical Wireman

(i} lIssue of Electrical Wireman
Permit and Competency
Certificates under exempted
category '

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

(e

(f
(&)

Duly filled Application form for Electrical
Wireman Permit (Application form available
at Website : www.ceikerala.gov.in)

True copy of certificates duly attested by
a Gazetted Officer to prove Date of birth,
Qualifications

True copy of Trade Certificate should be
attested by a Gazetted Officer in the
Department of Electrical Inspectorate
Original chalan receipt for the remittance
of the fee, T 1000 **, remitted in a
Government Treasury/Friends under the
head of account “0043-00-800-99".

Two passport size photographs attested
by a Gazetted Officer (on the back side,
stating that this is the true photograph
of Shri/fSmt..................ll)
Two specimen signatures duly attested by
a QGazetted Officer.

Self addressed and stamped envelope of
size 20 em x 14 cm (Stamps worth T 32)

30

(ii) Issue of Electrical Wireman
permit and Competency Certificates
for' successful candidate in
written and practical examination

(a)
(b)

Request letter

Original Hall Tickets of Electrical
Wireman Written Examination and
Practical Examination

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector
(Secretary, Kerala State Electricity Licensing Board)

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector




)

(2

3)

4

)

(6)

(7D

- ©

(d)

(e)

®

(&

True copy of certificate duly attested by a
Gazetted Officer. to prove Date of birth
Original chalan receipt for the remittance
of the fee, T 500**, remitted in a
Government Treasury/Friends under the head
of account “0043-00-800-99"

Two passport size photographs attested by a
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating
that this is the true photograph o
Shri/Smt.............. ) :
Two specimen signatures duly attested by

a Gazetted Officer. .

Self addressed and stamped envelope of
size 20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth Rs. 32)

40

(iii) Issue of Electrical Wireman
Permit in lieu of lapsed Permit

(a)

(b
(c}

(@

(e)
¢y

Duly filled Application form for Electrical
Wireman Permit (Application form available
from Web site : ceikerala.gov.in )

Original Lapsed Electrical Wireman Permit
Original chalan receipt for the remittance
of the fee** ¥ 700 remitted in a
Government Treasury or in Friends under .
the head of account “0043-00-800-99”.

Two passport size photographs attested by a

Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that
this is the true photograph of Shri/Smt.......)
Two specimen signatures duly attested by a
Gazetted Officer.

Self addressed and stamped eavelope of size
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth T 32)

15

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector
(Secretary, Kerala State Electricity Licensing Board)

(iv) Issue of Duplicate Electrical
Wireman

(a)
(b)

Duly filled Application form for Duplicate
Electrical Wireman permit

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of
he fee** T 300 remitted in a Government
Treasury or in Friends under the head of
account “0043-00-800-99”, ‘

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Flectrical Inspector




.

(c)

(d)
(e)

(D

(&)
(h)

Two passport size photographs attested by
a Gazetted Officer {on the back side, stating
that this is the true photograph of
ShrifSmt.......cccooenniinl))

Two specimen signatures duly attested by
a Gazetted Officer

Self addressed and stamped envelope of
size 20 cm x 14 cm ( Stamps worth T 32)

Certification by the applicant of the loss
or damage, mutilation or defacement of the
original permit attested by a Gazetted Officer.

Copy of the prescribed notice published in
the daily news paper approved by PRD

Certificate from the Electrical Inspector/
Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector, District
office with details of renewal of licence

15

Electrical Supervisor— B Grade

(i) Issue of Electrical Supervisor—
B Grade Permit and Competency
Certificates under exempted
category

(a)
(v

(c)

(d)

()

Request letter

The original chalan Receipt of remittance
in a Govt. Treasury/Janasevanakendram for
T 1000 (Head of Account :

0043-00-800-99)

Two Copies of Passport size Photograph.
(Attested by a Gazetted Officer only on the
backside of the photo)

Two signatures of the applicant. (Attested by a
Gazetted Officer)

Self Addressed Stamped envelop for T 32
Envetope of size 20 cm x 14 cm

20

(ii) Issue of Electrical Supervisor—
B Grade permit and Competency
Certificates for successful candidate
in written and practical examination

6
(&)

(h)
@)

Request letter

Original Hall Tickets of Electrical Supervisor
Written Exarnination and Practical Examination
True copy of certificate duly attested by a
Gazetted Officer to prove Date of birth
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of
the fee, T 1000 **, remitted in a Government
Treasury/Friends under the head of account
* 0043-00-800-99"

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector
(Secretary, Kerala state Electricity Licensing Board)

Additional Chief Electricai Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector




(1) (2) (3) 4) (3) (6) (7
(i) Two passport size photographs attested by a .
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that 20
this is the true photograph of Shri/Smt.. )
(k) _ Two specimen signatures duly attested by a
Gazetted Officer _
() Self addressed and stamped envelope of size
© 20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth T 32)
(m) Original Electrical Wireman permit, Competency
Certificate '
(n)  Original Electrical Contractor C Class Licence =
. 2]
" (iii) Renewal of Electrical Supervisor— (a) Duly filled Application form for Renewal of A
B Grade Permit . Electrical Supervisor ; - fgf =
(b) Original Electrical Supervisor Permit s a:"’) el
(c} Documents to be forwarded along with the §§ 5 8
application = > — 2
{d) Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 20 GG 8 %
fee** T 500 + (Late fee : T 250) remitted in a g E B =
. . . S 7} =
Government Treasury or in Friends under the 2 = ot 2
‘head of account “0043-00-800-99™, " P N a
(e) Self addressed and stamped envelope of size 2 3 g =
© 20 cm x 14 cm { Stamps worth T 32) O - T
S 2 5
L)
 (iv) Issue of Electrical Supervisor— (a) Duly filled Application form for Electrical E M g
B Grade Permit in licu of lapsed Supervisor Eﬂ‘ '2
Permit. (b) Original Lapsed Electrical Superisor Perm1t T
(c)  Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 2
: fee** ¥ 1300 remitted in a Government <
. Treasury or in Friends under the head of account
“0043--060-800-99"
(d) Two passport size photographs attested by a 20
Gazetted Officer(on the back side; stating that
this is the true photograph of Shri/Smt...........)
(e} Two specimen signatures duly attested by a
Gazetted Officer
(D  Self addressed and stamped envelope of size .

.20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth ¥ 32)




(v) Issue of Duplicate Electrical (a) Duly filled Application form for Duplicate
Supervisor—B Grade Electrical Supervisor permit
(b) Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** T 500 remitted in a Government Treasury
or in Friends under the head of account
“0043-00-800-99"".
(c) Two passport size photographs attested by a
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that
this is the true photograph of Shri/Smt............)
(d) Two specimen signatures duly attested by a
Gazetted Officer.
{e) Self addressed and stamped envelope of size 20
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth T 32)
()  Certification by the applicant of the loss or damage,
mutilation or defacement of the original permit
" attested by a Gazetted Officer.
(g) Copy of the prescribed notice published in the
daily news paper approved by PRD attested by a
Gazetted Officer.
(h) Attested copy of Competency Certificate
51 Electrical Supervisor—A Grade
(i) Issue of Electrical Supervisor— (a) Request letter
A Grade permit'and Competency {b) The original Chalan Receipt of remittance in a
Certificate under exempted category— Government Treasury/Janasevanakendram for
after the approval of Kerala State 7 2000 (Head of Account : 0043-00-800-99)
Electricity Licensing Board « . . (¢) Two Copies of Passport size Photograph.
(Attested by a Gazetted Officer only on the
backside of the photo)
(d) Two signatures of the applicant. (Attested by a 30
Gazetted Officer)
(¢) Self Addressed Stamped envelope for ¥ 32.
Envelope of size 20 ¢m x 14 cm
(i) Renewal of Electrical Supervisor— (a) Duly filled Application form for Renewal of Electrical
A Grade Permit after renewal Supervisor
(b) Original Electrical Supervisor Permit
(c) Documents to be forwarded along with the

application

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector
(Secretary, Kerala State Electricity Licensing Board)

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

33/5441/2013/DTP.




(1)

(2)

()

(4)

(3)

(6)

(N

(d)

(e)

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** Rs.1,000 (Late fee : T 500) remitted

. in a Govt Treasury or in Friends under the head
- of account “ 0043-00-800-99”.

Sclf addressed and stamped envelope of size
20 ¢cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth T 32)

20

(iii) Issue of Electrical Supervisor—
A Grade Permit in lien of lapsed
Permit

(a)

(b)
(c)

(d)

(e)
®

" Duly filled Application form for Electrical

Supervisor
Original Lapsed Electrical Supervisor Permit

Original chalan rece‘ipf-for the remittance of the
fee** T 2,500 remitted in a Govermnment Treasury
or in Friends under the head of account
“0043-00-800-99”,

Two passport size photographs attested by a
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, staiing that this
is the true photograph of Shri/Smt. ............... )
Two specimen signatures duly attested by a Gazetted
Officer.

Self addressed and stamped envelope of size
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth ¥ 32)

30

(iv) Issue of Duplicate Electrical
Supervisor—A Grade Permit .

(a)
®)
(©

(d)
()

Duly filled Application form for Duplicate
Electrical Supervisor permit
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the

fee** T 1,000 remitted in-2'Government Treasury

or in Friend sunder the head of account
“0043-00-800-99”,

- Two passport size photographs attested by a

Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that
this is the true photograph of Shri/Smt........... )
Two specimen signatures duly attested by a
Gazetted Officer.

Self addressed and stamped envelope of size
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth T 32)

20

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector
(Secretary, Kerala State Electricity Licensing Board)

Additional Chief Electricil Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

01



.

®

(®

Certification by the applicant of “the loss or
damage, mutilation or defacement of the original
permit attested by a Gazetted Officer. \
Copy of the prescribed notice published in the
daily news paper approved by PRD.

Electrical Contractor—Class ‘A’

(i} Issue of Electrical Contractor—
Class ‘A’ Fresh Licence after the
approval of Kerala State Electricity

Licensing Board

R

(a)

(b)

(c)
(d)

(c)

0

(&

(h)

(@

)

Duly filled Application form for Electrical
Contractor Class A Licence (Application form
available from Web site : www.ceikerala.gov.in)

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of
the fee** remitted in a Government Treasury
or in Friends under the head of account
“0043-00-800-99".

Original Test and Calibration Certificates of
Instruments (validity does not exceed six months)
Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does

not exceed six months) .

Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor (attested by
the officer from District Office of the Department
of Electrical Inspectorate)

Original Electrical Wireman/Supervisor permit
(for the enrollment of Wireman/Supervisor)
Bank Guarantee for ¥ 10,000 and ¥ 25,000
for HT and EHT installations respectively

(for minimum period of 3 years)

Seif addressed and stamped envelope of A4 size

_(Stamps worth T 80)

Two passport size photographs attested by a
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that
this is the true photograph of Shri/Smt........)
Two specimen signatures duly attested by a
Gazetted Officer.

30

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector
(Secretary, Kerala State Electricity Licensing Board)

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

1



(D

2}

3)

@)

(5)

(6)

(7

(k)
)

(m)

Certificate of ownership/undertaking of workshop
(fabricating unit)/Office ‘

A List containing the data of the Electrical
Installation works undertaken successfully and
Hard Copies of the Letter of Approval of Electrical
scheme o

Approved drawings, Letter of Sanction for
Energisation of installations

(ii) Renewal—Electrical Contractor—
- Class A’ Licence

(a)

(b)
(c)

(@)
(e).
&)

(8

(b

)

®

Duly filled Application form for renewal of
Electrical Contractor Class A Licence

Original Electrical Contractor Class A Licence
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** ¥ 5,000 remitted in a Government
Treasury or in Friends under the head of account
*0043-00-800-99" .

Original Test/Calibration Certificates of Instruments
(validity does not exceed six months)
Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does
not exceed six months) '

Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor (attested from
District Office.of the Department of Electrical
Inspectorate)

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of
the fee** ¥ 200 remitted in a Government
Treasury or in Friends under the head of account
“0042-00-800-99” for the new enrollment of
Wireman/Supervisor (**per Wireman/Supervisor)
Original Electrical Wireman/Supervisor permit
(for the new enroliment of Wireman/Supervisor)
Bank Guarantee for ¥ 10,000 and T 25,000
for HT and EHT installations respectively

Self addressed and stamped envelope of A4 size
(Stamps worth T 80)

20

(iii) Issue of licence in lieu of iapsed
Electrical Contractor Class ‘A’
Licence

(a)

Duly filled Application form for Electrical
Contractor Class A Licence (Application form
available from Website : www.ceikerala.gov.in)

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector
(Secretary, Kerala State Electricity Licensing Board)

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

- Cl



®)

(d)
(e)
{0

(&)
(h)

Original Electrical Contractor Class A Licence
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** T 7,000 remitted in a Government
Treasury or in Friends under the head of account
“0043-00-800-99".

Original Test/Calibration Certificates of [nstruments
(validity does not exceed six months)
Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does
not exceed six months)

Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor {attested from
District Office of the Department of Electrical
Inspectorate)

Bank Guarantee for ¥ 10,000 and T 25,000
for HT and EHT installations respectively

Self addressed and stamped envelope of A4 size
(Stamps worth ¥ 80)

20

(iv) Issue of duplicate Electrical
Contractor Class ‘A’ Licence

(a)
(b)

()
(d)
(e)

(f)

(g)

(h).

Duly filled Application form for the duplicate
Electrical Contractor Class A Licence

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of
the fee** ¥ 2,000 remitted in a Government
Treasury or in Friends under the head of account
“0043-00-800-59".

Original Test and Calibration certificates of
[nstruments (validity does not exceed 6 months)
Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does
not exceed six months)

Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor (attested from
District Office of the Department of Electrical
[nspectorate)

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** T 200 remitted in a Government
Treasury or in Friends under the head of account
“0043—-00-800-99” for the new enrollment of
Wireman/Supervisor

Original Electrical Wireman/Supervisor permit
(for the new enrollment of Wireman/Supervisor)
Bank Guarantee for ¥ 10,000 and T 25,000
for HT and EHT installations respectively

30

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector
(Secretary, Kerala State Electricity Licensing Board)

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

el



(1}

(2}

&)

C)

(5)

(6)

(M

]
)

(K
X

(m)

Self addressed and stamped envelope of size
20 cm x 14 ¢m (Stamps worth ¥ 62)

Two passport size photographs attested by a
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that
this is the true photograph of Shri/Smt......... )
Two specimen signatures duly attested by a
Gazetted Officer.

‘Certiﬁca'tion, by the applicant of the loss or -

damage, mutilation or defacement of the original
permit attested by a Gazetted Officer.

Copy of the prescribed notice published in the
daily news paper approved by PRD.

Electrical Contractor—Class ‘B’

(i) Issue of Fresh Electrical

Contractor—Class ‘B’ Licence

(a) .

(b)

(©)

(d) .

(e)

®

(g)

()

()

Duly filled Application form. for Electrical
Contractor Class B Licence

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** remitted in a Government Treasury or in
Friends under the head of account
“0043-00-800-99~

Original Test and Calibration Certificates of
Instruments (validity does not exceed 6 months)
Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does
not exceed six months)

Declaration of ereman/Superwsor (attested by
the officer from the Department of Electrical
Inspectorate)

QOriginal Electrical ereman/Supcrv1sor permit
(for the enrollment of Wireman/Supervisor)
Self addressed and stampcd envelope of size
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth T 62)

Two passport size photographs attested by a
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that
this is the true photograph of Shri/Smt..........)
Two specimen signatures duly attested by a
Gazetted Officer

20

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector
(Secretary, Kerala State Electricity Licensing Board)

+

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector -

14!



@

Inspection reports from the Electrical Inspector/
Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector regarding the
facilities provided (for scope of all LV/MV
installation up to 250 kW and generator up to
250kVA in prescribed format is necessary.)

(ii) Renewal of Electrical Contractor—
Class ‘B’ Licence

@

(b)
(©)

(d)

(e)

®

(2)

(h)

6]

Duly filled Application form for renewal of
Electrical Contractor Class B Licence

Original Electrical Contractor Class B Licence -

Omginal chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** ¥ 2,000 (Late fee : T 500) remitted
in a Govt Treasury or in Friends under the head
of account “0043-00-800-99"

Original Test and Calibration certificates of
Instruments (validity does not exceed 6 months)

Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does
not exceed six months) ‘

Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor (attested by
the officer from District Office of the Department
of Electrical Inspectorate)

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** T 200 remitted in a Government
Treasury or in Friends under the head of account
“0043-00-800-99” for the new enrollment of
Wireman/Supervisor (per Wireman/Supervisor)

Original Electrical Wireman/Supervisor permit
(for the new enrollment of Wireman/Supervisor)

Self addressed and stamped envelope of A4 size
(Stamps worth T 80:)

25

(iii) For the issue of 1 Electrical
Contractor—Class ‘B’ Licence
in lieu of lapsed Licence

(a)

(b}
(0

Duly filled Application formr for Electrical
Contractor Class B Licence (Application form
available from Website : ceikerala.gov.in)
Original Electrical Contractor Class B Licence
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** ¥ 3,500 remitted in a Government

Treasury or in Friends under-the head of account
* 0043-00-800-99".

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector
(Secretary, Kerala State Electricity Licensing Board)

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

Sl



(1

(2)

3

“4)

(%)

(6)

()

(d)

©

®

(g)

Original Test and Calibration certificates of
Instruments (validity does not exceed 6 months)

Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does
not exceed six months)

Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor (attested by
the officer from District Office of the Depariment
of Electrical Inspectorate)

Self addressed and stamped envelope of A4 size
(Starmnps worth T 80.)

20

(iv) For the issue of duplicate
Electrical Contractor Class ‘B’

(a)

(b)

©
(d)
(e)

®

()
(h)

Duly filled Application form for the duplicate

Electrical Contractor Class B Licence
(Application form available from Website :
www.ceikerala.gov.in) .

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** T 1,000 remitted in a Government
Treasury or in Friénds under the head of account
“ 0043-00-800-99". .
Original Test and Calibration certificates of
Instruments (validity does not exceed six months)
Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does
not exceed six months) ]

Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor (attested from

District Office of the Department of Electrical
Inspectorate)

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** T 200 remitted in a Government Treasury
or in Friends “under the head of account
“(043—00—800-99” for the new enrollment of
Wireman/Supervisor . ‘
Original Electrical Wireman/Superfvisor permit
(for the new enrollment of Wireman/Supervisor)
Bank Guarantee for T 10,000 and I 25,000
for HT and EHT instdilations respectively

Self addressed and stamped envelope of size
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth ¥ 62)

20

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector .
(Secretary, Kerala State Electricity Licensing Board)

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

91



()

(k)

]

{m)

Two passport size photographs attested by a
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that

this is the true photograph of Shri/Smt........... }
Two specimen signatures duly attested by a
Gazetted Officer. .
Certification by the applicant of the loss or
damage, mutilation or defacement of the original
permit attested by a Gazetted Officer.

Copy of the prescribed notice published in the

daily news paper approved by PRD.

8 Electrical Contractor—Class ‘C’

(i) Issue of Fresh Electrical
Contractor—Class ‘C’ licence

(a)

(b)

(©)
(d)

(e)
H

{Electrical Contractor Class C* Licence issued on
the Report from Electrical Inspector/Deputy Chief
Electrical Inspector)

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee T 800 (fee for issue of Contractor Licence)
remitted in a Govt. Treasury or in Friends

" (head of account “0043-00-800-99"

Original Test certificates of Instruments **

_Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does

not exceed six months)

Self addressed and stamped envelope of size
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth T 62)

Two passport size photographs attested by a
Gazetied Officer (on the back side, stating that
this is the true photograph of Shri/Smiu........... }
Two specimen signatures duly attested by a
Gazetted Officer . '
Original Electrical Wireman Permit.

20

(ii) Issue of Electrical Contractor
Class ‘C’ licence in lieu of
lapsed Licence

(a)

®

Duly filled Application form for Electrical

" Contractor Class C Licence (Application form

available from Website : ceikerala.gov.in)
Original Electrical Contractor Class C Licence

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector
{Secretary, Kerala State Electricity Licensing Board)

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

335441201 VDTP.

Ll



(1)

(2)

@) -

)

(5)

(6)

(7

()

(d)

(e)
)
(2

Ongmal chalan recelpt for the remittance of the
fee** T 700 remitted in a Government

- Treasury or in ‘Friends under the head of account

“0043-00-800-99".

Original Test and Calibration certificates of
Instruments. (validity does not exceed six months)
Verification Certificate: of Tools (validity does
not exceed six months) .

Self addressed and stamped envelope of size

20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth T 32)

Original Electrical Wireman’ Permit,

15

(iii} Issue of duplicate Electrical
Contracter Class ‘C’ Licence

{a)

()

(c)

@
(©)
(f)

(g)

()
®

o
k)

Duly filled Application form for the duplicate
Electrical Contractor Class C Licence

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** T 800 remitted in a Government Treasury
or in Friends under the head of account
“0043-00-800-99”. -

Original Test and Calibration certificates of
Instruments (validity does not exceed six months)

Verification Certificate of Tools (validity does:

not exceed six months)

Self addressed and stamped envelope of size
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth T 32)
Certification by the rapplicant of the loss or
damage, mutilation or defacement of the original
permit attested by a-Gazetted Officer.

Copy of the prescribed notice published in the

daily news paper approved by PRD attested by
a Gazetted Officer.

"Original Electrical . Wireman Permit

Two passport size photographs ~attested by a
Gazetted Officer (on the back side, stating that
this is the true photograph of Shr /Smt................ )
Two specimen signatures duly attested by a

‘Gazetted Officer.

Certificate from the Electrical Inspector/Dy. Chief
Electrical Inspector, District office with details

15

of renewal of licence

- Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector
(Secretary, Kerala State Electricity Licensing Board)

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

< ey

81



9 Other services—Kerala State.
Electricity Licensing Board

(i) For the issue permit
(under exempted category) after
scope modification of Electrical
Supervisors Grade A and B

(a)

(b)

(©

(d)
©

B

Request - letter

The original Chalan Receipt of remittance in a
Govt. Treasury/Janasevanakendram for ¥ 500
for Electrical Supervisors Grade B, T 1,000
for Electrical Supervisors'Grade B (Head of
Account : 0043-00-800-99)

Two Copies of Passport size Photograph.
{Attested by a Gazetted Officer only on the
backside of the photo) _
Two signatures of the applicant (Attested by a
Gazetted Officer)

Self Addressed Stamped envelop for T 32
Envelope of size 20 cm x 14 cm

Original Permit and Competency Certificate.

30

(ii) For Additional Staff enrolment
under Electrical Contractor
{Wireman/Supervisor)

(a)
(b)

(c)

(d)
(e

Request letter

Declaration of Wireman/Supervisor (attested by
the officer from District Office of the Department
of Electrical Inspectorate) ' :
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** T 200 remitted in a Government Treasury
or in Friends under the head of account
“ (04-00-800-99™ for the new enrollment of
Wireman/Supervisor (per Wireman/Supervisor)
Original Electrical Wireman/Supervisor permit

(for the new enrollment of Wireman/Supervisor)

Original Electrical Contrator Licence

10

(iii) For the issue of recognition/
renewal of Institute for Electrical
Wireman and Electrical Supervisor

(a)

(b)
(<)

(d

Duly filled Application form for the recognition
of Electrical Wireman/Electrical Supervisor
conducting Institution

Details of technical staff

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** ¥ 5,000 remitted in a Govt Treasury or
in Friends under the head of account

“ (043-00-800-99".

Test certificates of instruments

*Application Forms and Fee details are available in Department Website : www.ceikerala.goyv.in

- 20

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector
(Secretary, Kerala State Electricity Licensing Board)

Additignal Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

6l



' NAME OF DEPARTMENT : DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRICAL INSPECTORATE

B. DISTRICT LEVEL OFFICES OF DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRICAIL INSPECTORATE

_ : Woh{{ng‘ Designated | First Second
No. Category of Services Documents to be attached with Application - Days Officer Appellate | Appellate
' Authority | Authority
(1) 2) 3) “ (5) (6) (7)
1 Scrutiny, Approval and Inspection of
Electrical Installations
(i) Electrical Scheme Approval ia} A covering letter
’ )  Authonisation Letter from the client authorising
the Electrical contractor to carry out the work,
giving brief particulars of the scheme
(¢)  Electrical Schematic drawings B
. {(d) Copy of the Electxjicai' coniractors Licence @E 8
(i)a. Issue of Non conformity report (e) Original chalan receipt fof the remittance of the b o Sg
Scrutiny Fee remitted in a Government Treasury/ g g -8 -8
Friends under the head of account : , ) S = g
“0043,00-102" , =& B x|
. (§  Certificate of Soil Resistivity (Required for HT/ 15 22 L%S , E
, EHT Installations) . 29 iy E
" (g) Fault Level Calculation (Required for HT/EHT ‘ E 8 5 —5
Installations) - — ki
(h) Earthing Celculation (Required for HT/EHT ©Z g &
| . o Installations) 23 §
(i)b. Issue of Approval of Electrical (i)  Bus Duct design (Required for Transformer and AE <
 Scheme if no non conformity - Generator - of rating > 630 kVA) %
+ (j)  A/C Calculation (Required_only for Centralized
AC Installations) ;
(k) Pro forma and Checklist (available at Website :
www.ceikerala.gov.in)
(i)c. Issue of Approval of Electrical - 10

Scheme in the case of (i) a, above

Complianée Report after rectifying defects,

0c



®

(ii)  Issue of Safety Certificate and
Sanction for Energisation.
{(ii}a. Issue of Non conformity Report (a) Completion report of work
after the inspection’ (b)  Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
' Initial inspection Fee remitted in a Government 10
(ii)b. Issue of Safety Certificate and Treasury/Friends under the head of account :
Sanction for Energisation if no “0043-00-102"
non conformity
(if)c. Issue of Safety Certificate and Compliance Report after rectifying defects
Sanction for Energisation in the
case of (ii} a, above
(iti) Inspection and issue of Valuation (a) Request for Valuation
Certificate for Elecirical (b)  Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 30
installations Initial inspection Fee remitted in a Government
Treasury/Friends under the head of account
“0043-00-102"
Issue Certificate under Regulation 62 (a) Request letter
of CEA (MS&ES) Regulation 2010 (b)  Submission of Site plan of proposed building
(with Plan and Elevation) Showing nearby Power
lines and its clearance duly approved by the
Supplier 15
- (¢} Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee T 1000 (X 100 for SC/ST category or BPL)
remitted in a Government Treasury or in Friends
under the head of account *“0043-00-102"
Issue of Soil Resistivity Measurement (a) Request letter for Soil resistivity measurement
Certificate at the site of the proposed Electrical installation
(b)  Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the 15
fee ¥ 1000 remitted in a Government Treasury
or in Friends under the head of account :
*0043-00-102"
Issue of Safety Certificate for (a) Request letter for Safety Certificate for Cable TV
Cable TV Network Network
(by Attested copy of Allocation order of electric

poles for drawing Cable TV network from licensee

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector @/
Electrical Inspector of the Concerned District

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

1z



ey

2

(3)

@

&)

(6)

(7

(c)
(d)

(e

Map showing area of distribution of Cable TV
and location of electric poles

Attested copy of registration cert1ﬁcate for
Department of post

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
inspection fee (¥ 5 per pole) remitted in a

Government Treasury/Friends under the head of 7

account: “0043-00-102"

15

Inspection and issue of Valuation
Certificate for Electrical installations

(a)
®

Request letter for Valuation

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
inspection fee remitted in a Government Treasury/
Friends under the head of account :
*“0043-00-102”

30

*Electrical Wireman

Renewal of Electrical Wireman Permit

(a)

(b)
(c)

(d)

Duly filled apphcatlon form for renewal of
Electrical Wireman Permit

Original Electrical Wireman Permit

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the

fee** T 300 (5 years) ¥ 500 (10 years)+

{Late fee : ¥ 200) remitted in a Government

Treasury or in Friends under the head of account:

“0043-00-800-99"
Self addressed and stamped envelope of size
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth T 32)

*Electrical Contractor--—-Class ‘C’

Renewal of Electrical Contractor—
Class *'C’ Licence

(a)

(®)
(c)

@

(e}

'Duly filled applicatioh form for renewal of

Electrical Contractor Class C Licence

Original Electrical Contractor Class C Licence
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee** ¥ 500 (Late fee : ¥ 200) remitted in
a Government Treasury or in Friends under the
head-of account : “0043-00-800-99"

Original Test and Calibration Certificates of
Instruments (validity does not exceed 6 months)
Verification Certificate of tools (validity does not

exceed six months)

15

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector @/
Electrical Inspector of the Concerned District

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

(44



(H
(®

Self addressed and stamped envelope of size
20 cm x 14 c¢m (Stamps worth ¥ 32)
Attested Copy of Electrical Wireman Permit

10

*QOther services—Kerala State

Electricity Licensing Beard

For Recommending the issue of
C—Class Electrical Contractor after
conducting interview ( to KSELB)

(a)
(b)

(c)
(d)
(e)
(0

~

Duly filled application form for Electrical
Contractor Class C Licence

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee T 400 remitted in a Government Treasury
or in Friends (Head of account “0043—-00-800-99")
Copy of the Experience Certificate attested by a
Gazetted Officer .
Copy of Electrical Wireman Permit attested by a
Gazetted Officer '

Self addressed and stamped envelope of size
10 cm x 24 cm (Stamps worth ¥ 5)

Applicant is requested to appear an Interview

11

*Cinema Operator

Renewal—Cinema Operator Licence

(a)

)]
(©)

4

(e}

Duly filled app[icatii)'ri form for renewal of
Cinema Operator Licence

Original Cinema Operator Licence
Documents to be forwarded along with the
application .-

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
fee T 150 + ( Late fee T 50 per month)
remitted in a Government Treasury or in Friends
under the head of account “0043-00-800-98".
Self addressed and stamped envelope of size
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth T 32)

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector @/
Electrical Inspector of the Concerned District

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

{@—At District  Office of the Deputy Chicf Electrical Inspector, Ernakulam, Trivandrum, Kozhikode.

* —Application Forms and Fee details are available in Department Website : www.ceikerala.gov.in

v

34



NAME OF DEPARTMENT : DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRICAL INSPECTORATE
C. DISTRICT OFFICE OF DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRICAL INSPECTORATE, ERNAKULAM

. . : . o Working Designated First | Second
No. Category of Services Docitments to be attached with application Days Officer Appellate | Appellate
‘ Authority | Authority
(D (2) (3) O (5} (6) (7)
1 | Scrutiny, Approval and Inspection of
Electrical Installations
(i) Electrical Scheme Approval (2) A covering letter
(b) Authorisation Letter from the client
authorising the Electrical contractor to carry
out the work, giving brief particulars of the
~ scheme .
{c) Electrical Schematic drawings 5 =
(d) Copy of the Electrical Contractors Licence % § 3
i w , =)
{1) a. Issue of Non conformity Report (e) Original chalan receipt for the remittance of f :ﬂ §
the Scrutiny Fee remitted in a Government B 5 )
Treasury/Friends. under the head of accouni: k! 5 =
= “0043-00-102" 20 ﬁ EE 8
‘ tmy B
(f) Certificate of Soil Resistivity (Required for £ g 2
HT/EHT Instatlations) S & a
) . S 2 = 2
(2z) Fault Level - Calculation (Required for HT/ g, ‘é- é)
EHT Installations) : A g
(h) Earthing Calculation (Required for HT/EHT 2
" Installations) ‘
(i) b. Issue of Approval of Electrical (i) Bus Duct Design (Required forTransformer
Scheme if no non conformity : and Generator of rating > 630 kVA)
' (i) A/C Calculation (Required only for Centralized
A/C Installations)
{(k} Pro forma and Checklist (avﬁilable at

Website : www.ceikerala.gov.in)

i

vz



sl

| 3354412013078 : .
@
(i) Issue of Approval of Electrical Compliance Report after rectifying defects 15
Scheme in the case of {i ) a, above|.
2 (ii} Issue of Safety Certificate and
Sanction for Energisation
(iiYa Issue of Non conformity report (a) Completion report of work
after the inspection -
(it)b lIssue of Safety Certificate and (b) Original chalan receipt for the remittance
Sanction for Energisation if no of the Initial inspection fee remitted in a 10
non conformity Government Treasury/Friends under the head
of account : “0043-00-102”
(i)c Issue of Safety Certificate and Compliance Report after rectifying defects
Sanction for Energisation in the .
case of (i) a, above
3§ (iil) Inspection and issue of Valuation {a} Request for Valuation
Certificate for Electrical {(b) Original chalan receipt for the remittance
instaltations of the Initial inspection - Fee remitted in a 30
Government Treasury/Friends under the
head of account : “0043-00-102”
4 | Issue Certificate under regulation 62
of CEA (MS&ES) Regulation, 2010 (a) - Request letter
(b} Submission of site plan of proposed building
(with Plan and Elevation) Showing nearby
Power lines and its clearance duly approved 15
by the supplier o
{c) Original chalan receipt for the remittance of
the fee ¥ 1000 (T 100 for SC/ST category
or BPL) remitted in a Government Treasury -
or in Friends under the head of account :
*“0043-00-102"
5| Issue of Soil Resistivity Measurement {a) Request letter for Soil resistivity measurement
Certificate at the site of the proposed Electrical installation
{b} Original chalan receipt for the remittance of
the fee ¥ 1000° remitted in a Government 15

Treasury or in Friends under the head of
account : “0043-00-102”

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

4



oy

)

3)

(4)

()

(6)

(7)

Issue of Safety certificate for
Cable TV Network

(a)
(b)
(c)
(d)
(e)

Request letter for Safety Certificate for Cable

TV Network

Attested copy of Allocation order of electric
poles for drawing Cable TV network from licensee
Map showing area of distribution of Cable TV
and location of electric poles

Attested copy of registration certificate for
Department of Post

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of
the inspection Fee (Z 5 per pole) remitted in
a Government Treasury/Friénds under the head
of account : “0043-00-102"

15

Inspection and issue of Valuation
Certificate for Electrical installations

(a)
(b)

Request letter for Valuation

Original chalan receipt for the remittance of the
inspection fee remitted in a Government
Treasury/Friends under the head of account :
“0043-00-1027

30

*Electrical Wireman

Renewal of Electrical Wireman permit

(a)

(b)
(©)

(@)

Duly filled application form for renewal. of
Electrical Wireman Permit _ )
Original Electrical Wireman Permit -
Original chalan receipt for the remittance of

* the fee** T 300 (5 years) T 500 (10 years) +

{Late fee.: ¥ 200) remitted in a Government
Treasury or in Friends under the head of
account “0043-00-800--99".

Self addressed and stamped envelope of size -

20 cm x 14 ¢cm (Stamps worth T 32)

*Electrical Contractor—Class ‘C’

Renewal of Electrical Contractor—
Class ‘C’ Licence

@

Duly filled applicaﬁon form for renewal of
Electrical Contractor Class C Licence

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

- Chief” Electrical Inspector

J
I W

97

o



33/5441/2013/DTP.

Original Electrical Contactor Class C Licence

(b)

(¢) Original chalan receipt for the remittance of
the fee** T 500 (Late fee : T 200) remitted in
a Govemnment Treasury or in Friends under the .
head of account : “0043-00-800-99"

(d) Original Test and Calibration Certiﬁcates of 15
{nstruments (validity does not exceed 6 months)

(¢) Verification Certificate of tools (validity does
not exceed six rﬁonths)

(f) Self addressed and stamped envelope of size
20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth ¥ 32) '

(g) Attested Copy of Electrical Wireman Permnit

10 | *Other services—Kerala State Electricity
Licensing Board
For Recommending the issue of (a) Duly filled application form for Electrical
‘C’'-Class Electrical Contractor after Contractor Class C Licence
conducting interview (to KSEB) (b) Original chalan receipt for the remittance of

the fee T 400 (Application Fee : T 200 +
Scrutiny fee : ¥ 200) remitted in a
Government Treasury or in Friends (Head of
account “0043-00-800-99").

(c) Copy of the Experience Certificate attested by 7
a Gazetted Officer

(d) Copy of Electrical Wiremarm Permit attested

. bya Gazetted Officer

(e) Self addressed and stamped envelope of size
10 cm x 24 cm (Stamps worth ¥ 5)

(f) * Applicant is requested to appcar.an Interview

Deputy Chief Electrical Inspector

Additional Chief Electrical Inspector

Chief Electrical Inspector

LT



i

20 cm x 14 cm (Stamps worth T 32)

-
(D (2) 3) 4) (5) (6} (7
11 | * Cinema Operator - =

Renewal‘c_,‘in_ema Operator Licence (a} Duiy filled Application form for Renewal of A
| Cinema Operator Licence (Application form g
= 3
available from -Website : ceikerala.gov.in) £ g o
L [o% [~}
& 2 g
(b}  Original Cinema Operator Licence 4 5 ;‘l;?;-
(¢) Documents to be forwarded along with the § g' =
L © o 2
application 7 ﬁ = &
(d) Original chalan receipt for the remitiance of - 5" —
- 8
the fee ¥°150 + (Late fee T 50 per month) : Qi = '5
. e - = q
remitted in 2 Government Treasury or in § =
Friends under the head of account & =
+ “0043-00-800-98", ' <
(e) Self addréssed and- stamped envelope of size

* Application Forms and Fee details are available in Department Website : www.ceikerala.gov.in

By order of the Governor,

Dr. Nivepita P. HArAN,

" Additional Chief Secretary to Government.

~

82



H

-t -

29
Explanatory Note

(ThJs does not form part of the notification, but is intended to indicate its general purpon)

As per notxﬁcatlon issued under G. O. (P) No. 14/2013/PD dated 4th April, 2013 and
published as S. R. O. No. 281/2013 in the Kerala Gazette Extraordinary No. 990 dated 4th April,
2013, the Government have notified the services rendered to the piiblic and the daetails of the
designated officers, stipulated time limit, first appellate authority and second appellate authority in
respect of the Department of Electrical Inspectorate, Kerala State Electricity Board and the Energy
Management Centre, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Kerala State Right to
Service Act, 2012 (18 of 2012). :

In the said notification the designated officers, first appellate authority and second appellate
authority of the Department of Electrical Inspectorate differ from that of the notification issued by the

- Department of Electrical Inspectorate, as E2-18672/2011/CEI dated 31st January, 2013 in the Kerala

Gazette No. 8 dated 19th February, 2013. An Additional column viz. ‘documents to be attached with

application® was also included in the notification issued by the Department of Electrical Inspectorate. '

Therefore the Government have decided to amend the said notification suitably, incorporating the
changes and the additional column in the notification issued by the Department.of Electrical

Inspectorate.

The notification is intended to achieve the above object.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES AT THE
GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 2013.



eiqy 2

al®lmymoie cadg mloarve

@RI UGAR8Mo

moMiRGS HuEldl 0180085 O2ldi; (al@mo0n)B8
2012-921 GHOE TUOMUNIM BAVCUMOINIS:ICD

snllefimas cean®l cmoglnd

0@ riddho
Shri T. N. Prathapan :
109. In the title, the word ‘STATE’ shall be deleted.
Shri T. N. Prathapan :

I10. In the title after the word ‘TQ’ the word ‘PUBLIC"® shall be
inserted.

Shri E. P. Jayarajan ;
111. Title shall be recast as follows :

“FTHE KERALA STATE PUBLIC SERVICE GUARANTEE
BILL, 2012~

Shri K. Suresh Kurup :
112.  Title shall be recast as follows :

“THE KERALA STATE GUARANTEE OF SERVICE BILL,
2012”7,
[Ex e =TTy [ B T XY

Shri C. P. Mohammed :

113. In the long title for the words, “the delivery of ™ substitute the
word ‘guaranteeing”.

Shn K. Suresh Kurup :

114, In the long title substitute the word “Guarantee” for the
word “‘Delivery”™,

KNPP. 1077/2012,



2

afgle,

Shri Palode Ravi‘ :
115. In the preamble, for the words ‘the delivery’ substitute the
word ‘obtaining’.
SaMoo mﬁgg"
Shr Palode Ravi :

116. In clause 1 (1), insert the word “guarantee” in between the
words “service” and “Act”.

Shri T. N. Prathapan :

117. In clause 1 (1), for the words “Kerala State Right to Service
Act, 20127 the words “Kerala Right to Public Service Act,
2012” shall be substituted.

Shri E. P. Jayarajan :

118. In clause 1 (1) for the words “Kerala State Right to Service
Act” the words “Kerala State Public Service Guarantee Act”
shall be substituted.

Shri P. K. Basheer :

119, In clause 1 (2) after the words “into force” the words and
figures “on the 1* of January 2013 shall be inserted.

Shri M. P. Abdussamad Samadani :

120. In clause 1 (2) after the words “into force” the words “on

the expiry of one hundred and eighty days of its passing”
shall be added. '

Shri Therambil Ramakrishnan :

121. In clause 1 (2) insert the word “Government” between the
words “The” and *Gazette”.

Shri K. Suresh Kurup : _
122. Clause 1 (2) shall be recast as follows :
“(2) It shall come into force at once™.
Shri Dominic Presentation:
123. Clause 1 (2) shall be recast as followé :

“(2} It shail come into force at once”.

i

s



3

DEM200 _CUdh)aj
Shri Mathew T. Thomas:

124. In clause 2(a), the words “as such” shall be substituted by the
words “by the Government”.

Shri K. N. A. Khader:

125, In clause 2(b} for the words “is eligible for” the word
“requirc” shall be substituted.

Shri Palode Ravi;
126. Clause 2(b) shall be recast as follows:

“applicant for service” means “a person who is an applicant
for services notified under section 3.

Shri Benny Behanan:
127. In clause 2(c} delete the word “first”.
Shri Benny Behanan:
128. After clause 2{d), add the following:
“(da} Notifications means a notification in the gazette”.
Shri T. N. Prathapan:

129. In clause 2(f) the words “of an eligible person” shall be
deleted. '

Shni Palode Ravi :

130. In clause 2(f), for the words “eligible person” the words
“applicant for service” shall be substituted.

Shri K. V. Abdul Khader :

131. In clause 2(g) for the words “any service to be provided”
substituie the words “any service to be rendered”.

Smt. P. Aisha Potty :

132. In clause 2(g), for the words “any law for the time being in
force” substitute the following, namely “any Act passed by the
legislature and for any regulation, notification, order, scheme,
rule or bye law issued thereafier”.



Shri T. N. Prathapan :

133. In clause 2(g), after the words “Department of the
Government”, the words “including Government Secretariat”
shall be inserted.

Shri X. Raju :

134, In clause 2(g). after the words “Public Sector Undertaking”,
insert the words “Quasi Government institution”.

Shri A, K. Balan :

135. In clause 2(g) insert the following words between the
words,"a Statutory Body” and “as may be” in the last line,
namely :— '

“any agencies/contractors licenced/entrusted to deliver the
services on behalf of the Government including institution
registered under charitable societies Act.”

Shri Palode Ravi :
136. For clause 2(g) the following shall be substituted, namely :—

“2(g) “service” means any service to be provided under the
provisions of any law for the time being in force or as per
Government Orders issued from time to time, to the general
public by or under any Department of the Government
including Secretariat service or by a Local Self Government
Institution - or Development authorities or Co-operative
Institutions under the Co-operative Societies Act or by a
Public Sector Undertaking or by a Statutory Body, as may be
notified under section 3.”

Shri Mathew T. Thomas :
137, Clause 2(g) shall be recast as follows :

“2(g) “service” means any service as may be notified under
section 3.”

Shri Benny Behanan :
138. Clause 2(h) shall be recast as follows :

“2(h) “state level Appellate Authority” means the authority
notified as such under section 3A.”



Shri P. Ubaidulla :

139. In clause 2(i) the words “or ninety days whichever is earlier’
shall be added at the end.

Shri K. Suresh Kurup :

140. After clause 2(i) add the following sub clause, namely:-

s

“(j) Local Self Government Institutions includes Grama
Panchayath, Block Panchayath, District Panchayath,
Municipality and Municipal Corporation.”

Shri K. Sivadasan Nair :
141. After clause 2(i), add the following sub clause namely:-

“(j) “Aggrieved person” means any person aggrieved by the
order of the designated Officer or the first appellate
authority.”

@m0 mﬁggj
Shri Palode Ravi :

142. In clause 3 for the words beginning with “save as” and
ending with “statutory body” substitutc the words “save as
otherwise provided in any other law for the time being in
force, every Department of the Government including
Sccretariat Service, every head of Department, every Local
Self Government Institutions and every statutory body”.

Shri K. Dasan :

143. In clause 3 after the words ‘'save as otherwise provided in
any other law of the time being in force™ the following words
shall be inscried, namely “the Private Secretary of Ministers”,

Shri Mathew T. Thomas :

144. In clausc 3 after the words “for the time being in force” the
words “in respect of” and after the words * every statutory
body” the words “the Government” shall be inserted.

Shri V. S. Suni! Kumar :

i45. In clause 3 after the words “every Department of the
Government” the words “Secretariat” shall be inserted.



‘Shri Babu M. Palissery :

146. In clause 3, for the words “every Department of the
Government” substitute the following words “the Chief
Secretary and Principal Secretaries/Secretaries of the various
Departments in the Government Secretariat.”

Shri T. N. Prathapan :

147. In clause 3 after the words “every department of the
Government” the word “Secretariat” shall be inserted.

Shri M. Ummer :

148. In clause 3 delete the words “every Local Self Government
Institution”.

Shri K. M. Shaji :

149. In clause 3, after the words “Local Self Government
Institution” the words “ every State Public Undertaking” shall
be inserted.

Shri V. 8. Sunil Kumar:

150. In clause 3, after the words “every Local Self Government
Institution” the words “ every Public Sector Undertaking”
shall be added. '

Shri K. Suresh Kurup:
151. In clause 3, substitute the words “Heads of the department of

Local Seif Government” for the words “Every Local Self
Government Institution”.

Shri K. Sivadasan Nair:

152. In clause 3, after the words “Local Self Government
Institutions”, the following words shall be inserted “Heads of
Public Undertakings”.

Shri A. M. Arniff .
153. In clause 3, for the words “every Local Self Government

Institution” the following words shall be substituted, namely
““Secretaries of every Local Self Government Institution”,

3



Shri E. P. Jayarajan :

154. In clause 3, for the words “within six months of the
commencement of this Act” the words “immediately after the
notification of this Act in the Gazette” shall be substituted.

Shri B. D. Devassy:

i155. In clause 3, after the words “within six months of the
commencement of this Act” insert the following words, * or
within six months afier date of commencement of any law or
Government order that may be made or issucd hereafter
casting an obligation on them to render any service”,

Shri M. Ummer:

156. In clause 3, for the words “six months” substitute the words
“Two Months”.

Shri Benny Behanan:

157. In clause 3, for the words “six months” the words “two
months” shall be substituted.

Shn Palode Ravi:

i58. In clause 3, the words “'six months” shall be substituted by
the words *‘three months™.

Shri Joseph Vazhackan :

159. In clause 3, for the words “six months,” substitute the words
“three months”.

Shri E. K. Vijayan:

160. In clause 3, for the words “six months” substitute the words
“three months”,

Shri K, Suresh Kump:

161, In clause 3, substitute the words “Three months” for the
words “Six Months”.

Shri K. Muhammadunni Haji:

162. 1In clause 3, for the words “six months” the words “three
months” shall be substituted.



Shri T. N. Prathapan :

163. In clause 3, for the words “six months” substitute the words
“four months”.

Shri V. D. Satheesan :

164. In clause 3, for the words “six months” substitute the words
“five months™.

Shri V. Chenthamarakshan :

165. In clause 3, for the words “notify in the gazette the services”,
substitute the words “notify in the gazette the nature of
services”, '

Shri Benny Behanan :

166. In clause 3, the words “first” and “second appellant

authority” shall be deleted. ’
Shri P. K. Gurudasan ;

167. In clause 3, after the words “second appellate authority” insert
“the words “and every office shall be specify”.

Shri Palode Ravi :

168. In clause 3, insert the words “not below the rank of a
Government Secretary” in between the words “Second
appellate authority” and “and the stipulated time limit”

Shri M. Hamsa :
'169. In clause 3, add the following at the end:

“and the requisite documents/records/information to obtain the
Service”

Shri A. K. Balan :
170. Clause 3 may be recast as follows:

“Power to notify services, stipulated time limit, designated
officer etc. The state Government shall, by notification from
time to time, notify the services that every department of the
Government, including the Secretariat, Local Self Government
- Institution, State Public Sector units, every statutory body,
agencies or contractors licensed on entrusted to deliver the



9

services on behalf of the Government or institutions
registeredunder charitable Societies Act, that will be
rendered bycach of them, the designated officers, the first
appellateauthority and the sccond appellate authority and
every officeshall notify the stipulated time limit for the purpose
of this Act and specify the requisite documents /records/
informationto obtain the Service™.

Shri N. A, Nellikkunnu :

171.

After Clause 3, the following proviso shall be
added, namely;~-

“Provided that in order to maintain uniformity, Local Self
Government Institutions and State Public Undertakings shail
Publish such notification only after obtaining consent of
Government in Local Scif Government Department and
Burcau of Public Enterprises respectively.”

Shri M. Chandran :

172,

In Clause 3 add the following proviso,“Provided that in the
case of Local Self Government Institutions, the notifications to
be published in the Gazette on their behalf shall, within three
months from the date of commencement of this Act, be
forwarded iin the draft form to the Director of Panchayats or
the Director of Urban Affairs, as the case may be, and the
Director concemed shall, after fixing a uniform stipulated time
limit in respect of the services of same nature or of same class
or classes, publish the notification in the Gazette in a
consolidated form or separately for each District, with in six

- months from the date of commencement of this Act.”

Shri Kodiyeri Balakrishnan :

1077/2012.

173

After clause 3 the following proviso shall be added

“Provided that if any of the authorities bound to notify in the
Gazette the services that will be rendered by them fail to do so
within six months, the services being rendered by them as
enumerated in the manuals, internal circulars brought out by
them shall be the services deemed to be notified by them”



10

Shri Elamaram Kareem :

174. The existing clanse 3 shall be renumbered as 3 (1) and insert
the following as 3 (2), “(2) Where any Department, institution,
authority or body as specified in sub-section (1) fails to
notify the services, designated officer, appellate authorities and
the stipulated time or to act as provided in the said sub-
section with out reasonable cause, the Secretary, Head of the
Department or the Director concerned, who is responsible for
their administration, shall personally be liable to pay such
fine as may be prescribed, but not exceeding 500 rupees per
each day in which such failure continues and such fine shall

. be imposed by the appointing authority of such officer and in
the case of the State Public Sector Undertakings, the
Managing Director or Chairman of such undertaking concerned
shall be liable as above and such amount of fine as stated
above shall be recovered by way of deduction from salary or
in any other manner as may be prescribed:

Provided that before imposing any fine under this sub-rule,
the officer concerned shall be given an opportunity of being
heard.”,

BaNT0 QdoiaINICWRHNBS a@IW Qld)a].
Shri Mathew T. Thomas:

175. After clause 3, the following clause shall be inserted:

“3A (1) The Government may thereafter by notification from
time to time notify the services to which this Act shall be
extended to

(2) The Government may also by notification specify the
designated officers, first appellate authority, second appellate
authority and the stipulated time limit in respect of services so
extended.”

Shri Benny Behanan :
176. After clause 3, a new clause shall be inserted as follows:

“3A. Constitution of State Level Appellate Authority,—
Government may by notification constitute a State Level
Appellate Authority within six months of the commencement of
this Act to entertain the grievances of the appellants.”



11

MoRI%0 idha]
Shri M. Ummer :

177. In the marginal heading of clause 4, insert the words “within
stipulated time limit” after the words “Right to obtain services”.

Shri E. P. Jayarajan:

178. In clause 4, for the words “Every eligible person” the words
“Every citizen™ shall be substituted.

Shri Palode Ravi:

179 In clause 4, for the words “eligible person” substitute the
words “applicant for service”.

Shn M. V. Srevams Kumar :

180 In clause 4, the words “specified for each service” shall be
added at the end.

Shri T. N, Prathapan:

181.  After clause 4, the following proviso shall be added, namely:—
“provided that eligible person shall submit true and correct
information to obtain the services notified under Section 3”.

M0 Al )aflMCAUNBE oW Qld)ap il
Shri Ramesh Chennithala:

182. After clause 4, add the following Clauses 4A and 4B,
namely;,— “4A. A notice board/information hoarding in the
prescribed  format, depicting the services being provided by the
institution/office and its accessing modalities, shall be
displayed within the office premise so as o make the applicant
be known about such services and also about the personnel
whom they have to approach for accessing/availing such
services

4B. Government is empowered to make/put in place suitable
institutional or structural arrangements or changes as may be
deemed fit under this act including designation of nodal
officers and formulation of procedural formalities to facilitate
the access of qualitative and timely service”,



12

WREMI00 O]
Shri M. Ummer :

183. In clause 5(1}, after the words “The designated officer” the
words “or a person subordinate to him authorised to receive the
application” shall be inserted.

Shri E. P, Jayarajan :

184, In clause 5(1), for the words “an eligible person”, the words
“a citizen” shall be substituted.

Shri Palode Ravi -

185. In clause 5(1), the words “eligible 'person” shall be substituted
by the words “applicant for services”,

Dr. K. T, Jaleel :
186. In clause 5(1), delete the words “or reject the application”.
Shri Roshy Augustine :

187. 1In clause 5(1), after the words “intimate” the words “in the
same day” shall be inserted.

Shri K. Suresh Kurup :

188. In clause 5(1), insert the words “in person or by Registered
post” in between the words “applicant” and “forthwith”,

Shri Roshy Augustine :

189. In clause 5(1), in between the words “applicant” and
“forthwith”, the words “in writing” shall be inserted.

Shri Kodiyeri Balakrishnan :

190. In clause 5(1), for the last word “forthwith” substitute the
words “within the stipulated time limit”.

Shri R, Rajesh :

191, Add the following at the end of clause 5(1) “anng with the
~ particulars of the appellate authonty”



13

Shri Ramesh Chennithala :

192, In clause 5(1), after the last sentence, the following seniences
may be added, “If any service has been denied/rgjected by the
officer, causes and reasons for such rejection/denial must be
clearly sfated and intimate to the applicant. If it has found that
the service has been rejected or denied without any substantial
valid reason or justification fine may be imposed to the erring
officer/officers in such a manner and way as may be prescribed
under this ac”.

Shri M. Ummer :
193. In clause 3(2), the words “in prescribed form* shall be inserted
before the words “to receive such application™.

Shn V. S. Sunil Kumar :

194. In clause 5(2), after the words “reccive such application”, the
words by issuing a receipt to that effect” shall be added.

Shri Mathew T. Thomas :

195. After clause 5(2) add the following sentence at the end:
“Every designated officer shall maintain dctailed records of
applications for service, in a format as may be prescribed”.

Shri Ramesh Chennithala :
196. Recast clause 5(2) as follows:

“(2} An application received, including the on-line application,
under sub-scction (1) shall be duly acknowledged by the
designated officer or by the officer authorised by him to
reccive such application,”

Shri James Mathew :

197. After clause 5(1) add the following as clause 5(2) namely:
*“(2) when the designated officer is abscnt on leave or
otherwise, immediate junior shall be the designated officer for
the purpose of this Act” and renumber the remaining
sub-clauses.

Shri M. A. Vaheed :

198. In clause 5(3). for the word “start” substitute the word
“begin”.



14

Shri Mathew T. Thomas :

199. In sub-clause (3) of the clause 5, after the words “start from”
the words “the next working day of” shall be inserted.
Shri C. Krishnan :

200. In clause 5(3), after the word “received” add the words “either

in person or through on-line”.

Dr. T. M. Thomas Isaac :

201.

After the existing clause 5(2) add the following as clause 5(3)
namely :(—*“(3) the departments and officers covered by
e-governance a port let may be provided for submitting on-line
application for the service. The designated officer shall on the
same day assign an identification number fore achapplication to
track the file and shall provide the service as stipulated in sub
clause (1) above” and renumber the remaining sub clauses.

Shri Kediyeri Balakrishnan :

202,

After clause 5(3), the following sub clause shall be inserted,
namely: “(4) the designated authority shall keep a register
regarding compliance of the directions issued by the respective
fixst appellate authority and second appellate authority™ .

Shri Kodiyeri Balakrishnan :

203.

After clause 5(3) the following sub clause shall be inserted
namely:— “(4) Every eligible person having applied for any
service shall be provided an application number by the
designated officer and shall be entitled to obtain and monitor
status of his application on line or in person in accordance with
such procedure as may be prescribed. The Public Authority
shall maintain status of all applications for service online and
in a register and shall be duly bound to update the status of
the same as per the procedure as prescribed by rules in
this regard.”

Shri K. K. Jayachandran .

204,

Add the following clause after clause 5(3), namely:—

“5(4) every office shall evolve an on-line file tracking system.”

€



15

Shri K. Suresh Kurup :

205.

After clause 5 (3) add the following sub-clauscs namely:—

“{4) Every Applicant shall be entitled to obtain and monitor
status of the application on line in accordance with such
procedure as may be prescribed.

(5) Every public Authority or Local Authority as the case may
be shall maintain the status of all applications related to
services on line and shall be duly bound to update the status
of the applications™.

@REMIV0 Q)0 liMIGUDHUBIES ~j@ID Qld)a]

Shri Palode Rawi :

206.

Afier clause 5, a new ciause shall be inserted, namely:—

“5A. Monitoring the status of the application

a. Every applicant for service having applicd for any citizen
related services shall be provided an application number by the
concerned Public Authority, or Local Authority, as the case may
be and shall be entitled to obtain and monitor status of his
application online in accordance with such procedure as may
be prescribed.

b. Every Public Authority or Local Authority, as the case may
be, shall maintain status of all applications governing citizen
related services on line and shall be duly bound to update the
status of the same as per the procedure as prescribed by rules
in this regard.”

@020 Qldhla]

Shri. Benny Behanan :

207,

In clause 6 for the words, “first appellate authority” the words
“appellate authority” may be substituted wherever occur.

Shri. Benny Behanan :

208.

In clause 6 for the words, “second appellate authority™ the
words “state lcvel appellate authority” shall be substituted
wherever occurs.



16

' Shri. Mathew T. Thomas :

209. In clause 6 (1), the words, “required service” shall be
substituted by the words “‘service applied for”.

Shri. Saju Paul :
210. In clause 6(1) delete the words “and on payment of such fee”.
Shri. E. P. Jayarajan:

211. In clause 6(1) the words ‘“and on payment of such fee”
shall be dcleted.

Shri. K. Sivadasan Nair:

»

212. In clause 6(1) the words “and on payment of such fee
shall be deleted.

Shri. K. Sivadasan Nair:

213. In the proviso to clause 6(1) for the words “after the
expiry of the period of thirty days” substitute the words
“forthwith”.

Shri. Roshy Augustine:

214. In the provisoto clause 6(1) for the words “thirty
days” substitute the words “fifteen days”.

Shri. Mathew T. Thomas :

215. In sub-clause (2) of clause 6, the word “may” after the
words, “appellate authority” shall be substituted by the words
“shall cither” and the word “may” after the word “‘or” shall be
deleted. :

Shri. P. C. Vishnunadh:

216. In clause 6 (2), for the words “provide” substitute the word,
“render”,

Shri. Koliakode N, Krishnan Nair:

217. In clause 6 (2), for the words, “within a specified period”
substitute the word, “forthwith”.



17

Shri M. Ummer ;

218. In clause 6 (2), for the words “a spccificd period” the words,
“Thirty days” shall be substinuted.

Prof. C. Raveendranath :

219. In clause 6 (2) add the words “and shall intimate the appellant
the reasons for rejection of appeal”, at the end.

Shri K. Kunhiraman (Trikkaripur):

220 In clause 6 (2) add the words “and shall intimate the same in
writing to the eligible person™ at the end.

- Shn C. Moyinkutty:

221. In clause 6 (3) after the word “limit” the words “or one
month, whichever is carlier” shall be added at the end.

Shri K. Sivadasan Nair :

222. In clause 6 (3) after the words “time limit” the words “after
giving an opportunity to the designated officer under Scction 3
to file his cxplanation whatsoever for denying the service if
any” shall be added at the end.

Shri P. B. Abdul Razak :

223, In clause 6 (4) for the word “aggrieved” the words “not
satisficd” shall be substituted,

Shri T. N. Prathapan:

Y 224. In clause 6 (4) for the word “sixty” the words “forty five ”
‘ shall be substituted,

Shri K. Sivadasan Nair:

225, - In clause 6 (4) for the words “sixty days” the words “thirty
days” shall be substituted,

Shri K. Kunhammed Master:
226. In clausc 6 (4) deletc the words “and on payment of such fee”.
Shri E. P. Jayarajan :

227. In clause 6(4), the words “and on payment of such fee” shall
be deleted.

1077/2012.




18

Shri Sunny Joseph :

228. In the proviso to clause 6(4), for the word “that” substitute the -

word “the”.
Shri P. C. Vishmunadh :
229. In clause 6(5), delete the word “he may”.
Shri Mathew T. Thomas :

230. In sub clause (5) of clause 6, the word “may” after the words
“second appellate authority” may be substituted by the words
“shall either” and the words “he may” shall be deleted.

Shri M. Ummer :
231, In clause 6(5) for the words “a specified period” substitute the
words “fifteen days”.
Prof. C. Raveendranath : _
232. In clause 6 (5) add the following at the end némely: “under

intimation to the appellant of the reasons for rejection of the
appeal.”

Shri Kodiyeri Balakrishnan

233. In clause 6(5) add the following at the end namely: “under
intimation to the eligible person”.

Shri E. P. Jayarajan °

234. After clause 6(5) the following proviso shall be added namely:
“Provided that before rejecting the appeal, an opportunity of
hearing to the aggrieved person shall be granted by the second
appellate authority™.

Shri Abdurahiman Randathani :

235. In clause 6 (7) after the word, “Hmit” the words “or one
month whichever is earlier” shall be added at the end.

Shri P. C. Vishnunadh:

-236. In sub-clause (8) of clause 6, after the words “such non-
compliance may” the words, “within such period or may be
prescribed” shall be inserted. :




19

Shri K. Sivadasan Nair:

237. In clause 6 (8), for the words, “sccond appellate authority and
such applications shall be disposed of in the same manner in
which a second appeal is to be disposed of under this Act”,
substitute the words, “first appellate authority and such an
application shall be disposed of for complying the earlier order
and proceed in 1o the penal provision and disciplinary action™.

Shri K. Radhakrishnan:

238. In clause 6 (8), for the words “such an application shall be
disposed of in the same manner in which a second appeal is to
be disposed of under this Act”, substitute the words, “the
sccond appellate authority shall direct the designated officer to
provide the service forthwith and shall impose penalty as
provided in section 8”.

Shri Mathcw T. Thomas ;

239. In sub clause (9) of clause 6, after the words “such non-
compliance may”, the words “within such period as may be
prescribed™ shall be inserted.

Shri G. Sudhakaran :

240. In clausc 6 (9) for the words, “such an application shall be
disposed of in the same manner in which a second appeal is to
be disposed of under this Act.” substitute the words, “dircct the
designated officer o provide the service forthwith and also
impose penalty on the designated officer as provided in
section 8.

Shn C. Mammutty :

241. In clause 6 (9), after the word “Act” the words “and impose
sccond penalty equal to that of first penalty” shall be added at
the end.

aB¥do Olds}a]
Shri K. Kunhiraman (Uduma):

242. 1n clause 7 (b), delete the words, “and two appellant,”



20
Shri E. P. Jayarajan:

243, After clause 7 of the following clause shall be added namely—
7A Service Guarantee:- Every Head of Department shall have
the responsibility to assure the time bound delivery of citizen
related Service as defined in this Act”

Shri K. Suresh Kurup:
244, After clause 7 add the following clause as clause 7 A

“TA. Constitution of the Commission:—- The Government shall
constitute a commission te be called The Kerala State
Guarantee of Services Commission constituting of a Chief
Commissioner and two other Commissioners and their
appointment shall be made by the Government in consultation
with the leader of opposition. The Commission shall supervise
all the matters related to the

services to be provided.”

' Pf)500 Nida]
Shri Oo en Chandy:

/'In sub-clause (2) of clause 8 for the word “penaltv" the word
/“f“ ¢ shall be :

Shri K. Suresh Kurup:

246. In clause 8 (1) (a) the words “failed to Provide” shall be
substituted by the words “not provided”

Shri K. Sivadasan Nair;

247. In clause 8 {1) (a) for the words “the second appellate
authority” substitute the words “first appellant authority”,

Shri Benny Behanan:

248. In clause 8, for the words “second appellate authority”
wherever it occures, the words “state level appellate authority
right” shall be substituted.

Shri Benny Behanan:

249. In clause 8, for the words “first appellate authority” the words
“appellate authority” shall be substituted wherever it occures.



21

Smt. K. K. Lathika:
250. In clause 8 (1) (a) substitute the word “shall” for the word
“may’".
ShriE. P. Jayarajan:

251. In clause 8 (1) (a) for the words “impose a fine on the
designated officer which shall not be less than five hundred
rupees and not more than five thousand rupecs,” the words
“shall recommend disciplinary action against him under the
service rules applicable to him” shall be substituted.

ShriT. N. Prathapan:

252. In clause 8 (1) (a) for the words “five hundred,” the words
“one thousand” shall be substituted.

Shri Roshy Augustine:

253. In clause 8 (1) (a) for the words “five hundred rupees”
substitute the words “thousand rupces”.

Shri V. S. Sunmil Kumar:

254. In clause 8 (1) (a) for the words “five hundred rupees” and
“five thousand rupees™, the words “one thousand rupees’ and
“twenty five thousand rupees” shall be substituted respectively.

Shri Mathew T. Thomas :

255. 1In clause 8(1)(a) for the words, “five hundred rupees and not
more than five thousand rupees” substitute the words, “five
thousand rupees and not more than ten thousand rupecs;”.

Shri K. Sivadasan Nair :

256. In clause 8(1)(b) for the words, “sccond appellate authority™,
substitute the words, “first appellate authority™.

Shri T, N. Prathapan:

257. In clause 8(1)(b) for the words, “two hundred and fifty” the
words “one hundred™ shall be substituted.

Shri R. Selvaraj :

258. In clause 8(1){(b) for the words “two hundred and fifty rupecs”,
substitute the words “two hundred and scventy five rupees”.



22

Shri Hibi Eden :

259. In clause 8(1)(b) for the words “two hundred and fifty rupees”,
substitute the words “two hundred and eighty five rupees”.

Shri Varkala Kahar :

260. In clause 8(1)(b) for the words “two hundred and fifty rupees”,
substitute the words “three hundred rupees™.

Shri P. C. Vishnunadh

261. In clause §(1)(b) for the words “two hundred and fifty rupees”,
substitute the words “four hundred rupees”.

Shri A. P. Abdullakutty:

262. In clause 8(1)(b), for the words “two hundred and fifty
rupees” substitute the words “five hundred rupees”.

Shri Thomas Unniyadan:

. 263. In clause 8(1)(b), for the words “two hundred and fifty”
substitute the words “five hundred rupees”.

Shri M. P. Vincent:

264. In clause &(I)(b}, for the words “two hundred and fifty rupees”
substitute the words “six bundred rupees”.

Shri V. S. Sunil Kumar:

265. In clause 8(1}(b), for the words “two hundred and fifty mpees”,
the words “One thousand, two hundred and fifty” shall be
substituted. '

Shri Purushan Kadalundi:

266. In clause 8(1)b), delete the words “the sum of which shall not
exceed five thousand rupees”.

Shri V. S. Sunil Kumar:

267. In clause 8(1)}(b), for the words “five thousand rupees™ the
words “twenty five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

-




23

Shri A. Pradeepkumar:
268. In clause 8(1)(b), add the following words at the end:

“the amount so collected shall be awarded to the appellant as
compensation”,

Shri V. S. Sunil Kumar :
269. After clause 8(1)(b), add the following, namely:—

“{c} Appcals are to be disposed of within a period of 60 days
by the appellate authority™.

Shri V. P. Sajeendran :

270. In clause 8(2), for the word “clause”, substitute the word
“ground”.

Shri P. A. Madhavan

271, In clause 8(2), for the words “five hundred rupees™ substitute
the words “six hundred rupees”.

Shri K. Achuthan :

272, In clause 8(2), for the words “five hundred rupees” substitute
the words * six hundred and fifty rupees”.

Shri Ludy Luiz ;

273. In clause 8(2), for the words “five hundred rupees” substitute
the words “seven hundred rupees’.

Shri A. T. George :

274. In clausc 8(2), for the words “five hundred rupees” substitute
the words * eight hundred rupees”.

Shri Roshy Augustine :

275. In clause 8(2), for the words “five hundred rupeces™ substitute
the words “thousand rupees’.

Shri V. 8. Sunil Kumar:

276. 1In clause 8 {2), for the words “five hundred”” the words, “one
thousand” shall be substituted.



24

Shri T. N. Prathapan :

277. In clause 8 (2), for the words “five hundred” the words,
thousand” shall be substituted. ‘

113

one

Shri Anwar Sadath:

278. In clause 8 (2), for the words “five hundred rupees” substitute
the words, “one thousand rupees”.

Shn V. T. Balram:

279. In clause 8 (2), for the words “five hundred” substitute the
words, “one thousand one hundred rupees”.

Shri Shafi Parambil:

280. In clause 8§ {2), for the words “five hundred rupees™ substitute
the words, “one thousand and two hundred rupees”.

Shri P. T. A. Rahim:

281. In clause 8 (2), for the words “five hundred rupees and not
more than five thousand” substitute the words, “five thousand
rupees and not more than ten thousand”.

Shri Thomas Unniyadan:

282. In clause 8§ (2), for the words “five thousand rupees” substitute
the words, “ten thousand rupees”.

Shri V. S. Sunil Kumar :

283. In clause 8(2), for the words “five thousand” the words “twenty
five thousand” shall be substituted.

Shri T. N. Prathapan :
284. The proviso to clause 8(2) shall be deleted.
Shri Kodiyert Balakrishnan :

285. After clause 8(2) add the following sub-clanse and renumber.

accordingly :—.

“(3) The penalty imposed would be recoverable from the
salary of the designated officer or the first appellate authority
as the case may be™.

-~




25

Shri M. Ummer :

286, I[n clause 8(3), the words “and in case of a habitual and
willful defaulter” shall be inserted between the words “under
this Act” and “recommend disciplinary action”.

Shri Benny Behanan :

287. In clause 8(3) insert the words “including for making relevant
entries in the Service Book of erring officials” betwcen the
words discliplinary action” and “against him”.

Shri T. A. Ahammed Kabeer :

288. After clause 8(3) the following sub-section shall be added,
namely ;—

“(4) In the circumstances of thesc penalties imposed on a
designated officer or first appeal authority, an adverse entry
shall be made in the respective service record”.

Shri Ramesh Chennithala :
289. Afier clause 8, add the following clause, namely:—
8A. Compensation for right holders:

“If any damage or loss has been sustained to the livelihood
perspectives of the right holder/applicant subsequent to the
denial/rejection of scrvice with out any substantial valid
reasons, the loss/damages caused to him thereby on account of
such denial/rejection of service, the applicant may be paid such
compensation or relief as may deem fit.”

Shri Palode Ravi:
290." After clause 8 the following clauge shall be added, namely:—

“8A. Payment of compensatory cost to the applicant for
Service

An applicant for service having applied such services shall be
cntitled to seck comipensatory cost in accordance with the
provisions of this Act and rules made thereunder, in case of
delay or default in the detivery of such services beyond the
stipulated time”.

107772012,



26

Shri E. P. Jayarajan :

291.

Afier clause 8 the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—
“BA. Payment of compensatory cost to the citizen:

Citizen having applied for such services shall be entitled to
seek compensation  in accordance with the provisions of this
Act and rules made there under, in case of delay or default in
the delivery of such services beyond the stipulated ‘time”.

Shri M. Ummer :

292,

After clause 8, the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“BA. The provision of this Act shall be deemed to the part of
service conditions of the designated officer 1nclud1ng such
officer of all Public Authorities”.

Shri M. Ummer :

293,

After clause 8, the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“8 A Right of appeal by the Public Servant.—Any Public
Servant aggrieved by the order passed by the Second appellate
authority in accordance with section 8 of the Act shall be
entitled to file an appeal to the Head of Department/
a commission constituted under this Act, against such order
with in a period not exceeding thirty days of the receipt of the
impugned order. The order of the Head of Department/
Commission shall be final and binding”.

Shri M. Ummer :

294.

After clause 8, the following clause shall be inserted namely:—

“BA. Constitution of the Commission.— For the purpose of this
Act, the Government shall constitute a commission to be
called the Kerala Right to Service Commission:

Provided that till such time the commission is not constituted
by the State Government, it may, by notification, nominate an
officer of the State Government not below the rank of a
Secretary to Government, to perform the functions and cxerc1se
the powers of the commission under this Act”.

4



27

Shri T. N. Prathapan :

295,

After Clause 8, add the following clause and renumber
accordingly:

“9. dpplication for revision.—Any officer affected by an orde
of the second appellate authority in respect of imposing penalty
application to the officer, nominated by the State Government
within a period of 30 days from the date of order”.

Shri Mathew T. Thomas :

296. After clausc 8, the following clause shall be added and

renumber accordingly :
“8A. Revision Authoriry:

(1) The Government shall notify an officer not below the rank
of a Secretary to Government, as the revision authority to
consider the revision petitions filed against the order of the
sccond appellate authority.

(2) Any Person aggricved by any order of the Second appellate
authority may made an order to the revision authority with a
period of six months from the date of such order, which shall
be disposed of in the manner as may be prescribed:

Provided that the revision authority may entertain the
application after the expiry of the period mentioned here
above, if satisfied that the applicant had sufficient cause for
not filing the petition in time.

803aimdo udh)a]

Shri K. Muralecdharan :

297

In clause 9, for the words “which is in good for the done”,
substitute the words “done in good faith”.

Shri T. N. Prathapan :

298.

After clausc 9, add the following clause and renumber
accordingly:

“10. Display of Services.— The Services and the stipulated
time limit shall be displayed in every department concerned for
information of the public”.



28
Shri N. Samsudheen :

289. After clause 9 add the following clause and renumber
accordingly:-

“10. Evaluation of performance using advanced technology:—
Performance of designated officers and appellate authorities
shall be evaluated with the help of advanced technology and
best performers in each District of the State shall be awarded
in the manner prescribed”,

Shri Kodiyeri Balakrishnan :

300. After clause 9, the following clause shall be added and the
remaining clauses shall be renumbered:—

“10. Kerala Right 1o Service Commission :—

(1) The Government shall, by notification in the Gazette,
constitute a body to be known as the Kerala Right to Service
Commission 1o have a general superintendence over the
compliance of the directions of the second appellate authority.

(2) The Kerala Right to Service Commission Shall consist of—
{a)} A Chief Service Commissioner
(b) two Service Commissioners

(3) The Chief Service Commissioner shall be a Retired Judge
of the High Court.

(4} The Chief Service Commissioner and the Service
Commissioners shall be appointed by the Government after the
consultation with Leader of Opposition in the Legislative
Assembly.

(5) The Commission shall receive appeal from any person over
the non-comphiance of the direction of the second appellate
authority issued under sub section (9) of section 6.

(6) On receipt of such appeal under sub section (5), the
commission afier requiring the production of documents from
the designated authority and inspecting these documents shall
dispose of the appeal and directions issued to the designated
authority accordingly.



29

(7) The Commission shall have the same powers as are vested
m Civil Court in respect of enforcing the directions issued
while disposing of the appeals™.

Shri A. K. Balan :

301.

After clause 9 add the following clause namely:

“QA. Constitution of The Kerala Right to Service
Commission,—

(1) The Government shall constitute a commission known as
The Kerala Right 1o Service Commission and shall, by
notification in the official Gazette, appoint a person of
eminence in public hife with wide knowledge and experience in
administration and governance or social service as
Commissioner. He shall be appointed in constitution with the
Leadcr of the Opposition and the tenure of his office shall be
three years,

(2) It shall be the duty of the Commission to ensure proper
implementation of this Act and to make suggestions to the
Government for cnsuring better delivery of services. For this
purpose the Commission may

(a} entertain and dispose of application from eligible persons
rejected by the Second Appellate Authority and shall have
power to impose penalty on the Designated Officer, First
AppcHate Authority and Second Appellate Authority, if
found any dereliction on their part;

(b) recommend changes in procedures for delivery of services
which will make the delivery more transparent and easier;
and

(c) issue pencral instructions, not inconsistent with the provision
of this Act for the guidance of designated officers,first
appellate authoritics and the second appellate anthorities.

{3) Thc Commission shall, while inquiring into any matter
uatder this scction, have the same powers as are vested in a
Civil Court while trying a suit under the Code of Civil
Procedure, 1908, in respect of the following matters, vizi—



30

{(a) summoning and enforcing the attendance of persons,
compelling them to give oral or written evidence on oath
and producing documents or things;

(b) requiring the discovery and inspection of documents;
(¢} receiving evidence on affidavits;

(d) requisitioning any public records or copies thereof from any

court or office;

(e) issuing summons for examination of witnesses or

documents; and
(f) any other matter which may be prescribed.

(4) The Commission may frame its regulations for the conduct
of its business and any such matter, as the Commission may

deem fit.”

OO m&hgcg

Shri K. Raju :

302. In clause 10 after the word “Court” the words “below High

Court” shall be inserted.

Smt. E. S. Bijimol:

. 303.

Clause 10 shall be recast as follows <10, All District Courts

"}.
.7

shall have the Power to entertain any suit, application on other 4} ‘

proceeding in respect of any orders issued under this Act, and
Provision for appeal against the order of Civil Court to High
Court or Supreme Court shall be under this Act.” -

alDAlOMAMIs  Okd)a]

Shri V. M. Ummer Master:

304, In clause 11 (1) afier the word “Gazette” the following words

shall be inserted: “with in six months from the date of its
passing”



31

al{meraso moeagg'j
Shn S. Rajendran;

305. Delete the proviso to clause 12 (1)

C&0g MDBTVED HTV;:esAw, all. 8. Mmealwedd,
oiloMmThaloo, OTVk SO1-gn M- 219368,
2012 meee 24



aA@IMoe ed0g mlnamue
sniied moud 113

2012-081 €HAB TLLAVOIM CAVAUMIUSIUD NG

742/2012.



al@fl@)aNoe c:eg aluorue

1299 et mrm(a_k_lé

s

e

20175981 GBHAY AVALOIM CAVAIMINUS0D “enilad

MmNEY MRQacIIee)8S1t8 Ha0ERRMEMUBOS CILOIMEBUS
10dB0Mo  HaIQIAN@IMo @@mIZOW] MIMLASM)e @RI
@R Ho W HDOW B0 FIBUBEH)oGaIENE]

_ ’ QA0 §AIgMMTIMSs
' | . 80)
. ‘ enflai

a0le:. —mlvafle cuswaclwlee)aglel aaloomRmarulesd srvumeamnd
(nJaomo Bralgam@ila) ALK Aalgy;mal m);eammocnﬂ(o%eogaamacoﬂ-

& maméaa 01359@9915;0@ mo;ucumﬂm;(mo:) Moo @aPaow]o 5000
-n‘ﬂu»mm;errao.ﬁo;nn;—

1. mgmgmeﬁmgo LnJocoosmgo—(i) o) a;rga;g’lm 2012-021 (Bc&a(bg VTV aaless
GAVAUMIEIR @G )M Gel@ .al0@do.

(2) @, -navd aleemonimecs, qudescd dlumidilenom cm"komsﬂ m;(mcoﬁ
Lro6TE TGS mro;cmrmoa‘m :
2. oldqumsmd-—po apafiod, qundee agelwooiol @RI yHeSoTm
 nlédo— : '
. {og) “m’}m)g'aa@ pes onauomd”’ apmmo@d @ m«&?gﬁam a1y Qi ul
mmgmmgvc«ummmu& (aIR0Mo SalgN@imoni 3-0o Aldja] lnldd0e ERFEM
m‘lmuacmmomsmg 80) 9erVILNN of)MAMOBOH:IM] ;

(e “andaooo)es apud” agomoad 3-co am)a] (ale000 OflBamoalio
amqaggm«nmmmuﬂm andanmBa Bo) yod ng;cm(ﬁmnmoce,;ang,

oo
(mSI) ‘aamnos m%'lmi‘ anuilea)’ ng;cmom%q J0 mue:ggd LnJoB:OEDD @REBRENT

aNELamIniNo Mg 60) DEBLNIUNM aMABENRIBYM] ;

(oudl) “oudeaod” agemomd  caos aTB0e0E AHMAMOAOHYID) ;

(@) “m3gqpalee aals” apgno@ @D aryxglndaltvicd gaeoselw
aigEngond Mdepalensns® af)maAmanddam] ;

(aprad) “emaimoalsows”’ agmom mkalo avnwadiulenssicd Be)
emuaime 2Elaaymain @dadmwes 6e0e)aa A@RUMe nfMAtN@aa™) |
742/2012.



2

(&) “eruaime” amoct moawe anmiaawleldenmm .gemslane
TROTINAT ARVTUNHED (aLMIOCR0, GROO Tuamae TEe0d aoegs)nlloeiom
2O &HWB (al:00eH agemBlage TESId AGGalo @r)malvlcenn
@O oRamEBIENs TEFUDTVIDWORDEM MUNTAINEAD ms;ggmflkoﬂ G8) eunaIm
Hal0MCAGIAIY MiNJaliMERd @ROLIBIG &) moaswladle mlaswens
DM RMABUEIHE (1IB0M0 HICYTMRBGOW, 3-30 AU oflB 100 afllmemoaimo
£2IPWOHSINAD, BBl CTVUM af)INAEMOAIMH)IN] ;

(aga)) “osmeoo @Rafked @Ru®mOE! agmomd 3-0o Udbla] (Ak000 EDBEM
aflRemonlo HalPels 6O} EAVOINM afiTNAMOI0M)M) ;

(9ag) “mlualle maeaul’ apanost Mloem peajowmunnd ervaimo
(alB0Mo DG M BICMI GROLBHITE TROMBe CIAUMTDIMBI QO] GRCAlHM
@180 M@IEMS 3-00 Gldb)allatddto Ao nimo 0219 6§ atBIUW]
MODWAIBIWT af)NAN20E:)AN).

3. emooimsmdd, miuplo mua@audlw), Mlo)eo peaydnqunm A MEIDD
all=emaaio oaigimailmas @uwiasoe.—(1) moLawe (aloenielyomle)es
zepe®mlene mosowlad agialwomicd ajams eadoaewoslas, mo
@R Gleag (aloRoge @EHTE @HG)ROTVETIME:0, QIees udenod Udsjajlo, BICOI
Oidhla] cawdall@lo, BOGEO MEFWAVIWORDEM MLOOAIMALD, §3600 Mmacuwlaicim
wleomaij, @Al BIEEdIMe M@H)THHOW erLAIMEBRW, Mwem peajsmTund,
e&mo @reflod Gruleod], inzoe @naflod erwleod, dkafo measlu] agaia,
) @RHIOR @YK LERU3HD] nmuglal alLamonife BalEgenRmE,

4. eavolmeany eiglon M@ MBS ERQUHI0.— 3-00 Mdja] Laldhdoo
afl@emoalmo ealgees srvaimamad dielo cawwudluwlengsled adenmalal
60600 @Rdanmass ERUlone ERQG:IWe parEoWIFleaNTNmOLNS,

5. dloje® pesionmoem ajamen—(1) @mi.omoes aooglcl wlane
srumATiMenEElonss Gocaey cifiajord, (Tolem HGELIVIVNM, MmONAe
lalosniel omflenss agooslene cloosocilon ayamosuded eove amommailwe,
@y GrualMo (aE0Mo Haly)»ewo aragialed oo cvewuelwlen)aaled
©R) @RGAes WHlamilen)s:ews aalcgerrea, Mlamikearm quenainies, Eregaso
AREIMBE S:006MERUE CosLIDE BN allaigleansnzamle @0l OSBMHIN  @BG I
HS6m medlulcensmea)eoe.

(2) (1)-20 Ral0idinllnidI0o IEIY| A0] IRGaey TlRem DE310M
ULEM) AMOLBI ERIMOe MGalM TUfle:Elenomd @eFate @RUSlE:00R.ISIATIW
EALOUNTUNGNI WO BRGNS,

(3) @rcaiey adly olool o nlulo Peowuciw] Eroeslen)



3

6. @ajlod—(1) Mo maeudlwlssggiol maunieow ervmmo
2idlsnoomEm MROLIEIEE 5-00 Aldafload (1)-00 Palid)a] (A& AREAls
lonlennalgemo AR ARamo0udsenls amie @Rl @RWIaeHdd] @mymusas:,
@Ratad mlomily oo aregEled dale cvawadi] eraimuoTila) @)ajdl
Aamosimagial, widspoilesngjsoam epaEmonwas ololalas, GREBOMDIAN
anld asjediwie 8o) @aflod quadqflesca)mmamoss:

afyomocd, mnwoin)asiol eI woe@ eagomlomalal gl
andlos aTileon: eapemaamrocila)menm’ ammoe @eafled @bufle:odlos emusw)
oysjewonmelod an arwleoaled, mald Gluave @RAITLIM o EIM)EU a0
@nqflad auiedesoamoosns.

(2) 8amo0 @Ry10d ARWlHdTled TILE® QEBYINMUNCMIS B0}
- okaio @&oaugalmsglal eruame madaann midegulea)»ema mog‘;mnmﬂ
anaflad Olomen)®eWo HalgoaRMMOoaT.

(3) (1)-00 @nIVWDI)alHOODBE BO)] @Rallod miwle oo
anluled mjanmw ac) sociosalmesicd mldajocessmemos.

(4) amoe arelod @rwisselmies ®le)a0mo®I@ quesa)88
‘agemonoudsen)e, ammoo drqflel anwlesdlu)es ole)pamomilen ool ool
@eojae dlacvemimasicd mldspulsnnqg soum araRema)sg oloilaleio
BOEBHMWAR o010l as)eMae B6MEle @Refled @rule:0dl mmiced o) arallol
ruada flkeaoa)mpmaans:

af)nomd, B oUm)asiod mg!mﬂ a.o@coﬂ S 24N ey @Il amaflod
andled acilmom &onemajmeowiaymmaaT oamza0 ca'rarHﬂm'a arRWl:0ale6 Ganiaw
Ba|s)H@onmElad @y arwleonles arojaxs’ dlaiaue mmrmom‘lgm’!m;cstmcmm;o
@Rg a3 mﬂ&o’lmom;cmmosrﬁ '

(5} oaeoo arpl@ apwlaodled mlo)em @esiowounemos am;
mkalo esewgalmagled cruame mmaiuom midequloo)mews eI
maouded mafled mloailenmews OakgouMmIsT.

(6) Mudl® e dlwle;asiol sruvama meémomomﬂm;cmmﬂm
2@ @Iw @ooemdloga’ oaese @oa 1wl @R @0a) 661 T} £ WIDED BT,
gregenamial, an erbaime aisiecencnd dldeguilenaNamoesogje 8-0o Q.lcﬂ:;:ﬂlmﬂ
QL AKNN 2 ldEIEleNIM(nIebe WldH A lBSMIOTIHMBOET.

(7) (4)-00 aruaya] (200288 @y @qlol dhaflor cohwaldiuiles

menacn any acamaalmaslcd oldajoeosmnemaen,

8 wo m&iéﬂ?ﬁ?“@ (2)-00 ‘Ratid)a] (nl®000 8MOo @RIGE

anuwleoo]l madeim mldegde MM PERLOWILNM E@RM) IV E)ENI T altats,
@namae aemyrudlensoidleseltd qumsaEs @pWes oMo @rled @RUleoTes



4

GNElS 60) EREAISY K0VG HUGPIAUMB @D HO) MG D aRag
lal®000 @0} 0MEde @afled midaocsnme;m @rem olololcd ©ldqjocsnsne
o) @oen,

(9) v adaflead (5)-go @mmaggﬁ“ (nl000 GOVUME  RIBYBILAIM)S
0ldcamo Tlem PEBOOILLM ERMTVEHEITHaldt, @REDO @RIYIELHOT]
Olesailad qumsnes apulss omeoe @paflel Eruldonled emals B0) ARCAlGH
aNW@ PalPoM@)e @ERHNWINN B0) ERGAIGH @D R (alsH000 &0}
@Ed0 @Raflod @1BqjocHemzan @rem e1TIGIod @dqjossasrEm)moeny..

7. anoflellad eosesnIeaamm msaslsoo— @™ @YSE (215000 R0)
@nafleilad @lmaomeasismemiod amoo @rafled @ewle:odlenle ©eMEdo @nn ol
BRWILOEHNj0 BN o0WAN HO0LEEEE TuotniTuily], 1908-081 milaN@d msas
aflwaiicad)® (1908-0R1 5-00 Gl @YSG) (alHOB0 §O] AUYUADBe flaloosTn
aagiemiod ae; mloled esssolwled Memladmaow (nls:oonss aRe®m
@Udaonmaud peeoidlesmamon, aRmOGH:—

(o) (o1@oemEEsud a00ROOBNMEIMe aItlewowloamailmio BRHOUD,
s)gdsma :

(snil} @pqflad anslewwm)e dmlweom DEBRVRMIOCODW]e  Gdbudanymaslal
rogaia arnodenst ; @)soem

- () Wdepaienaqsoanm acgemeslege @o0yBuB.

8. ‘wlem— (1) oaedo arg|1o3 @RU®:OE],—

(o) dlojem peagonaunn, aclwowme @eclrvasanaow S00EMERIHD
GIVAMe MTH)MTIol aldal oot omIw] serowlwood, asMme @naflad

@WlH0oEked oA RIMEBn S0) pemoayay], ®oeamaBul ofludla)eoad,

DRSO PCAIONTIOMICET ERETINOD}AIDIRE &I0WITHORe BRGIWIes 0)alwsln
SHAUQOOMEBIY 8D afl® 2NPEDHOARINDmOoEN].

(nft) Mloyem gesonmunmd eI EIRIBOIOHMTIT ®:OLIMOBAVo
U)WV @I OO WG, OMo0 @q1ed @wl;otles soanjaInEs
820} gomeayaldl, &oeemeEnud alludlafjescas, dloe® SesyIwaunm)can)
@oamo AIMETIR 62602 dlamosine 60 daumonild @omgl amadalo ojalo
mloadlod , ardlom mmes o argowloe MKl SalwITme)Eow 80) ofl®
2HBOHIONMMOETT:

AYINIT, CROMBe A0} Wb anamEMTIMMI Bwle® pe3LnIuNS
AlO@AOMISRGT AOW)NINMB B0 ERQITUE MOBEHERMIEN,

(2) amlwowemd WAGITLANGRD MR @onemalgoam &-do Uy lland
(3)-20 @mm@:nﬁmﬂ aloemmil@ledyan  mluada MW ale) wles) aalal @naflelod
@ INDIMeAS)HNMOIG sane Braflod aewlecd]l alda wo)owleoa’ o
@168 AWl ®Honl &6 6E oMM aléto, AREYa0OWM, GoIDDLMES B0)

Q



5

PO ooy ¥, a:omﬂna;ﬁuﬁ allai@la) eeoand, amMoe @vqlod @R wdo @len) enmk
@ROTINS D} lOKIS BOWHDENO m@omﬂmo {o;rumnroﬁ caacu’mommm;mom) ae) wWem
ﬂgmmomg«nmoan :

ng) MO @3, mmmo smg uﬂuam m;mm;«nmﬂmgm;m amMo0 @ ) 103
@nuslesod]as mocm;momggg(m m@;manﬁ @) ERAKTVG.  NEBEHEROLTT.

(3) Maem ©eEALMIINEMI, @ahle @Rafldl anwWlasdlews Ao laro
H00MALPOM, MY TQEYF (aldvo EEAROBTAND  a@Sinlaf@e0s)Om 2 lBoRKeud .
Brynolen) Mmoot aldal ao)emlomow) vieoo G|l ERWIeOTkes GMIALY
ool agyExiod, arwiinsnwilen, _ARQOUBEE SNSRI cm(ﬁcy’km 245603UD  (nld0m0
m.gsm MSaISled mgmorﬂcro £ 2 KgIOOROMTOETT.

9. pEMACHRRIUEIGE «fSITm MSAISIHWBHEE TIoRSIo— DD . BRBEQ0
mRwildalslol paEIaIfEs EEMSSIeN0 alSo (aldieGas ROME . allunruaicd
padmemo hal@)aoid pequlaemo R ogOmEslale @00)o Mosnimula]
AGOTBIEN DEBLINIULEMO da;'s‘maﬂeago Aglemo af)oinow] Coem0) "hiémmomcamb
A0V ] nEmD magdm;lma Q) MBMSaISIHESH0 m'imm'imﬁm;m‘)@gd B

10. milaflod ca»osmﬂaag;es muwilaadimaled alleised—eam (m@«ﬂ:g {nidhdido
anoagsialla) agommlee poEmQAl muosniawla} afiem®lele QILMInNIeCo,
EPCAIOMEVO Q) MSaSlews Woamon) Mol emosTilw;e alolnemmdasns)
#6000 2SS0 oMM e ERAM @ TO] )88 WINMIQ] O Ao, @D b
(nJ00mBE @dnflal A¥l ERLPROED Galdjo OaIIAUM OSIGOAME)A0ETT.

11, aigemud geeooeomms @wl o do.—(1) qvdesocldl, mcmg”
all@amoalmol¥l, D csrga:gﬂmen QY UTUNEUS ms:&{lelomgmm’lmamﬂ ;ugsarsuﬁs
.gmamomgmxmom’i S -

{2) gom ma‘;’g}' Ln000 PEMEIBO}IN .-.g;a)«nd@ algalje, m@;momm
@MY BUHo, a¥laymmmaenine, Mloame mamgmmmﬂemmﬂm’lmgcmouﬁ s
2IUOOS B} TUEEBMHTTIELn fa'lamgdaaﬂmﬁ «n;sd\gcmoom @eTTE) rme:zmgmsmagmem_
mmom;rm aHd oxHImosi FlaL0aIcOm s mcmcxuaeena@;o, mwaomo anos
a@@ rUemBmETI UITDEe)TEM @R TUGIREMERD HMIFSIEMUGIAN TLCIDS
mess @eaIruomlen malmaymi,. aAMaTe (amiom a_lgmm’lma ng;ammnm;o .
0}alC8R0 AIG)ITNHGRO GRELIEIE algo, gsngocasasngmﬂa%m @'loyaoailon)&ewo,
am@gmm.ﬁmm @ algamlad mrarm’lmgeumﬂdo AROW®) MoBTIENINAI, @R aI-hI00
m;ma@aaﬂsgmkm ca;n_lrarmmﬁ @o(mo LnJOGTlIEIAmgGﬂgDQ)ﬂ(D']oBG);&:G@O mog‘;m&ﬂmﬂ
(mosnmomg Lmomnegm;m?g‘;o@’}m’lmga,cmjo amg;«nmgmocﬂagmg, ng)m'ﬂm;cmoei;o, ‘
AR(AlE0 0D BH ag;a@ae;les;o mgmé&GQHSAMGEJO oqomcem @y al§laldhd0o mgcm
mu&:mg;gg afier oo «uommﬂ@;ms croaw;m@uas: Bolo QDO nﬂwfmﬂms
mgmﬂm’lmmcmosrﬁ



6

12. soaumunimnud mleso aalganoines anwleone—(1) ©o anSglen
A UMNGUE MSeosm M@ e Bleljo SOUMALEBUE DRI G MalsHa,
mudasodin, mcn)g,ﬂmﬂ LalSlaL6e|S)OTHY SO DARDEl0, EROMOC 66 0aMD I D
mlaee Oaigmald), epauwieam] manwes MMM, LD GR&FIEMmo
eRedaIod paeowlgas aamulcssd allojaLegPOMERNTOW, afM) GBS,
TuEdRe EHAKDLHSIITMIEAINN0, BalGOONTNMO6T:

Ao, D AMSGNG oo GIVG) B)CE BME) UAMETTIm)cwao
@EREBHMWINE VWOHMIV) PAMANe DD Mh]afloiat¥lad alj0eq)siallee) aiomd
N1 T T=Th

(2) (1)-20 Rallidh)afilaidd00 al)0én]s)afla] @oeo gmr&immgo, mmngs
aljoans)0il jo MGt HYW)MMEUNe WIOEIVE HAUIOS: m@'emmmss‘gﬁ.

DEFUIHI0MEMBNS aillaioemo

andmElollmenien moauoleane TIz)aclie0)mw toneem qurudlo
ofl&umenilal qusieeame @ROyMOGaIeslmzoaT. mdeeemoTlan oM’ Lawon
PRISHEBEM LOMOTIOT MMIGIMD]e PEMOMUAGEMHAe DOMGO madaeno.
alDOMACLe FTLAUMBIIGHB)e CIALYBRMINLe H)SIOT O30S OGN0
WD S)@M A@INIoCAIMNET OMI0 BHOE EOAMN ald]add: oem @ealglaes
wyalodowies anslaunomooiiad @ailmae @OM cans qudensd, alDAOMUG:ID
al@ild: Msaflad aeoeEAMMIIBamie SH|SIHm BRSMBITIGE TUIMOOLD HO)OIDIGm)
malm)ealsTE] 2005-001 A& AR F, (2005-01 22-00 GLM Wyh())
lnlgenuelyOiel)o ertd.

2. aID0@ON)OS MUESERWEH anBlaIBAe MAEINWIDABID aBla020
ooilal ayaimn aigonaiine Mkl n\xm@um‘lwhss)ggg“laﬁ DI RMEBUBH
GIUOIM  MBSHDGIM)0, Mudeeod Slumencen @pmd aflda lamomonmm eonyemmsiod ‘
2emoaRdlagoasmolmeecasrd], cudseod oo mj01Eln altlaosiomes
20020, §aMRMEIBHS Tderdd RIVMHNIND WRAIDINS WMEBEZOSBN
ajp@elsan)e @SamBanle (aimIEmIMIOT0) 0 IIVBENOED T & UBH0)0
ARMTU®20] RMEBeES OMEe alocwenEl wa)m alwonlal, 80} Muealiwome
@@} Fl Qa0 e om s alwomla, eo; Mlwze PaeIen) AWM ®Io)noma);
S0, MUMDOT] MIMDLOYSBH TRUSHWEBORD0 HlWAMIIA ) D ®HHBW)o
@rdanmMSHOTW)e @)0la] @RUND cmommocmomom;mm’lmgo ssm; Wz 61d06E)
QIES0d CHhos Tudenod (aIOTIESm 0srUALADETS.

3. m1dglals mlwamdmomo asl mm® rod 3l anl ee g) B, som
modstadlengdud, moy@om mdgladlengyeud, eonum @odan)endd, aorvruLel
audgladlengeud, noem mudgladlsegieul, alsimwone &sauiennan aecuny) @il
SEMBUD, Q05D HEMAMMD, nldNEaNds Sudlaticansicd Glegods, omoviat
DI a0} 0403 o?cxgio(ag onsaslea 6a0aNes oaomeTvaimsmel, alddimis



7

ol o omdae19iod all@amoattio aagim@ Qo) e)om Aol qudaenad
26aWlE0)aN). HGOI BAVAMAe M@, 8oy mawiidlul ol s,
an@oem. peajsnmund @Pes edomayaEnud anailesiadioge All2emoalmo
QO SISIBS EROMOe CAIVAUINERYS MRRBOHNV)BH TLIVATING MaEdmirnTiayo
nIE0RWeN 008 @B alewSTEnoMm MISWTUOAIGIMDmOET. BnE)®aianrglenan
@egfielmie @™ eiled cuyaimun PaKGIIM}. HaRMRMEIWBHS GTLAIMO RIBLROSS)
anafinel @oakmoeme aldlawawiken)mmiaiks aiddlais dloe widencseme aleandls)m),

4. cawdqjoemm maMymEEEd MlocagMm@lal 96G W) a))O&:0 MR BR MO
@ eniiod. - -

WM YHDEIDINIENE0 -

@™ mcd M) BOi0 (ROMUILTHIE HmIMe)UCladlo Oaldmoas
auomunom ausnilmmiwloied mlane @iemon) mMWwie: Haleinio DRI INME.

aB@a{laf)0@05)0m Mloamdanoemousleos MucsnItula
ORCEMO0%6TRe ;

aRerg (aldmiay@olad apam ool navg all@emoaime g, mlvmie
am)00l mudsnodlam epwlalongsjomiaend snilgflear 1-0o alEmawe 2-00 Pal
SN0 O1:08N3]BFUTen) D).

2. 'nm%o qudaeod alslallemmle, ale)a] cawdnllswie MEZWMLIWe
@esm qunoumamlammie Mloaswlacle melwomlondlo, oY @Gl
anydiun )\ omlcaoncd], @rad Moeaersyan sV, alo)em HEARLONOTUNBOE,
ammoo @Raflod aRUeIE), 0eEce @Rgflod @RUe0d, Mumim ma.Glel agaTiol
dNLamonumo HagM@Inf aewlaoeeys)emymald amicieal 3-0o e
. Bd0mE pequilea)amn).

3. amoo @refiad aruilaodlaes maiaoes aflel aowad a_ucgn(m'

olmas olol midgpales;mainie eyimss aoled mlumolee)mailm)e
Mdeeddlom @wleonagsiomaoad milgflen 6-go eteiowe (1)-0o @aiasmiouve
HH0ME  pagUlan M,

4. osm=o0 @nefled Anuleodkenes B)MBaidod: @oaflod A0QE@R ealgyaM
@lanyss oMol m1casmmﬂmgm;mﬂm;o SpRTImes «anlmnd mivoleeymaimoe
aodenodlem @puwleoongs;emyauond ilgflea 6-0o almiave (4)—60 Dal6 M 0o
O@SE _aRuElH)aIN).



8

5. 1s0s-0a1 avlaldld msalsl mloamoadimaiad {1908-0a1 $-00 Gd(Mm
arpdg) &Wod anaylod mwlerdades alalct eamosallalod mles.doeow
@pWloeaEsud afm Gabeel dldgadlenanm edlaym agieonysmu aldepaien;
maal audanselam Grwl o neas)amiaond enfleflsal 7-00 alemiowo (mul)
DAL OSHIE OEFUTlen ).

6. o apagloal ayoimunsd msaflensemmimon algamu peneo

seyn@Nal audsnodlem auwl;onee|syomyaon ilgflloal 1-00 aueNiowe O@06eE
96guTlanIm;.

7. andadlen ayauneed msgflaneoirmsilod agsomelane mmm5mua‘

PEMROS: MMt dite @YODT Mo S21QNEM pom ool m;oags;oﬂaogcmm’lm

qudeeddlam Eruila:omasiomonm aiiglas 2-050 euIMMDe O;H0mE peguikenI. -

8. . ngm) @®O0LEEOS MosTWIajoeem) slgamul D S99 0K Mo
ARORIEIDE AllEamIAIMAICE? POMODARMEBS all0an]siolleacanandd apal msals)

(2603 MuosHrWlajakllo TUOWOREMGERD BOMAINGDS @RPW TVISOIUCTTNIS)E:SID -

UWo BRYHIIN]. BRG], UFEBUD, RO DETEIHHQIM|CAHO0, DUMON)US

al08gs)allajewwanae, wloamueoes quesiaadlenswndsas) allewoanzoms.

@y ®Imoc, afciafla)) esosiam Mlowamldemremiwlsote 8O) TUOWO DD
* TOKBOCHEDITOS |, SlmETT,

DOAM  aldenE]

{(dlomd=sn)



